- FAM1)\GARRET\GARRET_004.XML

AMENDMENT IN THE NATURE OF A SUBSTITUTE
f To HR.1 |
OFFERED BY MR. GARRETT OF NEW JERSEY
- Strike all. after the enécting clause and insert the
- following: - '

SECTION 1. SHORT TTTLE.

(a) SHORT TIiTLE.—This 'A.ct may be cited as the

1
2
3 “Economic.Recovery and Middle-Class Ta;i Relief Act of
4 2009”.

5

¢ (b) TABLE OF CONTENTS.—
' Sec. 1. Short title. |
- TITLE I—INCENTIVES FOR ECONOMIC GROWTH
Subtitle A—Inecome Tax Reductions

Sec. 101. 2003 tax reductions made permanent.

See. 102. 5 percent reduction in individual income tax rates.
Sec. 103. Repeal of alternative minimum tax on individuals.
Sec. 104. Reduction in corporate marginal income tax rates.

Subtitle B—Reduction.of Income Taxes on Capital Assets

See. 111. Indexing of certain assets for purposes of determining gain or loss.
Sec. 112. Reduced capital gains rate for corporations.

Subtitle C—Other Provisions Related to Businesses

Sec. 121. Repeal of certain limitations on the expensing of section 179 prop-
erty. . N

Sec. 122. Research credit made permanent.

Sec. 123. T-year carryback of net operating losses.

_ Subtitle D—Other Provisions Relating to Individuals

Sec. 131. Child tax cfedit increased and made permanent.

See. 132. Distributions not required from individual retirement plans at age
70A. ' _

Sec. '133. No IRA distribution during 2009 included in gross income.

£\WHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi (42153111)
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

/5



F:\MH\GARRET\GARRET_OM.XML :

TITLE H—ACROSS—THE—BOARD RESCISSIONS IN NON-DEFENSE
DISCRETIONARY SPENDING FOR FISCAL YEAR 2009

See. 201. Across-the-board 'reéeissions in non-defense diseretionarfr spending’ for
fiseal year 2009. :

TITLE III—INCREASED INCENTIVES FOR EDUCATION

See. 301, T_ncreased deduction for qualified higher education expenses.
Sec. 302. Increased deduttion for interest on student loans.

‘TITLE I—INCENTIVES FOR
- ECONOMIC GROWTH
Subtitle A—Income Tax Reductions

[y

SEC. 101. 2003 TAX REDUCTIONS MADE PERMANENT.

Section 303 of the Jobs and Growth Tax Relief Rec-
onciliation Act of 2003 is hereby repealed. ‘
SEC. 102. 5 PERCENT REDUCTION IN INDIVIDUAL INCOME

TAX RATES.

(a) In- GENERAL.—Section 1 of the Internal Revenﬁe

Code of 1986 (relating to tax imposed on individuals) is

[a—y f—t
- O

amended by adding at the end the following new sub-

—
[\

section:

“(3) RATE REDUCTIONS AFTER 2007.—

=
W

“(1) In GENERAL.—In the case of taxable years -

beginning in a calendar year after 2007, the reduced

_
AN W

percehtage specified in the fo]low'mg table shall be

"
~J

_substituted for the otherwise applicable tax rate in

-t
o0

theAt_ables under subsections (a), (b), (e), (d), and
(e). o

“Otherwise applicable tax rate Reduced percent-
age ’
10 e en e e e anenas 9.5

—
\O

FAVHLC\O1 2609\61 2609.004.xmi {42153111)
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)




F\MIN\GARRET\GARRET 004.XML

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9

10

11.

12
13
14

15

16
17
18
19
20
21
22

“2) ADJUSTMENT OF TABLES.——The Seefeta,ry
shall .adjust the tables preseﬁbed.under’ subsection
(f) to carry out this subsection.”. -

" (b) EFFECTIVE DATE,——The aménhe_nt-' made by
this subsection shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2007. ‘ - -

(¢) REPEAL OF EGTRRA SUNSET OF RATE REDU.C-
TIOﬁS.—Title IX of the Economic Grqwth and Tax Relief
Reeoh__éﬂiation Act of 2001 shall not apply to the amend-
ments made by s'.ection' 101 of such Act. |
SEC. 103. REPEAL OF ALTERNATIVE MINIMUM TAX ON INDI-

viovaLs. |

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 55(&) of fhe Internal Rev-
enue Code of 1986 (relating to alternative minimum tax
imposed) is amended by adding at the end the following
new flush seﬁtence: |
“For pui'poses of this title, the tentative rmmmum tax on
any 'taxpayer other thaﬁ a corporation for any faxable year
beginning é,fter December 31, 2008, shall be zero.”.

o (b) ,EFF‘ECTIVE DATE.——THe ‘amendment’ made by
this section shall apply to .taxable.'ye’ars beginning after
December 31, 2008. | |

£\VHLC\012606\012609.004.xmi (42153111)
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.) ‘



" FAMI11\GARRET\GARRET_004.XML ,
- 4
SEC. 104. REDUCTION IN CORPORATE MARGINAL INCOME

k.

- TAX RATES.
(a) GENERAL RULE.—-Paragraph'.(l) of section 11 (_b)
of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended— -
_ '(1)A by insefting ;‘apd’-’ at the end of subpara-
~graph (4), | o
(2) by gtﬁhﬁng “but_does not exceed $75,000,”
in s_ubparaér&ph (B) and inserting a period, |

O 0 NN N b oW N

- (3) by striking subparagraphs (C) and (D), and

[Ua—y
o

(4) by striking the last 2 sentences.

(b) PERSONAL SERVICE CORPORATIONS.—Para-

ok ek
N =

“graph (2) of section 11(b) of such Code is amended by

[a—
(98]

striking “35 percent”’ and inserting “25 pAe'rcent”'. _

(e) CONFoRmNG AMENDMENTS.—Paragraphs (1)

—
W

and (2) of section 1445(e) of such Code are each amended -

by striking “85 percent” and inserting “25 percent”.

f—
(@)}

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

—
[ <IN |

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2008, except that the amendments made

D =
[« INo]

by subsection (c) shall 'take effect on the date of the enact-

[\
[u—

ment of this Act.

FAWVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi {42153111)
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.) .




FAM1I\GARRET\GARRET_004.XML
5

1 Subtitle B—Reduction of Income
2 Taxes on Capital Assets-
3 SEC. 111. INDEXING OF CERTAIN ASSETS FOR PURPOSES
4 OF 'DETERNnNﬁ\__IG GAIN OR LOSS. |
5 V,(a) In GENERAL.—Part II of subchaptér O of chap-
6 ter 1 (relating to .basis rules of geneifal application) is
7 .amended by redesignating section 1023 as section 1024
8 and by inserting after section 1022 the following new sec-
9 tion:
10 “sEC. 1023. INDEXING OF CERTAIN ASSETS _FoR PURPOSES
11 " OF DETERMINING GAIN OR LOSS. a
12 “(a) GENERAL RULE—
13 “(1) INDEXED BASIS SUBSTITUTED FOR AD-
14 JUSTED BASIS.—Solely for purposes of defermjning
15 gain or loss on the sale or other dispo.sition by a tax-
16 payer (other than a corporation) of an indexed asset
17 which has been héld for more than 3 years, the in-
18 . dexed basis of the asset shall be substituted for its
19 - adjusted basis. |
20 “(2) EXCEPTION FOR DEPRECIATION, ETC.—
21 The.» deductions for depreciation, depletion, énd am-
22 ortiéatioii shall be determined without regard to the
23 - application of paragraph (1) to the taxpayer or any
24 other person.
fA\VHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi ) (42153111)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)



© FA\MI1\GARRET\GARRET _004.XML .

6
1 “(3) WRITTEN DOCUMENTATION REQUIRE-
2 MENT.—Paragraph (1) shall apply only W1th respect -'
3 o to indexed assefs for Which the taxpaiyer haé Wriften'
4 docximeﬁtation of the original purchase price paid or
5 " incurred by the taxpayer to acquire such asset. |
6 “(b) INDEXED ASSET.— |
7 “(1) IN GENERAL—For puiposes of this sec-
8 tion, the term ‘indexed asset’ means— |
9 “(A) commo_ri stock n a C_ cofporatiOn
10 (other than a foreign corporation), or
11 “(B) tangible property, .
12 ‘which is a capital asset br property used in the trade
13 or business (as defined in section 1231(b)).
A14 “(2) STOCK. IN CERTAIN FOREIGN CORPORA-
15 TIONS _INCLUDED.f—For purposes of this section—
16 “(A) IN GENERAL—The term ‘indexed
17 asset’ includes common stock in a foreign cor-
18 '_. poration Whi_ch is regularly traded on an estab-
19 lished securities market. _ -
20 | “(B) EXCEPTIO&.—Subparagraph (A)
21 shall not apply to— | | B
| 22 | “(i) stock of a fore_ign investment
23 | company, | | |
fAVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi (421531i1)

© January 26, 2009 (9:35 am.)




~

F:\M11\GARRET\GARRET_004.XML

7
1 - “(il) stock in a passive foreign invest—_:'
V2_ : meﬁt company .(as déﬁned in seection
ER " 1296), |
4 | ‘g(iji) stock in a foreign eorpora-tion.
5 held by a United States person who meets
6 the requir'ements of section 1248(a)(2),
7 and o
8 “(iv) stock ina foreign personal hold-
9. ng comr)any.
10 “(C) TREATMENT OF AMERICAN DEP0$I-
11 TORY RECEIPTS.—An Americénl depository - re-
12 ceipt for common sf_oek in a foreigﬁ corporation
13 shall be treated as common -stoek‘ in such cor- -
14 | poration.
15 “(c) INDEXED BASIS.—-For purposeé of this sec- |
16 tion— |
17 “(1) GENERAL RULE—The indexéd basis for
18 any asset is— o
19 «(A) the adjusted basis of the asset, in-
20 - creased by \ _ ’
21 “(B) the applicable inflation adjustment.
22 “(2) APPLICAﬁLE INFLATION A_DJT_TSTMENT.—
23 The app]icable inflation adjustment for any asset is
24 an amount equal to—
FWVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi (42153111)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)



FAMI1I\GARRET\GARRET_004.XML

8 _

i “(A) the adjusted basis of the asset, multi-
2 pliedby |

3 A “(B) the percentage (if any) by which—

4 | “_(1) the gross - domestlc product.
5 deﬂator for the last calendar quarter end-
6 " ing before the asset is disposed of, exceeds
7 “(i1) "t_ne gross dornestic_ product
8 deflator for the last calendar quarter end-
9 g before the asset was acqnjred by tne
10 taxpayer. |

11 The percentage under subparagraph (B) shall be
12 rounded to the nearest Yo of 1 percentage pomt

13 “(3) GROSS DOMESTIC PRODUCT DEFLATOR. —
14 The gross domeetic product deflator for any cal-
15 endar quarter is the implicit .price deflator for the
16 gross domestic product for such quarter (as shown
17 .in the last revision thereof released by the Secretary
18 of Commerce before the close of the following cal-
19 | endar quarter).
20 _“(d) ,SUSPENeION OF HorLpmNg PERIcD ‘WHERE D1-
21 MLNISHED Risg OF LoOSs; TREATMENT OF SHO_RT-
22 SALES—
23 “(1) IN GENERAL.—If the taxpayer (or a re-
24 lated person) enters inte any transaction which sub-
25 ‘stantially reduces the risk of loss from holding - any

t\VHLdO1260$O1 2609.004.xml (42153111)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)




F:\M1 1\GARRET\GARRET__OO4XML

9
1 | asset, such asset shall not be tréated as an indexed‘
2 - _A asset for the period of such reduced r1sk
3 (2) SHORT SALES.—

K~4 ,. | ‘f(A) In GENERAIJ.%Iﬁ the case of a short
5 sale of an indexed asset with a short sale period
6 in eﬁcess of 3 years, for'pm'pdses of this title, .
7 the amdunt realized shall be an amount eqﬁal
8  1:0 the amount realized (determined Withouf re-
9 ' gard to this paragraph) incfeésed :by the appli-

10 “cable inflation adjustment.' In applying sub-

11 | sectio_n (c)(2)‘for'purposes of the preceding sen-

12 tence, the date on which the property is sold

13 short shall be treated as the date of acquisition

14 and the clo'éing date for thé sale shall be treat-

15 ed as the date of dispositidn.

16 “(B) SHORT SATE PERIOD.—For purposes -

17 of subparagraph (A), thé short sale period be-

18 gins .on the day that the property is sold and

19 | ends on the closing date for the sale.
26 “(e) TR&&ATI\!EENT OF REGULATED INVESTMENT

21 COMPANIES AND REAL ESTATE INVESTMENT TRUSTS.—

22
23

24

25

" f:AVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi

January 26, 2009 (9:35 am.) -

“1) ADJUSTMENTS AT ENTITY LEVEL.—
“(A) IN GENERAL.—Except as otherwise

provided in this paragraph, the adjustment

~ under subsecﬁ_on_ (a) shall be allowed to any

(42153111)



 FAMI1\GARRET\GARRET_004 XML

[E—Y

© o N o U A W N

NN N N N — ke "
M R O N - & © o Q & oo 2 B =2 5

£\VHLG\012609\012609.004.xmmi (42153111)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

gard to this section, and

10

uné]jﬁed-'.iBVéstmént ‘entity (including for. pui'-
~ poses of.deterininjng- the eamings- and proﬁts of
" such entity). |

‘ “(B) EXCEPTION FOR CORPORATE SHARE

~ HOLDERS.—Under regulations— .

“@1) in thé (;ase‘of a distribution by a

qualified investment entity (directly or in-

_ direcﬂy) to a corporation—

~ “(I) the determination of whether

such distribution is a dividend shall be )

‘made without regard to -this seétibn-,

“and

“(II) the amoun-t, treated as gain
By reason of the receipt of émy capital
gain dividend shall be inereased by the
percentage by which the entity’s net
capital gain for the té.ﬁable year (de-
termined without regard to this sec-
tion) exceeds the entity’.s net capital
gain for such year detérmined With re-

“(i1) there shall be other appropriate

adjustments (iﬁcluding deemed distribu-
:-- tions) 80 as to ensure that the benefits of

this section are not aﬂowed (directly or in;




FAM11\GARRET\GARRET 004.XML -

O 0 N N U A W

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
s

£A\VHLC\012609\012609.004.xml
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

1 A
- directly) to corporate shareholders of quali-

fied investment entities.

 For purposes of the preceding sentencé, any

amount includible in gross.income under section -

- ‘852(b)(3)(D.) shall Abe‘treated. as a capital gain
~ dividend and an S corporation ‘shall not be:' “

treated as a corporation.

“(C) EXCEPTION FOR QUALIFICATION

. PURPOSES.—This section_A shall. not apply for

~ purposes of sections 851(b) and 856(c).

- “(D) EXCEPTION FOR CERTAIN TAXE_S ]M
POSED AT ENTITY LEVEL.—

“(i) TAX ON FAILURE TO DISTRIBUTE
ENTIB;E GAIN.—If any amount is subject to
tax under section 852(b)(3)(A) -for any
taxable year, the amount on which tax is
imposed under such section shall be in-
creased by the percentage determined _

under subparagraph (B)()(IT). A similar
rule shall apply in the case of any amount
subject to tax under paragraph (2) or (3)
of seétion_ 857(b) to the éxtent attributable
to the excess of -the net capital gain over
the deduction for dividends paid deter-

mined with reference to- cépital gain divi-

(42153111) -



FAMI11\GARRET\GARRET _004. XML

1 dends only. The first sen-tel_lcé of this
2 -elau_'se shé]l “not apply to so much of the
“3_ ' amount éubjéct td tax under section
4 852(b)(3)(A) as is designated by the com-
-5 pany under section 852(b)(3)(D).
6 o “(ii) OrHER TAXES.—This section
-7 shall not appljr_ for purpoées of determining
8 the amount of any tax imposed by para- - -
9 graph (4), (5), or'(6) of section 857(b). |
10 - “(2) ADJUSTMENTS TO INTERESTS HELD N
1 ENTITY. — |
12 | “(A) REGULATED INVESTMENT COMPA-
13 NIES.—Stock in a regulated investment com-
14 pany (within the meaning of section. 851) shall
15 be an indexed asset for any calendar quarter in
16 the same ratio as—
17 “(1) the average. of the fair market
18 values of the indexed assets held by such
19 company at the -'(ﬂose of each month durmg
20 such quarter, bears to
21 ‘“(ii) the average of the fair mar]gét
22 values of all assets held by such compahy
23 ~ at the close of each such month.
24 “(B) REAL ESTATE  INVESTMENT
2.5 TRUSTS.—Stoek in a real estate investment
fAVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi (42153111)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

._12_.




F:\le'l\GARRE'I‘\GAliRET_OM.XML :

[

O 00T N N th A WL N

N R NN NN O~ ok e
U & W N0 -~ S 0 o 9 6 aa = o 2o s

FWVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

13 |

trust (Witiljn the méan_ing of section 856) shall
be an indexed. asset for any elalendar quarter Ain

the same ratio' asA—I ' | N
| “(1) the fair market value of the_ n-
dexed asééfs' held by such trusf at the close

~ of such quartef, bears to - '
“(ii) the fair market value of all as-
sets held by s1_1.ehr trust at the close of such
quarter.- | o

“(C) RATIO OF 80 PERCENT OR MORE.—If

the ratio for any calendar quarter determined

under sﬁbparagraph (A) or (B) would (but for

_-this subparagraph) be 80 percent or more, such

ratio for such quarter shall be 100 percent.

“(D) RATIO OF 20 PERCENT OR LESS.—If
the ratio for any calendar quarter determined
under sﬁbpar_agraph (A) or (B) would (but for
this suoparagraph) be 20 percent or less, such
ratio for mloh.quérter shall be zero. .

“(E) LOOE-THRU OF PARTNERSHIPS.—For
purposes o-f this paragraph, a qualiﬁed ipvest; |
ment entity which holds a partnership interest

 shall be treated (in lieu of holding'-a partnership

interest) as holding its proportionate share of
the assets held by the partnership. -

(42153111)



F\M11\GARRET\GARRET 004.XML

‘January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

14

1 “(3) TREATMENT OF RETURN OF CAPITAL DIS-
2 _ TR]BUTIO\IS —Except as 0therw1se provided by the
| 3 Secretary, a distribution with respect to stock in a
4 qua]iﬁed investment enﬁty which is not- a dividénd '
'5  and which results in a reduction in the adjusted
_ .6 _ basis of sﬁeh stock shall be treated as a]loeéble'tq
7 stock aeqmred by the taxpayer in the order in which -
§  such stoekA was acquired.
| 9 “(4) QUALIFIED INVESTMENT ENTITY.—FOI
10 purposés of this subsection, the ‘term ‘qualified in-
11 ~ vestment entity’ means—
12 “(A) a regulated investment company
13 (within the meanmg of seetlon 851) and
14 “(B) a real estate mvestment trust (Wlthm
15 the meamng of section 856). |
16 “(f) OTHER PASS-THRU ENTITIES.—
17 “(1) PARTNERSHIPS.—
18 “(A) In GENERAL.—In"the case of a part-

x g 19 nership, the adjustment made under subsection -
20 (a) at the partnership level shaJl'_ be passed
21 through to the partners. - ) |
22 | “(B) SPECIAL RULE IN THE CASE OF SEC-
23 TION 754 ELECTIONS.—In the case of a transfer
24 bf an interést in a partnership with respect to

| ﬁ\VHLC\O12609\01é609.004.XmI _ © (42153111)




" FAM11\GARRET\GARRET _004.XML

1 which the election provided in section 754 is in
2 _effeét— | | |
3 (1) the adjustment under section
4 ' 743'(b)(1) s‘ha]l, v.vith respe‘e_t to the trans-
5 feror partner be treated as a sale of the- |
| 6 partnershlp assets for purposes of applymg :
7 this section, and
8 “(1) with respect to fhe transferee
9 partner, the partnefship’s holding . period
10 . for purposes of this section in such assets
11 B shall be: treated as beginiling' 6n the date .
12 of such adjust.ment'. | |
~13- “2) S CORfORATIONS.—Iﬁ the case of an.SA
14 corporation, the adjustment. made under subsection
15 (a) at the corporate level shall be passed through to
16 the shareholders. This section sha]l not apply for
17 purposés. of determining the amount of any tax im-
18 posed by section 1374 or 1375. |
19 “(3) COMMON TRUST FUNDS. —In the case of a
20 ~common trust fund, the adJustment made under sub-
| 21. -seetlon (a) at the trust level shall be passed t_h;‘ough
22 to the participants. |
23_ “(4) IN'DEXING ADJUSTMENT DISREGARDED IN'
24 DETER].\H\UNG LOSS ON SALE OF ]NTEREST IN ENTI-
25 TY.—Notwithstanding the preeedmg Provisions of. _
f:AVHLC\01 2609\61 2609.004.xmi (42153111)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

15



F:\M11\GARRET\GARRET _004.XML

1 this sﬁbseetion, for purposes ef determirling the
2 arneum of any loss on a sale or '-exehen'ge of an in-
-3_ terest 1n | a partnership, S corporation, | orﬁeommon_
4 trust fund, the-adjustment made under subsection
5 (a) shall not be .fake.n into account in determining
6 the adjusted basis of such interest.
-7 “(g) DISPOSITIONS BETWEEN RELATED PERSONS.—
- 8 ‘2(1) In GENERAL.—This seetion shall not apply
9 to any sale or ether disposition of property between
10 related pers__ons except to the eﬁtent that the basis
11 of such property in the hands of the transferee is a
12 substltuted basis. |
13 “(2) RZELATED PERSONS DEFINED. —For pur-
14 poses of this section, the term ‘related persons’
15 means— |
16  “(A) persons bearing a relationship set
17 forth in section 267(b), and -
18 “(B) persons treated as single -employer-
19 ~ under subse.etion (b).: or (e) of section 414.
20 “(h) TRANSFERS TO INCREAsE INDEXING ADJUST- _
21 MENT.—If .a.ny person transfers eash, debt, or any other
.- 22 property to another person and the prﬁ'neipal purpese of
23 such transfer 1s to secure or increase an adjustment under
24 subsection (a), the Secretary may dJsa]low part or all of
25 such adJustment or increase.
FA\VHLC\012609\012609.004.xml (42153111)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

16




FAMI11\GARRET\GARRET._004.XML

'\‘ : = 17 | -
1 “(1) S?ECIAL RﬁLES;—;For purposes of this As.ect_i(‘)n )
2 ) -TREATMENT OF IMPROVEMENTS, BTC.—If
3 there is an addition to the adjusted basis of any tan-
4 gible pfoperty or of any stock in a corporation’ dijr-
5 | ing the taxable year by reéson of an improvement to
6 such broperty' or a contribution- to capital of such
7 corporation— |
8 “.(A)_‘ 'such- addition shall never be taken
9 into accbunt under subsection (c)'(l)(A) if the
10 aggregate amount thereof during Athe faxable- '
11 year with respect to such property or stock is
12 less than $1,000, and |
13 “(B) such addition shall be treated as a
4-14 separate asset acquired at the close of such tax-
15 able year if the aggregate amount thereof dur-
16. ing the taxable year with respect to such prop-
17 erty or stock is $1,000 of more. -
18 A rule similar to the rule_ of the preceding sentence
19 shall apply to any other portiori of an asset to the
20 extent that separate treatment of such portion is ap-
21 propﬁaté to carry out the puiposes of this section.
22 “(2) ASSETS WHICH ARE NOT INDEXED ASSETS
23 THROUGHOUT HOLDI&G PERIOD.—The app]idable in-
24 flation adjustment shall be appropriately reduced for
_ FAVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmt (42153111)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)




FAM11\GARRET\GARRET _OOi.XML

1 periods during which the asset 'Wés not an indexed
2 asset. | . |
3 “(3)  TREATMENT oF ) CEETAIN DISTRIBU-
4 - TIONS.—A aistributipn wifh fespeet to stock m a
5 corporatidn which.is not a dividend shall be treated
6 as a disposition. | ' '
7 | “(4) SECTION CANNOT INCREASE ORDINARY
8  1L0ss.—To the extent that (bﬁt for this. paragraph) -
9 this section would create or increase a net ordinary
10 loss to which section 1231(a)(2) applies or an . ordi- :
11 nary loss to which any other. provision of this title
12 .applies, such pfovision shall not apply. "I“he taxpayer
13 shall be treated as -having a long-term capital loss in
14 an amount equal to the amount of the ordjnary loss
1 5 \ to which the preceding sentence applies.
16 “(5) ACQUISITION DATE WHERE THERE HAS
17 BEEN PRIOR APPLICATION OF SUBSECTION (a)(1)
18 WITH RESPECT TO THE TAXPAYER.—If there has
19 | been a.pr'ior application of subsection (a)(1) to an
20 ésset_ while such asset was held by th_e taxpayer, the
221 “date of acquisition of such asset by the taxpéyer
22 shall be treated as not earlier than the date of the
| 23 | most recent suéh prior application. |
_f:\VHLC\01é609\012609.064.ml " (4215311)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

18




F\MIINGARRET\GARRET_004.XML

—

\ooo\lcn-u:.pu'w

—_
_- O

12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

22

23

19 | |

“G) '-REGUL;A:LTIONS.—T_he Secretary shall’ pfescribe
such regulations as may be necessary or .appro'pria'te to |
carry out the purposes of this sectlon |

“(k) TERMJ’NATION —For purposes of this sect10n

'the term 1ndexed asset’ shall not mclude any asset ac-

qmred after December 31, 2009.”

(b) CLERICAL AMENDMENT.—The table of sections
for pé,rt I of subchaf)ter O of ch‘ap'ter 1 is amended by
striking the item relating to section 1023 and by inserting
after the item relating -to section 1022 the fo]lbwing new
items: | )

“Sec. 1022. Indexing of certain assets for purposes of determining gain or loss
“Sec. 1023. Cross references.”. .

(¢) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by .
this section shall apply to sales and other dispositions of
indexed ésséts after the date of the enactment of this Act,
in taxable years ending after such date. |
SEC. 112. REDﬁCEﬁ CAPITAL GA]i\IS RATE FOR CORPORA-

TIONS. |

(a) IN GENERAL _ Section 1201 of the Internal Rev-
enue Code of 1986 is amended by striking_"‘35 percent”’
both places it appears and msertmg “15 percent”. -

(b) ALTERNATIVE M[N'IMUM Tax.—Section 55(b) of
such Code is amended by addmg at the end the fo]lowmg

‘new paragraph:

FAVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi (42153111)
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)



- FAM11\GARRET\GARRET 004 XML

20
1 .“(5):M‘A:XIZMUM' RATE OF TAX ON NET CA_PiTAL
2 GAIN OF CORPORATIONS.—The amovnt deterﬁained |
3 .  under paragraph (1)(]3)(1) shall not exceed the sum
_'4 of— ‘ |
5 | “.(A) the amount determined under’ such
.6 " paragraph computed at the rates and in the
| 7 same.maniler as if thls parégraph had not been
-8 | enactéd on the V"ca.xable .excessl' reduced by the
9 net capital gain, plus .
10 “(B) the amount determinéd under section
11 1201.”, |
12 (¢) TECHNICAL AMENDMENTS.— -
13 (1) Section 1445(e)(1) of such Code, as amend-
14 ed by section 104, is amended by striking “25 per-
15 “cent (or, to the extent pr‘ovid'ed.in regulations, 15 |
16 percent)”’ and insérting “15 percent”.
17 (2) Section 1445(6)(2) of sueh Code, as 80
18 amended, is amended by strlkmg “25 percent”’ and
19 msertmg “15 percent”
20 (3) Section 7518(g)(6)(A) of such Code is
21 amended by striking “(34 percent in the case of a’
22 corporation)”’. | B _
23 (4) Section 607(h)(6)(A) of the Merchant Ma-
24 riné Act, 1936 is amended by striking “(34 percent
25 in t'heiease of ‘a corporation)”’.
fAVHILC\012609\012609.004.xml (421531i1) ‘

Januavry 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)




" FAMI1\GARRET\GARRET 004.XML

'(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—
2 (1) .IN'GENERAL._—Except as prOvidéd in para-
3 graph (2), the amendmeﬁts ‘made by this seétion
4 shé]l apply _fo ta.ﬁable years beginning after Decem-
5 ber 31, 2008. |
6 () WITE[HOLD]:NG.—The amendment made by
7 ~ subsection (¢)(2) shall apply to amotnts paid after
8 the date of the enactment of thls Act.
9 Subtitle C—Other Provisions
10 . Related to Businesses.
11 SEC. 121. REPEAL OF CER’I_‘AIN'LHV[ITA_TIONS ON THE EX--
12 | PENSING OF SECTION 179 .PROPERTY.
13 (a) INn GENERAL.—Sectjon 179 of the Internal Rev-
14 enue Code of 1986 is amended by striking subsection (b)
15 and by redesignating subsections (¢), (d), and (e) as sub-
16 sections (b), (e), and (d), réspeetively. '
17 (b) EXPENSING OF SECTION 1250 PROPERTY.——S;b-
18 paragraph -(B) of section 179(e)(1) of such Code, as redes-
19 ignafed by subsection (a), is amended by inserting “or see-
20 tion 1250 property (as deﬁned'in‘section 1250(c))” after
21 “section 1245 property (as  defined in section. A
22 1245(a)(3))". | o
23 (¢) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS,—
24 (1) Subséction (¢) of section 179 of such Code,
25 as redesignated by subsection (a), is amended by
f£AVHLC\012609012609.004.xmi (42153111)

21

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)



~ FAM11\GARRET\GARRET. 004.XML

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

22
” 1 .striking paragraphs. (6) and (8), and by redesig-
2 nating paragraphs (7 ) (9), and (10) as paragraphs
3 (6) (7), and (8), respeetlvely |
-4 (2) Paragraph (6) of section 179(e) of such
5 Code, as redesignated by paragraphA (1) and sub-
6 section (a), is amehded by striking ‘‘paragraphs (2)
7 | and (6)”,and inserting “paragraph (2)”.
- 8 (3) Section 179 of such Code, as amended by
9 subsection (a), 18 amended by striking subséetion |
0 (@ - | |
11 (4) Sections 42(d)(2)(B)(@), 1397D(d)(1),
12 1400B(b)(4)(A)(1), and 1400F(b)(4)(A)3) of such
13 Code are -each amended by striking ‘‘section
14 179(d)(2)” and inserting “section 179(c)(2)”.
15 (5) Subelausé (I) of section 42(d)(2)(D)(iii) of
16 such Code is amended—
17 (A) by striking “section 179(d)” and in-
18 sei-ting “section 179(c)”, and _,
19 - (B) by striking “section 179(d)(7)” and
20 inserting “section 179(c)(6)”.
21 (6)(A) Subpart B of part IIT of subchapter U
22 of chapter 1 of such Code is hereby repealed.
23 (B) The table of subparts for such part I is
| 24 amended.by striking ‘the item relating’ to subpart B.
- FAVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi  (42153111)




F:\M1 1\GARRE'I'\GARRET_004.XML

O 0 I A N AW ON e

NN NN m e e e e :
W N = S O R DD R~S

.23 |
(T)(A) Part I of subehapter X of chapter 1 of -

~ such Code is amended by strlkmg section 1400J

(B) The table of seetlons for sueh part is

- amended by s_trlkmg the item relating to section

1400J
(C) Paragraph (3) of seetlon 1400E(b) of sueh

" Code is amended by striking “‘sections 1400~F and -

1400J” and inserting “section 1400F”.
(8 Clause (iv) of section 1400L(b)(2)(A) of
such Code 18 amended by strlkmg ‘section 179(d)”

- and msertmg ‘section 179(c)”.

(9) Section 1400L of such Code is amended by

striking: subsection (.

(d) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments made by

this section shall apply to property plaeéd In service in
taxable yearé beginning after December 31, 2008.

SEC. 122. RESEARCH CREDIT MADE PERMANENT.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Section 41 of the Internal Rev-

enue Code of 1986 (-relating to credit for inereasing' re-
: search aetivitjes) is amended by Astriking subsection (h).

. (b) - CONFORMING AMENDMENT.'—ParagTaph 1) of
section 45C(b) of sueh ,Code is amended by striking sub-

_ parag'raph (D)

FAVHLC\012609\012609.004.xml (4215311)

" January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)



' FAMII\GARRET\GARRET_004.XML

24
1 (c) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amend_ments made by
2 this section shall apply to amounts paid or meurred after A
3 -December 31, 2009 |
4 SEC. 123. 1-YEAR CARRYBACK OF NET OPERAT]NG LOSSES.
5 (a) IN GENERAL. —Clause (i) section 172(b)(1)(A) of
6 the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by stnkmg
7 “2 taxable years " and msertmg “7 taxable years .
8 (b) CONFORMING AMENDMENTS.—
9 (1) Paragraph (1) of section 172(b) of such
10 Code is amended by striking subparagraphs (F),
1. (G), (H), (T), and (J). |
12 (2) Section 172 of such Code is amended by
13 -striking subsections (i), (j), and (k) and by redesig-
14 nating subsection (1) aé subseetion (i). -
15 (e) EFFECTIVE DATE.—
16 | (1) In GENERAL.—Except as provided in para-
17 graph (2), the amendments made by this section
18 shall apply to net Operatmg losses for taxable years
19 endmg after December 31, 2007.
20 (2) ELECTION.—In the case of a net operating
21 loss for a taxable year ending during 2008, any elec-
22 tion made under section 172(b)(3) of the Internal
23 Revenue Code of 1986 may (notwithstanding such
24 section) be revoked before January 1, 2010.
t\vHLC\m 2609\012609.004.xm (42%531 1)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)




F\M11\GARRET\GARRET_004.XML

jum—y

NN N N N N e e
G & W N = & & ®»® 4 & o B oo =2 82

O 0 N N bk W N

25
Subtltle D—Other Prov151ons
Relatlng to Ind1v1duals
SEC. 131. CHILD TAX CREDIT lNCREASED AND .MADE PER- - |

(a) INCREASED OREDIT.—Subsection (a) of section -

‘24 of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 is amended by

str1kmg “$1,000” and msertmg “$5,000”.
(b) INCREASED_ CREDIT NOT REFUNDABLE.—Sub-

paragraph (A) of section 24(d)(1) of such Code iS amend— '

- ed to read as follows:

“_(A) the credit which Weuld be a]loWed
under this seetion— ’
.“,(i) withouf regafd to this subsection
and the hmitation under section 26(a)(2)
or subsection (b)(3), as.the"ease may be,
and
“(). 1f subsection (a) were applied by
substituting ‘1,000’ for ‘$5,000’, or”.

(e) EFFECTIVE DATE. - ndir
this section shall apply to taXa‘ble years beginning after
December 31, 2008. |
SEC. 132. DISTRIBUTIONS NOT REQUIRED FROM INDIL-
| VIDUAL RETIREMENT PLANS AT AGE 70%.
Paragraph (9) of section 401(a) of the Internal Rev-
enue Code of 1986 (relatmg to required distributions) is

’ f:\VHLC\01.2609\O1 2609.004.xml (42153111)
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)



FAMI1\GARRET\GARRET_004.XML

—

10
11 is amended by adding at the end the following new para- _
12 graph:
13 “(10) DISTRIBUTION_S.DURING 2009.—
14 “A) In GENERAL.—Gross income of an
15 individual for the ta,xable year does not include
16 any distribution during 2009 from an individual
17 | retirement plan (other than a plan déscribed in
18 subsection (k) or (p)) to the extent such dis-
19  tribution is otherwise includible in gross in-
20 conie.
21 - “(B) APPLICATION OF SECTION 72.—Not-
| 22 . withstanding section 72, in determining the ex-
23 tent to Wthh an amount is treated és otherwise
24 includible in grdss income for purposes of sub-
25 paragraph (A), the aggregate amount distrib- _
FAVHLC\012609\012609.004.xml (42153111)

O 0 N A U A WP

| 26
amerided by adding at the end the fo]iowing new sﬁbpara—
g_'raph: L
“(I) EXCEPTION FOR INDIVIDUAL RETIRE-
Mﬁ}N’i“ PIiAi\Ts,;—Thé requirements of this. para-
graph sha]l not apply to any individual retire-
ment plan for any calendar yéar after 2009.”.
SEC. 133, NO IRA DISTRIBUTION DURING 2009 INCLUDED IN
| GROSS INCOME.
Subsection (d) of sec_fion 408 of the Internal Revenue
Code of .1986 (réiating to individual retirement'accbunts) |

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)




Fw1 1\GAMGARRET_OM.M

f—

NI R - NN T S N SUR

e e S
LW N = D

14

27

: uted from an md1v1dual retirement plan shall be
treated as meludlble in gross income to the ex- |
_tent that such amount does not exceed the ag-
gregate amount which- would have been so-in-
eludjble it all amounts from -all individual retﬁe-
ment plans were distributed. Proper adjust-
ments shall be made in applying seetion 72 to
other distributions in such’ taxable year and

subsequent taxable years.”

TITLE  II—ACROSS-THE-BOARD

RESCISSIONS IN' NON-DE-
FENSE DISCRETIONARY
SPENDING FOR FISCAL YEAR
2009 -

15 SEC. 201. ACROSS-THE-BOARD RESéISSIONS IN NON-DE-

16
17
18

FENSE DISCRETIONARY SPENDING FOR FIS-

CAL YEAR 2009.

(a) ACROSS-THE-BOARD RESCISSIONS.—There is

19 hereby rescinded an amount equal to 1 percent of—

20 (1) the budget authority provided (or obligation
2_1' limitation imposed) for fiscal year 2009 for any non-
22 defense diseretionary account in any ﬁsea.l year 2009
23 _ appropriatiOn Act; - |

24 | (2) the budget authority proﬁded in any ad-
25 vance appropriation for fiscal year 200_9 for Aany

f:A\VHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi (421531 )

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)



FAM1 I\GARRET\GARRET_004.XML

28

' noﬁ-defense_ diseretionary aceount in any prior fiscal

year appropriation Act; and _
- (3) the contract authority prov1ded in fiscal
year 2009 for any program that is subJect to a limi-

.tatlon contained in any ﬁscal year 2009 appropria-

tion Act for any 'nenfdefense discretionary account.

(b) NON-DEFENSE DISCRETIONARY ACCOUNT.—For

purposes of subsection (a), the term “non-defense discre-

tionary account” means any discretionary account, other

10 than—

(1) any‘aceount included in a Depe,rtﬁlent of
Defense Approprlanons Act;

(2) any. aeeount included in a- Mhta.ry Quahty
of Life and Veterans Affairs Appropriations. Act; or

(3) any account for Department of Energy de-

~ fense activities included in an Energy and Water

Development Appropriations Act.

(¢) PROPORTIONATE APPLICATION.—Any rescission

19 made by subseeti.on‘(a) sha.]l be applied proportionately—.

20 (1) to each discretionary account and each item

21 of budget authority described in such .subseeti_en;_

22 and | |

23 (2) within each such aceount and item, to each

24 program, project, and activity (with pregrains,

25  projects, and activities as delineated in the Aappro—
f.:\VH LC\012609\012609.004.xml 421 531. 1)

January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)




FAMI1\GARRET\GARRET 004 XML = -
29

priation Act or accompanying reports for the - rel-

'_—l

evant ﬁsca.l_-yea,r covering such account or item, or
for accounts aﬁd if(_ems not included in appropriation
Acts, as de]jne.ated.in the most retently ‘submitted
President’s budget). : '

- (d) SUBSEQUENT APPROPRIATION TaWs—TIn the
case of \any fiscal year 2009 appropriafion Act ené,cted

after the enactment of this section, any rescission required

O 0 9 & W AW

by subsection (a) shall take effect immediately after the

[
(e

enactment of suéh Act.
" (e) OMB REPORT.—Within 30 days after the enact-

[um—y
—

ment of this section (or, if later, 30 days after the enact-

[
\®]

ment of any ﬁscél‘year 2009 appropriation Act), the Di-

[
W

rector of the Office of Management and Budget shall sub-

fu—y
.

mit to the Committees on Appropriations of the House

—
AN W

of Represeﬁtatives and the Senate a report specifying the

[
~J

account and amount of each rescission made pursuant to

subs_eétion (a). .

. TITLE III-INCREASED
INCENTIVES FOR EDUCATION

SEC. 301. INCREASED DEDUCTION FOR QUALIFIED HIGHER

N N N = =
[\le—nO\DOO

EDUCATION EXPENSES.

(a) IN GENERAL.—Paragraph (2) of section 222(b)

NN
2 O

of the Internal Revenue Code of 1986 (relating to dollar

FAVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi (42153111)
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)



FAM1NGARRET\GARRET_004.XML

30

- 1 limitations on qualified -tuition and related expenses)- 18

2 amended to read as follows:

3

O 00w 3 o w»m A~

10

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24

£A\VHLC\012609\012609.004.xml
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)

“(2) DOLLAR LIMITATIONS.—

“(A) IN. GENERAL.—In the _ca'se of aliy

taxable year begiﬁnjng after 2008, the applica-

ble dollar amount shall be equal to—

“(1) in the case of a _ta.xpayei' whose

~ adjusted gross income for the taxable year

does not exceed $75,000 ($150,000 in the
éase of a joint return), $6,000, |

“(ii) in the case of a taxpayer not de-

_seribed in clause (i) whose adjusted gross

income for the taxable yeé:r does not ex-
ceed $90,000 ($180,000 in the case of a
joint return), $2,000, and | |

“(ii)) in the case of any other tax-
payer, zero.

“(B) ADJUSTED GROSS INCOME.—For

-pui*poses of this paragraph, 'adjusted gross in-

come shall be determined—

“(1) without regard to this section and
sections 199, 911, 931, and 933, and . -
“(ii) after application of sections 86,

135, 137, 219, 221, and 469.”.

(4215311)




FAMI1\GARRET\GARRET 004.XML -
o - 31

(b) EFFECTIVE DATE—The amendment made by -

—

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after
December 31, 2008. B
SEC. 302. INCREASED DEDUCTION FOR INTEREST ON STU-
| DENT LOANS. . - |
' (ei) iNCREASED DEDUCT_ION.—Péragraph (1) of see-
tion 223(b) of the Tnternal Revenue Code of 1986 (relat-

ing to intérest on eduecation loans) is amended to read as

O© 00 ~ & L A LN

follows:

—
o

“(1) MaxmMuM DEDUCTI'ON.—EXCepf. as pro-

[
[

- vided in paragr;a'ph. (2), the deduction allowed by

(

—
N

subsection (a) for the taxable year shall not exceed.
$3,750.”.

- (b) ExpanpED INCOME ELIGIBILITY.—Subclause

_
AW

(IT) of section 223I(b)(2)(B)(i) of such Code is amended
by striking “$50,000 ($100,000” and inserting “$75,000
($150,000”.

(e) EFFECTIVE DATE.—The amendments ‘made by

— = e
0 N O W

this section shall apply to taxable years beginning after :
December 31, 2008., |

N =
O WO

FAVHLC\012609\012609.004.xmi (421531!1') .
January 26, 2009 (9:35 a.m.)





