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NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

Advisory Committee on Reactor 
Safeguards (ACRS) 

Meeting of the Subcommittee on 
Digital Instrumentation and Control 
Systems; Notice of Meeting 

The ACRS Subcommittee on Digital 
Instrumentation and Control Systems 
will hold a meeting on April 17, 2008, 
Room T–2B3, Two White Flint North, 
11545 Rockville Pike, Rockville, 
Maryland. 

The entire meeting will be open to 
public attendance. 

The agenda for the subject meeting 
shall be as follows: 

Thursday, April 17, 2008—8:30 a.m. 
until the conclusion of business 

The Subcommittee will hold 
discussions with representatives of the 
NRC staff and the industry regarding 
digital instrumentation and control 
systems issues. The Subcommittee will 
hear presentations by and hold 
discussions with representatives of the 
NRC staff, the industry, and other 
interested persons regarding this matter. 
The Subcommittee will gather 
information, analyze relevant issues and 
facts, and formulate proposed positions 
and actions, as appropriate, for 
deliberation by the full Committee. 

Members of the public desiring to 
provide oral statements and/or written 
comments should notify the Designated 
Federal Official, Mr. Girija Shukla 
(telephone 301/415–6855) five days 
prior to the meeting, if possible, so that 
appropriate arrangements can be made. 
Electronic recordings will be permitted. 

Further information regarding this 
meeting can be obtained by contacting 
the Designated Federal Official between 
7:15 a.m. and 5 p.m. (ET). Persons 
planning to attend this meeting are 
urged to contact the above named 
individual at least two working days 
prior to the meeting to be advised of any 
potential changes to the agenda. 

Dated: April 3, 2008. 

Harold VanderMolen, 
Acting Branch Chief, ACRS. 
[FR Doc. E8–7715 Filed 4–10–08; 8:45 am] 

BILLING CODE 7590–01–P 

NUCLEAR REGULATORY 
COMMISSION 

[Docket No. 72–68; EA–08–069] 

In the Matter of Exelon Generation 
Company Byron Generating Station 
Independent Spent Fuel Installation 
Order Modifying License (Effective 
Immediately) 

AGENCY: U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission. 
ACTION: Issuance of Order for 
Implementation of Additional Security 
Measures and Fingerprinting for 
Unescorted Access to Exelon Generation 
Company, LLC. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION CONTACT: 
L. Raynard Wharton, Senior Project 
Manager, Licensing and Inspection 
Directorate, Division of Spent Fuel 
Storage and Transportation, Office of 
Nuclear Material Safety and Safeguards 
(NMSS), U.S. Nuclear Regulatory 
Commission (NRC), Rockville, MD 
20852. Telephone: (301) 492–3316; fax 
number: (301) 492–3350; e-mail: 
LRaynard.Wharton@nrc.gov. 

SUPPLEMENTARY INFORMATION: 

I. Introduction 
Pursuant to 10 CFR 2.106, NRC (or the 

Commission) is providing notice, in the 
matter of Byron Generating Station 
Independent Spent Fuel Storage 
Installation (ISFSI) Order Modifying 
License (Effective Immediately). 

II. Further Information 

I 
NRC has issued a general license to 

Exelon Generating Company, LLC 
(Exelon), authorizing the operation of an 
ISFSI, in accordance with the Atomic 
Energy Act of 1954, as amended, and 
Title 10 of the Code of Federal 
Regulations (10 CFR) Part 72. This 
Order is being issued to Exelon, which 
has identified near-term plans to store 
spent fuel in an ISFSI under the general 
license provisions of 10 CFR Part 72. 
The Commission(s regulations at 10 CFR 
72.212(b)(5) and 10 CFR 73.55(h)(1) 
require Exelon to maintain safeguards 
contingency plan procedures to respond 
to threats of radiological sabotage and to 
protect the spent fuel against the threat 
of radiological sabotage, in accordance 
with 10 CFR Part 73, Appendix C. 
Specific safeguards requirements are 
contained in 10 CFR 73.51 or 73.55, as 
applicable. 

Inasmuch as an insider has an 
opportunity equal to, or greater than, 
any other person, to commit radiological 
sabotage, the Commission has 
determined these measures to be 

prudent. Comparable Orders have been 
issued to all licensees that currently 
store spent fuel or have identified near- 
term plans to store spent fuel in an 
ISFSI. 

II 
On September 11, 2001, terrorists 

simultaneously attacked targets in New 
York, NY, and Washington, DC, using 
large commercial aircraft as weapons. In 
response to the attacks and intelligence 
information subsequently obtained, the 
Commission issued a number of 
Safeguards and Threat Advisories to its 
licensees, to strengthen licensees’ 
capabilities and readiness to respond to 
a potential attack on a nuclear facility. 
On October 16, 2002, the Commission 
issued Orders to the licensees of 
operating ISFSIs, to place the actions 
taken in response to the Advisories into 
the established regulatory framework 
and to implement additional security 
enhancements that emerged from NRC’s 
ongoing comprehensive review. The 
Commission has also communicated 
with other Federal, State, and local 
government agencies and industry 
representatives to discuss and evaluate 
the current threat environment in order 
to assess the adequacy of security 
measures at licensed facilities. In 
addition, the Commission has 
conducted a comprehensive review of 
its safeguards and security programs 
and requirements. 

As a result of its consideration of 
current safeguards and security 
requirements, as well as a review of 
information provided by the intelligence 
community, the Commission has 
determined that certain additional 
security measures (ASMs) are required 
to address the current threat 
environment, in a consistent manner 
throughout the nuclear ISFSI 
community. Therefore, the Commission 
is imposing requirements, as set forth in 
Attachments 1 and 2 of this Order, on 
all licensees of these facilities. These 
requirements, which supplement 
existing regulatory requirements, will 
provide the Commission with 
reasonable assurance that the public 
health and safety and common defense 
and security continue to be adequately 
protected in the current threat 
environment. These requirements will 
remain in effect until the Commission 
determines otherwise. 

The Commission recognizes that 
Exelon may have already initiated many 
of the measures set forth in Attachments 
1 and 2 to this Order, in response to 
previously issued advisories, or on their 
own. It also recognizes that some 
measures may not be possible nor 
necessary at some sites, or may need to 
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