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Center for Health Statistics, the Na-
tional Institutes of Health, or ‘‘Nutri-
tion and Your Health: Dietary Guide-
lines for Americans,’’ U.S. Department 
of Health and Human Services (DHHS) 
and U.S. Department of Argiculture 
(USDA), Government Printing Office. 

(4) The claim may indicate that it is 
consistent with ‘‘Nutrition and Your 
Health: U.S. Dietary Guidelines for 
Americans, DHHS and USDA, Govern-
ment Printing Office. 

(5) In specifying the nutrient, the 
claim may include the term ‘‘salt’’ in 
addition to the term ‘‘sodium.’’

(6) In specifying the disease, the 
claim may include the term ‘‘hyper-
tension’’ in addition to the term ‘‘high 
blood pressure.’’

(7) The claim may state that individ-
uals with high blood pressure should 
consult their physicians for medical 
advice and treatment. If the claim de-
fines high or normal blood pressure, 
then the health claim must state that 
individuals with high blood pressure 
should consult their physicians for 
medical advice and treatment. 

(e) Model health claims. The following 
are model health claims that may be 
used in food labeling to describe the re-
lationship between dietary sodium and 
high blood pressure: 

(1) Diets low in sodium may reduce 
the risk of high blood pressure, a dis-
ease associated with many factors. 

(2) Development of hypertension or 
high blood pressure depends on many 
factors. [This product] can be part of a 
low sodium, low salt diet that might 
reduce the risk of hypertension or high 
blood pressure. 

[58 FR 2836, Jan. 6, 1993; 58 FR 17100, Apr. 1, 
1993]

§ 101.75 Health claims: dietary satu-
rated fat and cholesterol and risk of 
coronary heart disease. 

(a) Relationship between dietary satu-
rated fat and cholesterol and risk of coro-
nary heart disease. (1) Cardiovascular 
disease means diseases of the heart and 
circulatory system. Coronary heart 
disease is the most common and seri-
ous form of cardiovascular disease and 
refers to diseases of the heart muscle 
and supporting blood vessels. High 
blood total- and low density 
lipoprotein (LDL)- cholesterol levels 

are major modifiable risk factors in 
the development of coronary heart dis-
ease. High coronary heart disease rates 
occur among people with high blood 
cholesterol levels of 240 milligrams/dec-
aliter (mg/dL) (6.21 millimoles per liter 
(mmol/L)) or above and LDL-choles-
terol levels of 160 mg/dL (4.13 mmol/L) 
or above. Borderline high risk blood 
cholesterol levels range from 200 to 239 
mg/dL (5.17 to 6.18 mmol/L) and 130 to 
159 mg/dL (3.36 to 4.11 mmol/L) of LDL-
cholesterol. Dietary lipids (fats) in-
clude fatty acids and cholesterol. Total 
fat, commonly referred to as fat, is 
composed of saturated fat (fatty acids 
containing no double bonds), and 
monounsaturated and polyunsaturated 
fat (fatty acids containing one or more 
double bonds). 

(2) The scientific evidence establishes 
that diets high in saturated fat and 
cholesterol are associated with in-
creased levels of blood total- and LDL-
cholesterol and, thus, with increased 
risk of coronary heart disease. Diets 
low in saturated fat and cholesterol are 
associated with decreased levels of 
blood total- and LDL-cholesterol, and 
thus, with decreased risk of developing 
coronary heart disease. 

(b) Significance of the relationship be-
tween dietary saturated fat and choles-
terol and risk of coronary heart disease. 
(1) Coronary heart disease is a major 
public health concern in the United 
States, primarily because it accounts 
for more deaths than any other disease 
or group of diseases. Early manage-
ment of risk factors for coronary heart 
disease is a major public health goal 
that can assist in reducing risk of coro-
nary heart disease. There is a con-
tinuum of mortality risk from coro-
nary heart disease that increases with 
increasing levels of blood LDL-choles-
terol. Individuals with high blood LDL-
cholesterol are at greatest risk. A larg-
er number of individuals with more 
moderately elevated cholesterol also 
have increased risk of coronary events; 
such individuals comprise a substantial 
proportion of the adult U.S. popu-
lation. The scientific evidence indi-
cates that reducing saturated fat and 
cholesterol intakes lowers blood LDL-
cholesterol and risk of heart disease in 
most individuals. There is also evi-
dence that reducing saturated fat and 
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cholesterol intakes in persons with 
blood cholesterol levels in the normal 
range also reduces risk of heart dis-
ease. 

(2) Other risk factors for coronary 
heart disease include a family history 
of heart disease, high blood pressure, 
diabetes, cigarette smoking, obesity 
(body weight 30 percent greater than 
ideal body weight), and lack of regular 
physical exercise. 

(3) Intakes of saturated fat exceed 
recommended levels in many people in 
the United States. Intakes of choles-
terol are, on average, at or above rec-
ommended levels. One of the major 
public health recommendations rel-
ative to coronary heart disease risk is 
to consume less than 10 percent of cal-
ories from saturated fat, and an aver-
age of 30 percent or less of total cal-
ories from all fat. Recommended daily 
cholesterol intakes are 300 mg or less 
per day. 

(c) Requirements. (1) All requirements 
set forth in § 101.14 shall be met. 

(2) Specific requirements—(i) Nature of 
the claim. A health claim associating 
diets low in saturated fat and choles-
terol with reduced risk of coronary 
heart disease may be made on the label 
or labeling of a food described in para-
graph (c)(2)(ii) of this section provided 
that: 

(A) The claim states that diets low in 
saturated fat and cholesterol ‘‘may’’ or 
‘‘might’’ reduce the risk of heart dis-
ease; 

(B) In specifying the disease, the 
claim uses the terms ‘‘heart disease’’ 
or ‘‘coronary heart disease;’’

(C) In specifying the nutrient, the 
claim uses the terms ‘‘saturated fat’’ 
and ‘‘cholesterol’’ and lists both; 

(D) The claim does not attribute any 
degree of risk reduction for coronary 
heart disease to diets low in dietary 
saturated fat and cholesterol; and 

(E) The claim states that coronary 
heart disease risk depends on many 
factors. 

(ii) Nature of the food. The food shall 
meet all of the nutrient content re-
quirements of § 101.62 for a ‘‘low satu-
rated fat,’’ ‘‘low cholesterol,’’ and ‘‘low 
fat’’ food; except that fish and game 
meats (i.e., deer, bison, rabbit, quail, 
wild turkey, geese, and ostrich) may 

meet the requirements for ‘‘extra lean’’ 
in § 101.62. 

(d) Optional information. (1) The claim 
may identify one or more of the fol-
lowing risk factors in addition to satu-
rated fat and cholesterol about which 
there is general scientific agreement 
that they are major risk factors for 
this disease: A family history of coro-
nary heart disease, elevated blood total 
and LDL-cholesterol, excess body 
weight, high blood pressure, cigarette 
smoking, diabetes, and physical inac-
tivity. 

(2) The claim may indicate that the 
relationship of saturated fat and cho-
lesterol to heart disease is through the 
intermediate link of ‘‘blood choles-
terol’’ or ‘‘blood total- and LDL choles-
terol.’’

(3) The claim may include informa-
tion from paragraphs (a) and (b) of this 
section, which summarize the relation-
ship between dietary saturated fat and 
cholesterol and risk of coronary heart 
disease, and the significance of the re-
lationship. 

(4) In specifying the nutrients, the 
claim may include the term ‘‘total fat’’ 
in addition to the terms ‘‘saturated 
fat’’ and ‘‘cholesterol’’. 

(5) The claim may include informa-
tion on the number of people in the 
United States who have coronary heart 
disease. The sources of this informa-
tion shall be identified, and it shall be 
current information from the National 
Center for Health Statistics, the Na-
tional Institutes of Health, or ‘‘Nutri-
tion and Your Health: Dietary Guide-
lines for Americans,’’ U.S. Department 
of Health and Human Services (DHHS) 
and U.S. Department of Agriculture 
(USDA), Government Printing Office. 

(6) The claim may indicate that it is 
consistent with ‘‘Nutrition and Your 
Health: Dietary Guidelines for Ameri-
cans,’’ DHHS and USDA, Government 
Printing Office. 

(7) The claim may state that individ-
uals with elevated blood total- or LDL-
cholesterol should consult their physi-
cians for medical advice and treat-
ment. If the claim defines high or nor-
mal blood total- or LDL-cholesterol 
levels, then the claim shall state that 
individuals with high blood cholesterol 
should consult their physicians for 
medical advice and treatment. 

VerDate jul<14>2003 15:01 May 14, 2004 Jkt 203065 PO 00000 Frm 00135 Fmt 8010 Sfmt 8010 Y:\SGML\203065T.XXX 203065T



136

21 CFR Ch. I (4–1–04 Edition)§ 101.76

(e) Model health claims.The following 
are model health claims that may be 
used in food labeling to describe the re-
lationship between dietary saturated 
fat and cholesterol and risk of heart 
disease: 

(1) While many factors affect heart 
disease, diets low in saturated fat and 
cholesterol may reduce the risk of this 
disease; 

(2) Development of heart disease de-
pends upon many factors, but its risk 
may be reduced by diets low in satu-
rated fat and cholesterol and healthy 
lifestyles; 

(3) Development of heart disease de-
pends upon many factors, including a 
family history of the disease, high 
blood LDL-cholesterol, diabetes, high 
blood pressure, being overweight, ciga-
rette smoking, lack of exercise, and 
the type of dietary pattern. A healthful 
diet low in saturated fat, total fat, and 
cholesterol, as part of a healthy life-
style, may lower blood cholesterol lev-
els and may reduce the risk of heart 
disease; 

(4) Many factors, such as a family 
history of the disease, increased blood- 
and LDL-cholesterol levels, high blood 
pressure, cigarette smoking, diabetes, 
and being overweight, contribute to de-
veloping heart disease. A diet low in 
saturated fat, cholesterol, and total fat 
may help reduce the risk of heart dis-
ease; and 

(5) Diets low in saturated fat, choles-
terol, and total fat may reduce the risk 
of heart disease. Heart disease is de-
pendent upon many factors, including 
diet, a family history of the disease, 
elevated blood LDL-cholesterol levels, 
and physical inactivity. 

[58 FR 2757, Jan. 6, 1993]

§ 101.76 Health claims: fiber-con-
taining grain products, fruits, and 
vegetables and cancer. 

(a) Relationship between diets low in 
fat and high in fiber-containing grain 
products, fruits, and vegetables and can-
cer risk. (1) Cancer is a constellation of 
more than 100 different diseases, each 
characterized by the uncontrolled 
growth and spread of abnormal cells. 
Cancer has many causes and stages in 
its development. Both genetic and en-
vironmental risk factors may affect 
the risk of cancer. Risk factors include: 

A family history of a specific type of 
cancer, cigarette smoking, overweight 
and obesity, alcohol consumption, ul-
traviolet or ionizing radiation, expo-
sure to cancer-causing chemicals, and 
dietary factors. 

(2) The scientific evidence establishes 
that diets low in fat and high in fiber-
containing grain products, fruits, and 
vegetables are associated with a re-
duced risk of some types of cancer. Al-
though the specific role of total dietary 
fiber, fiber components, and the mul-
tiple nutrients and other substances 
contained in these foods are not yet 
fully understood, many studies have 
shown that diets low in fat and high in 
fiber-containing foods are associated 
with reduced risk of some types of can-
cer. 

(b) Significance of the relationship be-
tween consumption of diets low in fat and 
high in fiber-containing grain products, 
fruits, and vegetables and risk of cancer. 
(1) Cancer is ranked as a leading cause 
of death in the United States. The 
overall economic costs of cancer, in-
cluding direct health care costs and 
losses due to morbidity and mortality, 
are very high. 

(2) U.S. diets tend to be high in fat 
and low in grain products, fruits, and 
vegetables. Studies in various parts of 
the world indicate that populations 
who habitually consume a diet high in 
plant foods have lower risks of some 
cancers. These diets generally are low 
in fat and rich in many nutrients, in-
cluding, but not limited to, dietary 
fiber. Current dietary guidelines from 
Federal government agencies and na-
tionally recognized health professional 
organizations recommend decreased 
consumption of fats (less than 30 per-
cent of calories), maintenance of desir-
able body weight, and increased con-
sumption of fruits and vegetables (five 
or more servings daily), and grain prod-
ucts (six or more servings daily). 

(c) Requirements. (1) All requirements 
set forth in § 101.14 shall be met. 

(2) Specific requirements—(i) Nature of 
the claim. A health claim associating 
diets low in fat and high in fiber-con-
taining grain products, fruits, and 
vegetables with reduced risk of cancer 
may be made on the label or labeling of 
a food described in paragraph (c)(2)(ii) 
of this section, provided that: 
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