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Agricultural Marketing Service, USDA § 920.60 

(c) The committee shall, with the ap-
proval of the Secretary, prescribe such 
rules, regulations, and safeguards as it 
may deem necessary to prevent 
kiwifruit handled under the provisions 
of this section from entering the chan-
nels of trade for other than the specific 
purposes authorized by this section. 
Such rules, regulations, and safeguards 
may include the requirements that 
handlers shall file applications and re-
ceive approval from the committee for 
authorization to handle kiwifruit pur-
suant to this section, and that such ap-
plications be accompanied by a certifi-
cation by the intended purchaser or re-
ceiver that the kiwifruit will not be 
used for any purpose not authorized by 
this section. 

§ 920.55 Inspection and certification. 
(a) Whenever the handling of any va-

riety of kiwifruit is regulated pursuant 
to § 920.52, or § 920.53, each handler who 
handles kiwifruit shall, prior thereto, 
cause such kiwifruit to be inspected by 
the Federal or Federal-State Inspec-
tion Service and certified as meeting 
the applicable requirements of such 
regulation: Provided, That inspection 
and certification shall not be required 
for kiwifruit which previously have 
been so inspected and certified if such 
prior inspection was performed within 
such period as may be established pur-
suant to paragraph (b) of this section. 
Promptly after inspection and certifi-
cation, each such handler shall submit, 
or cause to be submitted, to the com-
mittee a copy of the certificate of in-
spection issued with respect to such 
kiwifruit. The committee may, with 
the approval of the Secretary, pre-
scribe rules and regulations waiving 
the inspection requirements of this sec-
tion where it is determined that in-
spection is not available: Provided, 
That all shipments made under such 
waiver shall comply with all regula-
tions in effect. 

(b) The committee may, with the ap-
proval of the Secretary, establish a pe-
riod prior to shipment during which 
the inspection required by this section 
must be performed. 

(c) The committee may enter into an 
agreement with the Federal and Fed-
eral-State Inspection Services with re-
spect to the costs of the inspection re-

quired by paragraph (a) of this section, 
and may collect from handlers their re-
spective pro rata shares of such costs. 

REPORTS 

§ 920.60 Reports. 
(a) Each handler shall furnish to the 

committee, at such times and for such 
periods as the committee may des-
ignate, certified reports covering, to 
the extent necessary for the committee 
to perform its functions, each shipment 
of kiwifruit as follows: 

(1) The name of the shipper and the 
shipping point; 

(2) The car or truck license number 
(or name of the trucker), and identi-
fication of the carrier; 

(3) The date and time of departure; 
(4) The number and type of con-

tainers in the shipment; 
(5) The quantities shipped, showing 

separately the variety, size and grade 
of the fruit; 

(6) The destination; 
(7) Identification of the inspection 

certificate or waiver pursuant to which 
the fruit was handled. 

(b) Upon request of the committee, 
made with the approval of the Sec-
retary, each handler shall furnish to 
the committee, in such manner and at 
such times as it may prescribe, such 
other information as may be necessary 
to enable the committee to perform its 
duties under this part. 

(c) Each handler shall maintain for 
at least two succeeding fiscal years, 
such records of the kiwifruit received 
and disposed of by such handler as may 
be necessary to verify the reports sub-
mitted to the committee pursuant to 
this section. 

(d) All reports and records submitted 
by handlers pursuant to the provisions 
of this section shall be received by, and 
at all times be in custody of, one or 
more designated employees of the com-
mittee. No such employee shall dis-
close to any person, other than the 
Secretary upon request therefor, data 
or information obtained or extracted 
from such reports and records which 
might affect the trade position, finan-
cial condition, or business operation of 
the particular handler from whom re-
ceived: Provided, That such data and in-
formation may be combined, and made 
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