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the representativeness of the sample 
from the time it is obtained or received 
by the agency or field office until it is 
discarded. High moisture samples, in-
fested samples, and other problem sam-
ples shall be retained according to the 
instructions. 

(4) Uniform system. To facilitate the 
use of file samples, agencies shall es-
tablish and maintain a uniform file 
sample system according to the in-
structions. 

(5) Forwarding samples. Upon request 
by the supervising field office or the 
Board of Appeals and Review, each 
agency shall furnish file samples (i) for 
field appeal or Board appeal inspection 
service, or (ii) for monitoring or super-
vision. If, at the request of the Service, 
an agency locates and forwards a file 
sample for an appeal inspection, the 
agency may, upon request, be reim-
bursed at the rate prescribed in § 800.71 
by the Service. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 0580–0011) 

§ 800.157 Official weighing records. 
(a) Scale ticket, scale tape, or other 

weight records. In addition to the offi-
cial certificate, the record for each 
Class X or Class Y weighing service 
shall consist of a scale ticket, a scale 
tape, or any other weight record pre-
scribed in the instructions. 

(b) Weighing logs. The record of a 
Class X or Class Y weighing service 
performed on bulk grain in a combined 
lot or bulk shiplot grain shall include 
the official weighing log as prescribed 
in the instructions. The original copy 
of each weighing log shall be retained 
by the field office or agency that per-
formed the weighing. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 0580–0011) 

§ 800.158 Equipment testing work 
records. 

The record for each official equip-
ment testing service or activity con-
sists of an official equipment testing 
report as prescribed in the instruc-
tions. Upon completion of each official 
equipment test, one or more copies of 
the completed testing report may, 
upon request, be issued to the owner or 
operator of the equipment. The testing 

report shall show the (a) date the test 
was performed, (b) name of the organi-
zation and personnel that performed 
the test, (c) names of the Service em-
ployees who monitored the testing, (d) 
identification of equipment that was 
tested, (e) results of the test, (f) names 
of any interested persons who were in-
formed of the test results, (g) number 
or other identification of the approval 
tag or label affixed to the equipment, 
and (h) other information required by 
the instructions. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 0580–0011) 

§ 800.159 Related official records. 

(a) Volume of work report. Field offices 
and agencies shall prepare periodic re-
ports showing the kind and the volume 
of inspection and weighing services 
that they performed. The report shall 
be prepared and copies shall be sub-
mitted to the Service according to the 
instructions. 

(b) Record of withdrawals and dismis-
sals. Field offices and agencies shall 
maintain a complete record of requests 
for official inspection or weighing serv-
ices that are withdrawn by the appli-
cant or that are conditionally withheld 
or dismissed. The record shall be pre-
pared and maintained according to the 
instructions. 

(c) Licensee record. Licensees, includ-
ing licensed warehouse samplers, shall 
(1) keep the license issued to them by 
the Service and (2) keep or have rea-
sonable access to a complete record of 
the Act, the standards, the regulations, 
and the instructions. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 0580–0011) 

OFFICIAL CERTIFICATES 

SOURCE: Sections 800.160 through 800.166 ap-
pear at 50 FR 45396, Oct. 31, 1985, unless oth-
erwise noted. 

§ 800.160 Official certificates; issuance 
and distribution. 

(a) Required issuance. An official cer-
tificate shall be issued for each inspec-
tion service and each weighing service 
except as provided §§ 800.84, 800.129, and 
800.139 and paragraph (b) of this sec-
tion. 
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(b) Distribution—(1) General—(i) Ex-
port. The original and at least three 
copies of each certificate will be dis-
tributed to the applicant or applicant’s 
order. One copy of each certificate 
shall be retained by the agency, field 
office, or Board of Appeals and Review. 

(ii) Nonexport. The original and at 
least one copy of each certificate will 
be distributed to the applicant or to 
the applicant’s order. In the case of in-
bound trucklot grain, one copy shall be 
delivered by the applicant to the per-
son who owned the grain at the time of 
delivery. One copy of each certificate 
shall be retained by the agency, field 
office, or Board of Appeals and Review. 

(iii) Local movements of shiplot grain. 
When shiplot grain is offered for in-
spection as a single lot and a portion of 
the lot is returned to the elevator, cer-
tificates representing the inspection 
service shall not be issued unless (A) 
requested by the applicant or (B) 
deemed necessary by official personnel. 

(2) Reinspection and appeal inspection 
services. In addition to the distribution 
requirements of paragraph (b) of this 
section, one copy of each reinspection 
or appeal inspection certificate shall be 
distributed to each interested person of 
record or the interested person’s order 
and to the agency or field office that 
issued the superseded certificate. 

(3) Additional copies. Additional cop-
ies of certificates will be furnished to 
the applicant or interested person upon 
request. Fees for extra copies may be 
assessed according to the fee schedules 
established by the agency or the Serv-
ice. 

(c) Prompt issuance. The results of the 
inspection or weighing service shall be 
reported to the applicant on the date 
the inspection or weighing service is 
completed. Certificates shall be issued 
as soon as possible, but no later than 
the close of business on the next busi-
ness day. Upon request of an agency or 
a field office, the requirements of this 
paragraph may be waived by the Serv-
ice when results have been reported be-
fore issuing the certificate. 

(d) Who may issue certificates—(1) Au-
thority. Certificates for inspection or 
Class X weighing services may be 
issued only be official personnel who 
are specifically licensed or authorized 
to perform and certify the results re-

ported on the certificate. Certificates 
for Class Y weighing services may be 
issued only by individuals who are li-
censed or authorized or are approved to 
perform and certify the results. 

(2) Exception. The person in the best 
position to know whether the service 
was performed in an approved manner 
and that the determinations are accu-
rate and true should issue the certifi-
cate. If the service is performed by one 
person, the certificate should be issued 
by that person. If the service is per-
formed by two or more persons, the 
certificate should be issued by the per-
son who made the majority of the de-
terminations or the person who makes 
the final determination. Supervisory 
personnel may issue a certificate when 
the individual is licensed or authorized 
to perform the service being certifi-
cated. 

(e) Name requirement. On export cer-
tificates, the typewritten name and 
signature of the individual issuing the 
certificate shall appear on the original 
and all copies. On all other certificates, 
the name or signature of the individual 
issuing the certificate shall appear on 
the original and all copies. Upon re-
quest by the applicant, the name and 
signature may be shown on all other 
certificates. 

(f) Authorization to affix names—(1) 
Requirements. The name or signature of 
official personnel may be affixed to of-
ficial certificates which are prepared 
from work records signed or initialed 
by the person whose name will be 
shown. An agent affixing the name and 
signature shall (i) be employed by the 
agency or Service; (ii) have been des-
ignated to affix names and signatures; 
and (iii) hold a power of attorney from 
the person whose name and signature 
will be affixed. The power of attorney 
shall be on file with the agency or 
Service. 

(2) Initialing. When a name or signa-
ture is affixed by an authorized agent, 
the initials of the agent shall appear 
directly below or following the signa-
ture of the person. 

(g) Advance information. Upon re-
quest, the contents of an official cer-
tificate may be furnished in advance to 
the applicant and any other interested 
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party, or to their order, and any addi-
tional expense shall be borne by the re-
questing party. 

(h) Certification after dismissal. An of-
ficial certificate cannot be issued for a 
service after the request has been with-
drawn or dismissed. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 0580–0011) 

[50 FR 45396, Oct. 31, 1985, as amended at 57 
FR 11428, Apr. 3, 1992] 

§ 800.161 Official certificate require-
ments. 

(a) General. Official certificates shall 
show the information and statements 
required by § 800.161 through § 800.165 
and the instructions. The Adminis-
trator shall approve any other informa-
tion and statements reported. Informa-
tion shall be reported in a uniform, ac-
curate, and concise manner, be in 
English, be typewritten or handwritten 
in ink, and be clearly legible. 

(b) Required format. Official certifi-
cates shall be uniform in size, shape, 
color, and format and conform to re-
quirements prescribed in the instruc-
tions. Upon request and for good cause, 
the Service may approve special design 
certificates. All information and state-
ments shall be shown on the front of 
the certificate, except that on domes-
tic grain certificates, (1) approved ab-
breviations for official factors and offi-
cial criteria, with their meanings, may 
be shown on the back and (2) the iden-
tification of carriers or containers in a 
combined-lot inspection may be shown 
on the back if ample space is not avail-
able on the front. When information is 
recorded on the back of the certificate, 
the statement ‘‘See reverse side’’ must 
be shown on the front. 

(c) Required information. Each official 
certificate shall show the following in-
formation in accordance with the in-
structions: (1) For an agency issuing 
export certificates or the Federal Grain 
Inspection Service, ‘‘United States De-
partment of Agriculture—Federal 
Grain Inspection Service;’’ (2) for a des-
ignated agency, the name of the agen-
cy, as applicable; (3) captions identi-
fying the kind of service; (4) a 
preprinted serial number and lettered 
prefix; (5) ‘‘original’’ or ‘‘copy,’’ as ap-
plicable; (6) ‘‘divided lot,’’ ‘‘duplicate,’’ 
or ‘‘corrected,’’ as applicable; (7) the 

identification of the carrier or con-
tainer; (8) the date the service was per-
formed; (9) the date and method of 
sampling; (10) the kind of movement 
and the level of service performed; (11) 
the grade and kind or ‘‘Not Standard-
ized Grain,’’ as applicable; (12) the re-
sults of the service performed; (13) the 
location of the issuing office; (14) the 
location of the grain when the service 
was performed; (15) a space for re-
marks; (16) whether a reinspection or 
appeal inspection service was based in 
whole or in part on file samples when 
file samples are used; (17) a statement 
reflecting the results of a stowage ex-
amination, when applicable; (18) seal 
records, when applicable; and (19) the 
name of the person issuing the certifi-
cate. 

(d) Required statements. Each official 
certificate shall include the following 
statements according to the instruc-
tions: (1) A statement that the certifi-
cate is issued under the authority of 
the United States Grain Standards Act; 
(2) a nonnegotiability statement; (3) a 
warning statement; and (4) a statement 
referencing the certificate number and 
date. Each official certificate for an of-
ficial sample-lot inspection service 
shall include a caption ‘‘U.S. Grain 
Standards Act’’ and a USDA-FGIS 
shield ghosted across the front. Each 
official certificate for a 
warehouseman’s sample-lot inspection, 
a submitted sample inspection, or Class 
Y weighing service shall include a 
statement that the certificate does not 
meet the requirements of section 5 of 
the Act of warehouseman’s sample-lot 
inspection, the word ‘‘QUALIFIED;’’ 
for submitted sample inspections, the 
words ‘‘Not Officially Sampled;’’ for 
Class Y weighing, the words ‘‘Class Y 
Weighing’’ screened across the front. 

(e) Permissive information and state-
ments—(1) Certificates. Information and 
statements requested by the applicant 
but not required by the regulations or 
instructions may be shown on the cer-
tificate if the information or state-
ments have been approved in the in-
structions or on a case-by-case basis by 
the Administrator. 

(2) Letterhead. Information and state-
ments requested by the applicant but 
not required by the regulations or in-
structions may be shown on letterhead 
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