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exchanges of views that do not effec-
tively predetermine official Corpora-
tion action on a particular matter. 

(f) Member means a current member 
of the Corporation’s Board of Direc-
tors. 

(g) Presiding Officer means the Chair-
person or, in the absence of the Chair-
person, the Vice Chairperson of the 
Board of Directors or other member au-
thorized to act in this capacity by the 
Board. 

(h) Quorum means the number of 
Members authorized to conduct Cor-
poration business pursuant to the 
Board’s bylaws. 

§ 2505.3 To what extent are meetings 
of the Board open to the public? 

The Board shall conduct meetings, as 
defined in § 2505.2, in accordance with 
this part. Except as provided in § 2505.4, 
the Board’s meetings shall be open to 
the public. The public is invited to at-
tend all meetings of the Board that are 
open to the public but may not partici-
pate in the Board’s deliberations at 
such meetings or record any meeting 
by means of electronic, photographic, 
or other device. 

§ 2505.4 On what grounds may the 
Board close a meeting or withhold 
information? 

The Board may close a meeting or 
withhold information that otherwise 
would be required to be disclosed under 
§§ 2505.5, 2505.6 and 2505.7 if it properly 
determines that an open meeting or 
disclosure is likely to— 

(a) Disclose matters that are— 
(1) Specifically authorized under cri-

teria established by an Executive order 
to be kept secret in the interests of na-
tional defense or foreign policy; and 

(2) In fact properly classified pursu-
ant to such Executive order; 

(b) Relate solely to the internal per-
sonnel rules and practices of the Cor-
poration; 

(c) Disclose matters specifically ex-
empted from disclosure by statute 
(other than 5 U.S.C. 552), provided that 
such statute— 

(1) Requires that the matters be 
withheld from the public in such a 
manner as to leave no discretion on the 
issue; or 

(2) Establishes particular criteria for 
withholding or refers to particular 
types of matters to be withheld; 

(d) Disclose trade secrets and com-
mercial or financial information ob-
tained from a person and privileged or 
confidential; 

(e) Involve accusing any person of a 
crime, or formally censuring any per-
son; 

(f) Disclose information of a personal 
nature where disclosure would con-
stitute a clearly unwarranted invasion 
of personal privacy; 

(g) Disclose investigatory records 
compiled for law enforcement purposes, 
or information which, if written, would 
be contained in such records, but only 
to the extent that the production of 
such records or information would— 

(1) Interfere with enforcement pro-
ceedings; 

(2) Deprive a person of a right to a 
fair trial or an impartial adjudication; 

(3) Constitute an unwarranted inva-
sion of personal privacy; 

(4) Disclose the identity of a con-
fidential source and, in the case of a 
record compiled by a criminal law en-
forcement authority in the course of a 
criminal investigation, or by an agency 
conducting a lawful national security 
intelligence investigation, confidential 
information furnished only by the con-
fidential source; 

(5) Disclose investigative techniques 
and procedures; or 

(6) Endanger the life or physical safe-
ty of law enforcement personnel; 

(h) Disclose information contained in 
or related to examination, operating or 
condition reports prepared by, on be-
half of, or for the use of an agency re-
sponsible for the regulation or super-
vision of financial institution; 

(i) Disclose information the pre-
mature disclosure of which would be 
likely to significantly frustrate imple-
mentation of a proposed action of the 
Corporation, except that this provision 
shall not apply in any instance where 
the Corporation has already disclosed 
to the public the content or nature of 
its proposed action, or where the Cor-
poration is required by law to make 
such disclosure on its own initiative 
prior to taking final action; or 

(j) Specifically concerning the Cor-
poration’s issuance of a subpoena or 
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the Corporation’s participation in a 
civil action or proceeding, an action in 
a foreign court or international tri-
bunal, or an arbitration, or the initi-
ation, conduct, or disposition by the 
Corporation of a particular case of for-
mal adjudication pursuant to the pro-
cedures in 5 U.S.C. 554 or otherwise in-
volving a determination on the record 
after opportunity for a hearing. 

§ 2505.5 What are the procedures for 
closing a meeting, withholding in-
formation, and responding to re-
quests by affected persons to close 
a meeting? 

(a) The Board may vote to close a 
meeting or withhold information per-
taining to a meeting. Such action may 
be taken only when a majority of the 
entire membership of the Board votes 
to take such action. A separate vote 
shall be taken with respect to each ac-
tion under § 2505.4. The Board may act 
by taking a single vote with respect to 
a series of meetings which are proposed 
to be closed to the public, or with re-
spect to any information concerning a 
series of meetings, so long as each 
meeting in the series involves the same 
particular matters and is scheduled to 
be held no more than thirty days after 
the initial meeting in the series. Each 
Member’s vote under this paragraph 
shall be recorded and no proxies shall 
be allowed. 

(b) If your interests may be directly 
affected if a meeting is open you may 
request that the Board close the meet-
ing on one of the grounds referred to in 
§ 2505.4(e), (f), or (g). You should submit 
your request to the Office of the Gen-
eral Counsel, Corporation for National 
and Community Service, 1201 New York 
Avenue NW, Washington, D.C. 20525. 
The Board shall, upon the request of 
any one of its members, determine by 
recorded vote whether to grant your 
request. 

(c) Within one working day of any 
vote taken pursuant to this section, 
the Board shall make publicly avail-
able a written copy of such vote re-
flecting the vote of each Member on 
the question. If a meeting is to be 
closed to the public, the Board shall, 
within one working day, make avail-
able a full written explanation of its 
action closing the meeting and a list of 

all persons expected to attend the 
meeting and their affiliation. 

(d) For each closed meeting, the Gen-
eral Counsel shall publicly certify that, 
in his or her opinion, the meeting may 
be closed to the public and shall state 
each relevant exemption relied upon. A 
copy of the certification shall be avail-
able for public inspection. 

(e) For each closed meeting, the 
Board shall issue a statement setting 
forth the time, place, and persons 
present. A copy of such statement shall 
be available for public inspection. 

(f)(1) For each closed meeting, with 
the exception of a meeting closed pur-
suant to § 2505.4(h) or (j), the Board 
shall maintain a complete transcript or 
electronic recording adequate to record 
fully the proceedings of each meeting. 

(2) For meetings that are closed pur-
suant to § 2505.4(h) or (j), the Board 
may maintain a set of minutes in lieu 
of a transcript or recording. Such min-
utes shall fully and clearly describe all 
matters discussed and shall provide a 
full and accurate summary of any ac-
tions taken, and the reasons therefor, 
including a description of each of the 
views expressed on any item and the 
record of any vote. All documents con-
sidered in connection with any action 
shall be identified in such minutes. 

(3) The Corporation shall make 
promptly available to the public, in a 
place easily accessible to the public, 
the transcript, electronic recording, or 
minutes of the discussion of any item 
on the agenda, or of any item of the 
testimony of any witness received at 
the meeting, except for such item or 
items of such discussion or testimony 
as the Corporation determines to con-
tain information which may be prop-
erly withheld. Copies of such tran-
script, or minutes, or a transcription of 
such recording disclosing the identity 
of each speaker, shall be furnished to 
any person at the actual cost of dupli-
cation or transcription. The Corpora-
tion shall maintain the transcript, re-
cording, or minutes for each closed 
meeting for at least two years or at 
least one year after the conclusion of 
any Corporation business acted upon at 
the meeting, whichever occurs later. 
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