
97 

Office of the Secretary, Education § 35.6 

In addition, the claimant may be re-
quired to submit to a physical or men-
tal examination by a physician em-
ployed or designated by the Depart-
ment. A copy of the report of the exam-
ining physician shall be made available 
to the claimant upon the claimant’s 
written request provided that claimant 
has, upon request, furnished the report 
referred to in the first sentence of this 
paragraph and has made or agrees to 
make available to the Department any 
other physician’s reports previously or 
thereafter made of the physical or 
mental condition which is the subject 
matter of his claim. 

(2) Itemized bills for medical, dental, 
and hospital expenses incurred, or 
itemized receipts of payment for such 
expenses. 

(3) If the prognosis reveals the neces-
sity for future treatment, a statement 
of expected duration of and expenses 
for such treatment. 

(4) If a claim is made for loss of time 
from employment, a written statement 
from his employer showing actual time 
lost from employment, whether he is a 
full or part-time employee, and wages 
or salary actually lost. 

(5) If a claim is made for loss of in-
come and the claimant is self-em-
ployed, documentary evidence showing 
the amount of earnings actually lost. 

(6) Any other evidence or information 
which may have a bearing on either the 
responsibility of the United States for 
the personal injury or the damages 
claimed. 

(c) Property damage. In support of a 
claim for damage to or loss of property, 
real or personal, the claimant may be 
required to submit the following evi-
dence or information: 

(1) Proof of ownership. 
(2) A detailed statement of the 

amount claimed with respect to each 
item of property. 

(3) An itemized receipt of payment 
for necessary repairs or itemized writ-
ten estimates of the cost of such re-
pairs. 

(4) A statement listing date of pur-
chase, purchase price, market value of 
the property as of date of damage, and 
salvage value, where repair is not eco-
nomical. 

(5) Any other evidence or information 
which may have a bearing either on the 

responsibility of the United States for 
the injury to or loss of property or the 
damages claimed. 

(d) Time limit. All evidence required 
to be submitted by this section shall be 
furnished by the claimant within a rea-
sonable time. Failure of a claimant to 
furnish evidence necessary to a deter-
mination of his claim within three 
months after a request therefor has 
been mailed to his last known address 
may be deemed an abandonment of the 
claim. The claim may be thereupon 
disallowed. 

§ 35.5 Investigation of claims. 
When a claim is received, the Depart-

ment will make such investigation as 
may be necessary or appropriate for a 
determination of the validity of the 
claim. 

§ 35.6 Final denial of claim. 
(a) Final denial of an administrative 

claim shall be in writing and sent to 
the claimant, his attorney, or legal 
representative by certified or reg-
istered mail. The notification of final 
denial may include a statement of the 
reasons for the denial and shall include 
a statement that, if the claimant is 
dissatisfied with the Department’s ac-
tion, he may file suit in an appropriate 
U.S. District Court not later than 6 
months after the date of mailing of the 
notification. 

(b) Prior to the commencement of 
suit and prior to the expiration of the 
6-month period after the date of mail-
ing, by certified or registered mail of 
notice of final denial of the claim as 
provided in 28 U.S.C. 2401(b), a claim-
ant, his duly authorized agent, or legal 
representative, may file a written re-
quest with the Department for recon-
sideration of a final denial of a claim 
under paragraph (a) of this section. 
Upon the timely filing of a request for 
reconsideration the Department shall 
have 6 months from the date of filing 
in which to make a final disposition of 
the claim and the claimant’s option 
under 28 U.S.C. 2675(a) to bring suit 
shall not accrue until 6 months after 
the filing of a request for reconsider-
ation. Final Department action on a 
request for reconsideration shall be ef-
fected in accordance with the provi-
sions of paragraph (a) of this section. 
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