
39 

Farm Credit Administration § 608.821 

§ 608.813 Contracting for collection 
services. 

The Chairman, or designee of the 
Chairman, may contract for collection 
services in accordance with 31 U.S.C. 
3718 and 4 CFR 102.6 to recover debts. 

§ 608.814 Reporting of credit informa-
tion. 

The Chairman, or designee of the 
Chairman, may disclose to a consumer 
reporting agency information that an 
individual is responsible for a debt 
owed to the United States. Information 
will be disclosed to reporting agencies 
in accordance with the terms and con-
ditions of agreements entered into be-
tween the FCA and the reporting agen-
cies. The terms and conditions of such 
agreements shall specify that all of the 
rights and protection afforded to the 
debtor under 31 U.S.C. 3711(f) have been 
fulfilled. The FCA shall notify each 
consumer reporting agency, to which a 
claim was disclosed, when the debt has 
been satisfied. 

§ 608.815 Credit report. 
In order to aid the FCA in making 

appropriate determinations regarding 
the collection and compromise of 
claims; the collection of charges for in-
terest, administrative costs, and pen-
alties; the use of administrative offset; 
the use of other collection methods; 
and the likelihood of collecting the 
claim, the FCA may institute, con-
sistent with the provisions of the Fair 
Credit Reporting Act (15 U.S.C. 1681, et 
seq.), a credit investigation of the debt-
or immediately following a determina-
tion that the claim exists. 

Subpart B—Administrative Offset 

§ 608.820 Applicability. 
(a) The provisions of this subpart 

shall apply to the collection of debts by 
administrative [or salary] offset under 
31 U.S.C. 3716, 5 U.S.C. 5514, or other 
statutory or common law. 

(b) Offset shall not be used to collect 
a debt more than 10 years after the 
Government’s right to collect the debt 
first accrued, unless facts material to 
the Government’s right to collect the 
debt were not known and could not rea-
sonably have been known by the offi-

cial or officials of the Government who 
were charged with the responsibility of 
discovering and collecting such debt. 

(c) Offset shall not be used with re-
spect to: 

(1) Debts owed by other agencies of 
the United States or by any State or 
local government; 

(2) Debts arising under or payments 
made under the Social Security Act, 
the Internal Revenue Code of 1986, as 
amended, or tariff laws of the United 
States; or 

(3) Any case in which collection by 
offset of the type of debt involved is ex-
plicitly provided for or prohibited by 
another statute. 

(d) Unless otherwise provided by con-
tract or law, debts or payments which 
are not subject to offset under 31 U.S.C. 
3716 or 5 U.S.C. 5514 may be collected 
by offset if such collection is author-
ized under common law or other appli-
cable statutory authority. 

§ 608.821 Collection by offset. 
(a) Collection of a debt by adminis-

trative [or salary] offset shall be ac-
complished in accordance with the pro-
visions of these regulations, of 4 CFR 
102.3, and 5 CFR part 550, subpart K. It 
is not necessary for the debt to be re-
duced to judgment or to be undisputed 
for offset to be used. 

(b) The Chairman, or designee of the 
Chairman, may determine that it is 
feasible to collect a debt to the United 
States by offset against funds payable 
to the debtor. 

(c) The feasibility of collecting a debt 
by offset will be determined on a case- 
by-case basis. This determination shall 
be made by considering all relevant 
factors, including the following: 

(1) The degree to which the offset can 
be accomplished in accordance with 
law. This determination should take 
into consideration relevant statutory, 
regulatory, and contractual require-
ments; 

(2) The degree to which the FCA is 
certain that its determination of the 
existence and amount of the debt is 
correct; 

(3) The practicality of collecting the 
debt by offset. The cost, in time and 
money, of collecting the debt by offset 
and the amount of money which can 
reasonably be expected to be recovered 
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