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2 A bank’s business may include two or 
more of the general classifications. 

physical, electronic, and procedural safe-
guards that comply with federal standards to 
guard your nonpublic personal information. 

PART 333—EXTENSION OF 
CORPORATE POWERS 

REGULATIONS 

Sec. 
333.1 Classification of general character of 

business. 
333.2 Change in general character of busi-

ness. 
333.4 Conversions from mutual to stock 

form. 

INTERPRETATIONS 

333.101 Prior consent not required. 

AUTHORITY: 12 U.S.C. 1816, 1818, 1819 (‘‘Sev-
enth’’, ‘‘Eighth’’ and ‘‘Tenth’’), 1828, 1828(m), 
1831p–1(c). 

REGULATIONS 

§ 333.1 Classification of general char-
acter of business. 

State nonmember insured banks are 
divided into five categories for the pur-
pose of classifying their general char-
acter or type of business,2 viz: commer-
cial banks, banks and trust companies, 
savings banks (including mutual and 
stock), industrial banks, and cash de-
positories. 

[15 FR 8644, Dec. 6, 1950] 

§ 333.2 Change in general character of 
business. 

No State nonmember insured bank 
(except a District bank) or branch 
thereof shall hereafter cause or permit 
any change to be made in the general 
character or type of business exercised 
by it after the effective date of this 
part without the prior written consent 
of the Corporation. 

[15 FR 8644, Dec. 6, 1950] 

§ 333.4 Conversions from mutual to 
stock form. 

(a) Scope. This section applies to the 
conversion of insured mutual state sav-
ings banks to the stock form of owner-
ship. It supplements the procedural and 
other requirements for such conver-
sions in subpart I of part 303 of this 

chapter. This section also applies, to 
the extent appropriate, to the reorga-
nization of insured mutual state sav-
ings banks to the mutual holding com-
pany form of ownership. As determined 
by the Board of Directors of the FDIC 
on a case-by-case basis, the require-
ments of paragraphs (d), (e), and (f) of 
this section do not apply to mutual-to- 
stock conversions of insured mutual 
state savings banks whose capital cat-
egory under § 325.103 of this chapter is 
‘‘undercapitalized’’, ‘‘significantly 
undercapitalized’’ or ‘‘critically under-
capitalized’’. As provided in § 303.162 of 
this chapter, the Board of Directors of 
the FDIC may grant a waiver in writ-
ing from any requirement of this sec-
tion for good cause shown. 

(b) Definition of Eligible Depositor. For 
purposes of this section, eligible deposi-
tors are depositors holding qualifying 
deposits at the bank as of a date des-
ignated in the bank’s plan of conver-
sion that is not less than one year prior 
to the date of adoption of the plan of 
conversion by the converting bank’s 
board of directors/trustees. 

(c) Requirements. In addition to other 
requirements that may be imposed by 
the applicable state statutes and regu-
lations and other federal statutes and 
regulations, including subpart I of part 
303 of this chapter, an insured mutual 
state savings bank shall not convert to 
the stock form of ownership unless the 
following requirements are satisfied: 

(1) Eligible depositors shall have 
higher subscription rights than em-
ployee stock ownership plans; 

(2) The proposed conversion shall be 
approved by a vote of at least a major-
ity of the bank’s depositors and, as rea-
sonably determined by the bank’s di-
rectors or trustees, other stakeholders 
of the bank who are entitled to vote on 
the conversion, unless the applicable 
state law requires a higher percentage, 
in which case the higher percentage 
shall be used. Voting may be in person 
or by proxy; and 

(3) Management shall not use proxies 
executed outside the context of the 
proposed conversion to satisfy the vot-
ing requirement imposed in the pre-
vious paragraph. 

(d) Restriction on repurchase of stock. 
An insured mutual state savings bank 
that has converted from the mutual to 
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