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(6) FNS will select the winning bid-
der(s). The winning bidder(s) will be
the responsive and responsible bid-
der(s) meeting the specifications and
all bid terms and conditions which of-
fers the lowest net price weighted to
take into account infant formula usage
rates and infant participation. In all
instances the winning bidder(s) will be
those which singly or in combination
yield the greatest aggregate savings
based on the net price weighted to take
into account the infant formula usage
rates. To break a tie between 2 equally
low bids, FNS will select the bidder to
be awarded the infant formula cost
containment contract by a drawing by
lot limited to the bidders which sub-
mitted those bids.

(7) Once FNS has conducted bid selec-
tion, a State agency may decline to
award the infant formula cost contain-
ment contract(s) only if the State
agency determines that awarding the
contract(s) would not be in the best in-
terests of its Program, taking into ac-
count whether the national bid solici-
tation and selection would achieve a
lower aggregate savings.

(8) As soon as practicable after se-
lecting the winning bid(s), FNS will no-
tify the affected State agencies in writ-
ing of the bid results, including the
name(s) of the winning bidder(s). If a
State agency chooses to request ap-
proval to decline to award the infant
formula cost containment contract(s)
in accordance with paragraph (k)(7) of
this section, it must notify FNS in
writing, signed by a responsible State
agency official, together with sup-
porting documentation, by certified
mail, return receipt requested or by
hand delivery with evidence of receipt
within 10 days of the State agency’s re-
ceipt of this notification of bid results.

(9) If FNS approves any State agen-
cy’s request to decline to award the in-
fant formula cost containment con-
tract(s) in accordance with paragraphs
(k)(7) and (k)(8) of this section, FNS
will notify the bidders of the decision.
If two or more State agencies remain
in the group, FNS will require the bid-
ders to indicate in writing whether
they wish to withdraw or modify their
bids within 5 days of receipt of this no-
tification. FNS will again permit State
agencies to decline to award the infant

formula cost containment contract(s)
in accordance with paragraphs (k)(7)
and (k)(8) of this section. If FNS ap-
proves these additional State agency
requests to decline contract awards,
FNS may conduct a resolicitation of
bids in accordance with this paragraph
(k).

[65 FR 51224, Aug. 23, 2000]

§ 246.17 Closeout procedures.
(a) General. State agencies shall sub-

mit preliminary and final closeout re-
ports for each fiscal year. All obliga-
tions shall be liquidated before closure
of a fiscal year grant. Obligations shall
be reported for the fiscal year in which
they occur.

(b) Fiscal year closeout reports. State
agencies—

(1) Shall submit to FNS, within 30
days after the end of the fiscal year,
preliminary financial reports which
show cumulative actual expenditures
and obligations for the fiscal year, or
part thereof, for which Program funds
were made available;

(2) Shall submit to FNS, within 150
days after the end of the fiscal year,
final fiscal year closeout reports;

(3) May submit revised closeout re-
ports. FNS will reimburse State agen-
cies for additional costs claimed in a
revised closeout report up to the
State’s original grant level, if costs are
properly justified and if funds are
available for the fiscal year pertaining
to the request. FNS will not be respon-
sible for reimbursing State agencies for
unreported expenditures later than one
year after the end of the fiscal year in
which they were incurred.

(c) Grant closeout procedures. When
grants to State agencies are termi-
nated, the following procedures shall
be performed in accordance with 7 CFR
part 3016.

(1) FNS may disqualify a State agen-
cy’s participation under the Program,
in whole or in part, or take such rem-
edies as may be legal and appropriate,
whenever FNS determines that the
State agency failed to comply with the
conditions prescribed in this part, in
its Federal-State Agreement, or in
FNS guidelines and instructions. FNS
will promptly notify the State agency
in writing of the disqualification to-
gether with the effective date. A State
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agency shall disqualify a local agency
by written notice whenever it is deter-
mined by FNS or the State agency that
the local agency has failed to comply
with the requirements of the Program.

(2) FNS or the State agency may dis-
qualify the State agency or restrict its
participation in the Program when
both parties agree that continuation
under the Program would not produce
beneficial results commensurate with
the further expenditure of funds. The
State agency or the local agency may
disqualify the local agency or restrict
its participation in the Program under
the same conditions. The two parties
shall agree upon the conditions of dis-
qualification, including the effective
date thereof, and, in the case of partial
disqualification, the portion to be dis-
qualified.

(3) Upon termination of a grant, the
affected agency shall not incur new ob-
ligations for the disqualified portion
after the effective date, and shall can-
cel as many outstanding obligations as
possible. FNS will allow full credit to
the State agency for the Federal share
of the noncancellable obligations prop-
erly incurred by the State agency prior
to disqualification, and the State agen-
cy shall do the same for the local agen-
cy.

(4) A grant closeout shall not affect
the retention period for, or Federal
rights of access to, grant records as
specified in § 246.25. The closeout of a
grant does not affect the State or local
agency’s responsibilities regarding
property or with respect to any Pro-
gram income for which the State or
local agency is still accountable.

(5) A final audit is not a required part
of the grant closeout and should not be
needed unless there are problems with
the grant that require attention. If
FNS considers a final audit to be nec-
essary, it shall so inform OIG. OIG will
be resonsible for ensuring that nec-
essary final audits are performed and
for any necessary coordination with
other Federal cognizant audit agencies
or the State or local auditors. Audits
performed in accordance with § 246.20
may serve as final audits providing
such audits meet the needs of request-
ing agencies. If the grant is closed out
without the audit, FNS reserves the
right to disallow and recover an appro-

priate amount after fully considering
any recommended disallowances re-
sulting from an audit which may be
conducted later.

§ 246.18 Administrative appeal of State
agency decisions.

(a) Requirements. The State agency
shall provide a hearing procedure
whereby a food vendor or local agency
adversely affected by a State or local
agency action may appeal the action.

(1) The right of appeal shall be grant-
ed when a local agency’s or a vendor’s
application to participate is denied or,
during the course of the contract or
agreement, when a local agency or ven-
dor is disqualified or any other adverse
action which affects participation is
taken. The following are exceptions to
this provision:

(i) Expiration of a contract or agree-
ment with a vendor and the State
agency’s determination regarding par-
ticipant access shall not be subject to
administrative review; and

(ii) Disqualification of a vendor as a
result of disqualification from the
Food Stamp Program shall not be sub-
ject to administrative or judicial re-
view.

(2) The adverse action affecting a
participating local agency shall be
postponed until a hearing decision is
reached.

(3) Except for disqualifications as-
sessed under § 246.12(k)(1)(i), which
shall be made effective on the date of
receipt of the notice of administrative
action, the State agency may take ad-
verse action against a vendor after the
15-day advance notification period
mandated by paragraph (b)(1) of this
section has elapsed. In deciding wheth-
er or not to postpone adverse action
until a hearing decision is rendered,
the State agency shall consider wheth-
er participants would be unduly incon-
venienced and may consider other rel-
evant criteria, determined by the State
agency.

(b) Procedure. The State agency hear-
ing procedure shall at a minimum pro-
vide the local agency or vendor with
the following:

(1) Written notification of the admin-
istrative action, the procedures to file
for an administrative review, if any,
the cause(s) for and the effective date
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