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These fiscal and administrative re-
quirements must be sufficiently spe-
cific to ensure that: funds are used in 
compliance with all applicable Federal 
statutory and regulatory provisions, 
costs are reasonable and necessary for 
operating these programs, and funds 
are not be used for general expenses re-
quired to carry out other responsibil-
ities of a State or its subrecipients. 

PROPERTY STANDARDS 

§ 215.30 Purpose of property stand-
ards. 

Sections 215.31 through 215.37 set 
forth uniform standards governing 
management and disposition of prop-
erty furnished by the Federal Govern-
ment whose cost was charged to a 
project supported by a Federal award. 
Federal awarding agencies shall re-
quire recipients to observe these stand-
ards under awards and shall not impose 
additional requirements, unless specifi-
cally required by Federal statute. The 
recipient may use its own property 
management standards and procedures 
provided it observes the provisions of 
§ 215.31 through § 215.37. 

§ 215.31 Insurance coverage. 

Recipients shall, at a minimum, pro-
vide the equivalent insurance coverage 
for real property and equipment ac-
quired with Federal funds as provided 
to property owned by the recipient. 
Federally-owned property need not be 
insured unless required by the terms 
and conditions of the award. 

§ 215.32 Real property. 

Each Federal awarding agency shall 
prescribe requirements for recipients 
concerning the use and disposition of 
real property acquired in whole or in 
part under awards. Unless otherwise 
provided by statute, such require-
ments, at a minimum, shall contain 
the following. 

(a) Title to real property shall vest in 
the recipient subject to the condition 
that the recipient shall use the real 
property for the authorized purpose of 
the project as long as it is needed and 
shall not encumber the property with-
out approval of the Federal awarding 
agency. 

(b) The recipient shall obtain written 
approval by the Federal awarding agen-
cy for the use of real property in other 
federally-sponsored projects when the 
recipient determines that the property 
is no longer needed for the purpose of 
the original project. Use in other 
projects shall be limited to those under 
federally-sponsored projects (i.e., 
awards) or programs that have pur-
poses consistent with those authorized 
for support by the Federal awarding 
agency. 

(c) When the real property is no 
longer needed as provided in para-
graphs (a) and (b) of this section, the 
recipient shall request disposition in-
structions from the Federal awarding 
agency or its successor Federal award-
ing agency. The Federal awarding 
agency shall observe one or more of the 
following disposition instructions. 

(1) The recipient may be permitted to 
retain title without further obligation 
to the Federal Government after it 
compensates the Federal Government 
for that percentage of the current fair 
market value of the property attrib-
utable to the Federal participation in 
the project. 

(2) The recipient may be directed to 
sell the property under guidelines pro-
vided by the Federal awarding agency 
and pay the Federal Government for 
that percentage of the current fair 
market value of the property attrib-
utable to the Federal participation in 
the project (after deducting actual and 
reasonable selling and fix-up expenses, 
if any, from the sales proceeds). When 
the recipient is authorized or required 
to sell the property, proper sales proce-
dures shall be established that provide 
for competition to the extent prac-
ticable and result in the highest pos-
sible return. 

(3) The recipient may be directed to 
transfer title to the property to the 
Federal Government or to an eligible 
third party provided that, in such 
cases, the recipient shall be entitled to 
compensation for its attributable per-
centage of the current fair market 
value of the property. 

§ 215.33 Federally-owned and exempt 
property. 

(a) Federally-owned property. (1) Title 
to federally-owned property remains 
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