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(b) The application must provide as-
surance that the State will: 

(1) Require that every applicant re-
quired to formulate an EEOP in ac-
cordance with 28 CFR 42.201 et seq., sub-
mit a certification to the State that it 
has a current EEOP on file, which 
meets the requirement therein; 

(2) Require that every criminal or ju-
venile justice agency applying for a 
grant of $500,000 or more submit a copy 
of its EEOP (if required to maintain 
one under 28 CFR 42.301, et seq.) to 
OCRC at the time it submits its appli-
cation to the State; 

(3) Inform the public and subgrantees 
of affected persons’ rights to file a 
complaint of discrimination with 
OCRC for investigation; 

(4) Cooperate with OCRC during com-
pliance reviews of recipients located 
within the State; and 

(5) Comply, and that its subgrantees 
and contractors will comply with the 
requirement that, in the event that a 
Federal or State court or administra-
tive agency makes a finding of dis-
crimination of the basis of race, color, 
religion, national origin, or sex (after a 
due process hearing) against a State or 
a subgrantee or contractor, the af-
fected recipient or contractor will for-
ward a copy of the finding to OCRC. 

§ 31.203 Open meetings and public ac-
cess to records. 

The State must assure that the State 
agency, its supervisory board estab-
lished pursuant to section 299(c) and 
the State advisory group established 
pursuant to section 223(a)(3) will follow 
applicable State open meeting and pub-
lic access laws and regulations in the 
conduct of meetings and the mainte-
nance of records relating to their func-
tions. 

JUVENILE JUSTICE ACT REQUIREMENTS 

§ 31.300 General. 
This subpart sets forth specific JJDP 

Act requirements for application and 
receipt of formula grants. 

[60 FR 28440, May 31, 1995, as amended at 64 
FR 19676, Apr. 21, 1999] 

§ 31.301 Funding. 
(a) Allocation to States. Funds shall be 

allocated annually among the States 

on the basis of relative population of 
persons under age eighteen. If the 
amount allocated for Title II (other 
than parts D and E) of the JJDP Act is 
less than $75 million, the amount allo-
cated to each State will not be less 
than $325,000, nor more than $400,000, 
provided that no State receives less 
than its allocation for FY 1992. The ter-
ritories will receive not less than 
$75,000 or more than $100,000. If the 
amount appropriated for Title II (other 
than parts D and E) is $75 million or 
more, the amount allocated for each 
State will be not less than $400,000, nor 
more than $600,000, provided that parts 
D and E have been funded in the full 
amounts authorized. For the Terri-
tories, the amount is fixed at $100,000. 
For each of FY’s 1994 and 1995, the min-
imum allocation is established at 
$600,000 for States and $100,000 for Ter-
ritories. 

(b) Funds for local use. At least two- 
thirds of the formula grant application 
to the state (other than the section 
222(d) State Advisory Group set aside) 
must be used for programs by local 
government, local private agencies, 
and eligible Indian tribes, unless the 
State applies for and is granted a waiv-
er by the OJJDP. The proportion of 
pass-through funds to be made avail-
able to eligible Indian tribes shall be 
based upon that proportion of the state 
youth population under 18 years of age 
who reside in geographical areas where 
the tribes perform law enforcement 
functions. Pursuant to section 
223(a)(5)(C) of the JJDP Act, each of 
the standards set forth in paragraphs 
(b)(1)(i) through (iii) of this section 
must be met in order to establish the 
eligibility of Indian tribes to receive 
pass through funds: 

(1)(i) The tribal entity must be recog-
nized by the Secretary of the Interior 
as an Indian tribe that performs law 
enforcement functions as defined in 
paragraph (b) (2) of this section. 

(ii) The tribal entity must agree to 
attempt to comply with the require-
ments of section 223(a)(12)(A), (13), and 
(14) of the JJDP Act; and 

(iii) The tribal entity must identify 
the juvenile justice needs to be served 
by these funds within the geographical 
area where the tribe performs law en-
forcement functions. 
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(2) Law enforcement functions are 
deemed to include those activities per-
taining to the custody of children, in-
cluding, but not limited to, police ef-
forts to prevent, control, or reduce 
crime and delinquency or to apprehend 
criminal and delinquent offenders, and/ 
or activities of adult and juvenile cor-
rections, probation, or parole authori-
ties. 

(3) To carry out this requirement, 
OJJDP will annually provide each 
state with the most recent Bureau of 
Census statistics on the number of per-
sons under age 18 living within the 
state, and the number of persons under 
age 18 who reside in geographical areas 
where Indian tribes perform law en-
forcement functions. 

(4) Pass-through funds available to 
tribal entities under section 223(a)(5)(C) 
shall be made available within states 
to Indian tribes, combinations of In-
dian tribes, or to an organization or or-
ganizations designated by such tribe(s), 
that meet the standards set forth in 
paragraphs (b)(1)(i)–(iii) of this section. 
Where the relative number of persons 
under age 18 within a geographic area 
where an Indian tribe performs law en-
forcement functions is too small to 
warrant an individual subgrant or sub-
grants, the state may, after consulta-
tion with the eligible tribe(s), make 
pass-through funds available to a com-
bination of eligible tribes within the 
state, or to an organization or organi-
zations designated by and representing 
a group of qualifying tribes, or target 
the funds on the larger tribal jurisdic-
tions within the state. 

(5) Consistent with section 223(a)(4) of 
the JJDP Act, the state must provide 
for consultation with Indian tribes or a 
combination of eligible tribes within 
the state, or an organization or organi-
zations designated by qualifying tribes, 
in the development of a state plan 
which adequately takes into account 
the juvenile justice needs and requests 
of those Indian tribes within the state. 

(c) Match. Formula grants under the 
JJDP Act shall be 100% of approved 
costs, with the exception of planning 
and administration funds, which re-
quire a 100 percent cash match (dollar 
for dollar), and construction projects 
funded under section 299C(a)(2) which 
also require a 100 percent cash match. 

(d) Funds for administration. Not more 
than ten percent of the total annual 
Formula Grant award may be utilized 
to develop the annual juvenile justice 
plan and pay for administrative ex-
penses, including project monitoring. 
These funds are to be matched on a dol-
lar for dollar basis. The State shall 
make available needed funds for plan-
ning and administration to units of 
local government on an equitable basis. 
Each annual application must identify 
uses of such funds. 

(e) Nonparticipating States. Pursuant 
to section 223(d), the OJJDP Adminis-
trator shall endeavor to make the fund 
allotment under section 222(a), of a 
State which chooses not to participate 
or loses its eligibility to participate in 
the formula grant program, directly 
available to local public and private 
nonprofit agencies within the non-
participating State. The funds may be 
used only for the purpose(s) of achiev-
ing deinstitutionalization of status of-
fenders and nonoffenders, separation of 
juveniles from incarcerated adults, re-
moval of juveniles from adult jails and 
lockups, and reducing the dispropor-
tionate confinement of minority youth 
in secure facilities. Absent a request 
for extension which demonstrates com-
pelling circumstances justifying the re-
allocation of formula grant funds back 
to the State to which the funds were 
initially allocated, or the proceedings 
under section 223(d), formula grant 
funds allocated to a State which has 
failed to submit an application, plan, 
or monitoring data establishing its eli-
gibility for the funds will, beginning 
with FY 1995 be reallocated to the non-
participating State program on Sep-
tember 30 of the fiscal year for which 
the funds were appropriated. Reallo-
cated funds will be competitively 
awarded to eligible recipients pursuant 
to program announcements published 
in the FEDERAL REGISTER. 

§ 31.302 Applicant State agency. 

(a) Pursuant to section 223(a)(1), sec-
tion 223(a)(2) and section 299(c) of the 
JJDP Act, the State must assure that 
the State agency approved under sec-
tion 299(c) has been designated as the 
sole agency for supervising the prepa-
ration and administration of the plan 
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