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to be drawn for examination of the 
shafting and stern bearing of a vessel 
whenever the condition of the shafting 
and bearings are in question. 

(b) The marine inspector may con-
duct a visual examination and may re-
quire nondestructive testing of the pro-
peller shafting whenever the condition 
of shafting is in question. 

[CGD 85–080, 61 FR 892, Jan. 10, 1996. Redesig-
nated by USCG–2000–6858, 67 FR 21080, Apr. 
29, 2002] 

§ 115.675 Extension of examination in-
tervals. 

The intervals between drydock ex-
aminations and internal structural ex-
aminations specified in § 115.605 of this 
part may be extended by the cognizant 
OCMI or Commandant. 

[CGD 85–080, 61 FR 892, Jan. 10, 1996. Redesig-
nated and amended by USCG–2000–6858, 67 FR 
21080, 21082, Apr. 29, 2002] 

Subpart G—Repairs and 
Alterations 

§ 115.700 Permission for repairs and 
alterations. 

(a) Repairs or alterations to the hull, 
machinery, or equipment that affect 
the safety of the vessel must not be 
made without the approval of the cog-
nizant OCMI, except during an emer-
gency. When repairs are made during 
an emergency, the owner, managing 
operator, or master shall notify the 
OCMI as soon as practicable after such 
repairs or alterations are made. Re-
pairs or alterations that affect the 
safety of the vessel include, but are not 
limited to, the: replacement, repair, or 
refastening of deck or hull planking, 
plating, and structural members; re-
pair of plate or frame cracks; damage 
repair or replacement, other than re-
placement in kind, of electrical wiring, 
fuel lines, tanks, boilers and other 
pressure vessels, and steering, propul-
sion and power supply systems; alter-
ations affecting stability; and repair or 
alteration of livesaving, fire detecting, 
or fire extinguishing equipment. 

(b) The owner or managing operator 
shall submit drawings, sketches, or 
written specifications describing the 
details of any proposed alterations to 
the cognizant OCMI. Proposed alter-

ations must be approved by the OCMI 
before work is started. 

(c) Drawings are not required to be 
submitted for repairs or replacements 
in kind. 

(d) The OCMI may require an inspec-
tion and testing whenever a repair or 
alteration is undertaken. 

§ 115.702 Installation tests and inspec-
tions. 

Whenever a launching appliance, sur-
vival craft, rescue boat, fixed gas fire 
extinguishing system, machinery, fuel 
tank, or pressure vessel is installed 
aboard a vessel after completion of the 
initial inspection for certification of 
the vessel, as replacement equipment 
or as a new installation, the owner or 
managing operator shall conduct the 
tests and make the vessel ready for the 
inspections required by § 115.402(d) of 
this part to the satisfaction of the cog-
nizant OCMI. 

§ 115.704 Breaking of safety valve 
seals. 

The owner, managing operator, or 
master shall notify the cognizant OCMI 
as soon as practicable after the seal on 
a boiler safety valve on a vessel is bro-
ken. 

§ 115.710 Inspection and testing prior 
to hot work. 

(a) An inspection for flammable or 
combustible gases must be conducted 
by a certified marine chemist or other 
person authorized by the cognizant 
OCMI in accordance with the provi-
sions of National Fire Protection Asso-
ciation (NFPA) 306, ‘‘Control of Gas 
Hazards on Vessels,’’ before alter-
ations, repairs, or other operations in-
volving riveting, welding, burning, or 
other fire producing actions may be 
made aboard a vessel: 

(1) Within or on the boundaries of 
fuel tanks; or 

(2) To pipelines, heating coils, pumps, 
fittings, or other appurtenances con-
nected to fuel tanks. 

(b) An inspection required by para-
graph (a) of this section must be con-
ducted as required by this paragraph. 

VerDate Aug<31>2005 00:14 Oct 24, 2006 Jkt 208190 PO 00000 Frm 00325 Fmt 8010 Sfmt 8010 Y:\SGML\208190.XXX 208190jc
or

co
ra

n 
on

 P
R

O
D

P
C

62
 w

ith
 C

F
R



316 

46 CFR Ch. I (10–1–06 Edition) § 115.800 

(1) In ports or places in the United 
States or its territories and posses-
sions, the inspection must be con-
ducted by a marine chemist certifi-
cated by the NFPA. However, if the 
services of a certified marine chemist 
are not reasonably available, the cog-
nizant OCMI, upon the recommenda-
tion of the vessel owner or managing 
operator, may authorize another per-
son to inspect the vessel. If the inspec-
tion indicates that the operations can 
be undertaken safely, a certificate set-
ting forth this fact in writing must be 
issued by the certified marine chemist 
or the authorized person before the 
work is started. The certificate must 
include any requirements necessary to 
reasonably maintain safe conditions in 
the spaces certified throughout the op-
eration, including any precautions nec-
essary to eliminate or minimize haz-
ards that may be present from protec-
tive coatings or residues from cargoes. 

(2) When not in a port or place in the 
United States or its territories and 
possessions, and when a marine chem-
ist or person authorized by the cog-
nizant OCMI is not reasonably avail-
able, the master shall conduct the in-
spection and enter the results of the in-
spection in the vessel’s logbook. 

(c) The owner, managing operator, or 
master shall obtain a copy of certifi-
cates issued by the certified marine 
chemist or the other person authorized 
by the cognizant OCMI, and shall en-
sure that all conditions on the certifi-
cates are observed and that the vessel 
is maintained in a safe condition. The 
owner, managing operator, or master 
shall maintain a safe condition on the 
vessel by requiring full observance, by 
persons under his or her control, of all 
requirements listed in the certificate. 

Subpart H—Material Inspections 

§ 115.800 Inspection standards. 

(a) A vessel is inspected for compli-
ance with the standards required by 
this subchapter. Machinery, equip-
ment, materials, and arrangements not 
covered by standards in this sub-
chapter may be inspected in accord-
ance with standards acceptable to the 
cognizant OCMI as good marine prac-
tice. 

(b) In the application of inspection 
standards due consideration must be 
given to the hazards involved in the op-
eration permitted by a vessel’s Certifi-
cate of Inspection. Thus, the standards 
may vary in accordance with the ves-
sel’s area of operation or any other 
operational restrictions or limitations. 

(c) The published standards of classi-
fication societies and other recognized 
safety associations may be used as 
guides in the inspection of vessels when 
such standards do not conflict with the 
requirements of this subchapter. 

§ 115.801 Notice of inspection defi-
ciencies and requirements. 

(a) If during the inspection of a ves-
sel, the vessel or its equipment is found 
not to conform to the requirements of 
law or the regulations in this sub-
chapter, the marine inspector will 
point out deficiencies observed and dis-
cuss all requirements with the owner, 
managing operator, or a representative 
thereof. Normally, the marine inspec-
tor will list all such requirements that 
have not been completed and present 
the list to the owner, managing oper-
ator, or a representative thereof. How-
ever, when a deficiency presents a seri-
ous safety hazard to the vessel or it’s 
passengers or crew, and exists through 
negligence or willful noncompliance, 
the marine inspector may issue a Re-
port of Violation (ROV) to the owner, 
managing operator, or a representative 
thereof. 

(b) In any case where further clari-
fication of or reconsideration of any re-
quirement placed against the vessel is 
desired, the owner, managing operator, 
or a representative thereof, may dis-
cuss the matter with the cognizant 
OCMI. 

§ 115.802 Hull. 

(a) At each initial and subsequent in-
spection for certification of a vessel, 
the owner or managing operator shall 
be prepared to conduct tests and have 
the vessel ready for inspections of the 
hull structure and its appurtenances, 
including the following: 

(1) Inspection of all accessible parts 
of the exterior and interior of the hull, 
the watertight bulkheads, and weather 
decks; 
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