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(f) If the Administrator accepts a cer-
tification without requiring an inspec-
tion, (s)he notifies the Registered Im-
porter in writing, and provides a copy 
to the importer of record. Such notifi-
cation shall be provided not later than 
the 25th calendar day after the Admin-
istrator has received such certification. 

(g) Release of the performance bond 
shall constitute acceptance of certifi-
cation or completion of inspection of 
the vehicle concerned, but shall not 
preclude a subsequent decision by the 
Administrator pursuant to 49 U.S.C. 
30118 that the vehicle fails to conform 
to any applicable Federal motor vehi-
cle safety standard. 

[54 FR 40090, Sept. 29, 1989, as amended at 55 
FR 37330, Sept. 11, 1990; 59 FR 52098, Oct. 14, 
1994]
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§ 593.1 Scope. 
This part establishes procedures 

under section 108(c) of the National 
Traffic and Motor Vehicle Safety Act, 
as amended (15 U.S.C. 1397(c)), for mak-
ing determinations whether a vehicle 
that was not originally manufactured 
to conform with all applicable Federal 
motor vehicle safety standards, and is 

not otherwise eligible for importation 
under part 591 of this chapter, may be 
imported into the United States be-
cause it can be modified to meet the 
Federal standards.

§ 593.2 Purpose. 
The purpose of this part is to provide 

content and format requirements for 
any Registered Importer and manufac-
turer who wishes to petition the Ad-
ministrator for a determination that a 
vehicle not originally manufactured to 
conform to all applicable Federal 
motor vehicle safety standards is eligi-
ble to be imported into the United 
States because it can be modified to 
meet the standards. The purpose of this 
part is also to specify procedures under 
which the Administrator makes eligi-
bility determinations pursuant to 
those petitions as well as eligibility de-
terminations on the agency’s initia-
tive.

§ 593.3 Applicability. 
This part applies to a motor vehicle 

that was not originally manufactured 
and certified by its original manufac-
turer to conform with all applicable 
Federal motor vehicle safety standards 
and that is offered for importation into 
the United States.

§ 593.4 Definitions. 
All terms in this part that are de-

fined in section 102 of the National 
Traffic and Motor Vehicle Safety Act 
(15 U.S.C. 1391) are used as defined 
therein. 

Administrator means the Adminis-
trator of the National Highway Traffic 
Safety Administration. 

Model year means the year used by a 
manufacturer to designate a discrete 
vehicle model irrespective of the cal-
endar year in which the vehicle was ac-
tually produced, or the model year as 
designated by the vehicle’s country of 
origin, or, if neither the manufacturer 
nor the country of origin has made 
such a designation, the calendar year 
that begins on September 1 and ends on 
August 31 of the next calendar year. 

NHTSA means the National Highway 
Traffic Safety Administration. 

Registered Importer means any person 
who has been granted registered im-
porter status by the Administrator 
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