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department or agency more than two 
model years before the current model 
year. 

(b) A manufacturer that incorporates 
by references a document not pre-
viously submitted to the National 
Highway Traffic Safety Administration 
shall append that document to the re-
port. 

(c) A manufacturer that incorporates 
by reference a document shall clearly 
identify the document and, in the case 
of a document previously submitted to 
the National Highway Traffic Safety 
Administration, indicate the date on 
which and the person by whom the doc-
ument was submitted to this agency.

§ 537.11 Public inspection of informa-
tion. 

Except as provided in § 537.12, any 
person may inspect the information 
and data submitted by a manufacturer 
under this part in the docket section of 
the National Highway Traffic Safety 
Administration. Any person may ob-
tain copies of the information avail-
able for inspection under this section 
in accordance with the regulations of 
the Secretary of Transportation in part 
7 of this title.

§ 537.12 Confidential information. 
(a) Information made available under 

§ 537.11 for public inspection does not 
include information for which con-
fidentiality is requested under 
§ 537.5(c)(7), is granted in accordance 
with section 505 of the Act and section 
552(b) of Title 5 of the United States 
Code and is not subsequently released 
under paragraph (c) of this section in 
accordance with section 505 of the Act. 

(b) Denial of confidential treatment. 
When the Administrator denies a man-
ufacturer’s request under § 537.5(c)(7) 
for confidential treatment of informa-
tion, the Administrator gives the man-
ufacturer written notice of the denial 
and reasons for it. Public disclosure of 
the information is not made until after 
the ten-day period immediately fol-
lowing the giving of the notice. 

(c) Release of confidential information. 
After giving written notice to a manu-
facturer and allowing ten days, when 
feasible, for the manufacturer to re-
spond, the Administrator may make 
available for public inspection any in-

formation submitted under this part 
that is relevant to a proceeding under 
the Act, including information that 
was granted confidential treatment by 
the Administrator pursuant to a re-
quest by the manufacturer under 
§ 537.5(c)(7).
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§ 538.1 Scope. 

This part establishes minimum driv-
ing range criteria to aid in identifying 
passenger automobiles that are dual 
fueled automobiles. It also establishes 
gallon equivalent measurements for 
gaseous fuels other than natural gas.

§ 538.2 Purpose. 

The purpose of this part is to specify 
one of the criteria in 49 U.S.C. chapter 
329 ‘‘Automobile Fuel Economy’’ for 
identifying dual fueled passenger auto-
mobiles that are manufactured in 
model years 1993 through 2004. The fuel 
economy of a qualifying vehicle is cal-
culated in a special manner so as to en-
courage its production as a way of fa-
cilitating a manufacturer’s compliance 
with the Corporate Average Fuel Econ-
omy Standards set forth in part 531 of 
this chapter. The purpose is also to es-
tablish gallon equivalent measure-
ments for gaseous fuels other than nat-
ural gas.

§ 538.3 Applicability. 

This part applies to manufacturers of 
automobiles.
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