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cost of attendance; and (ii) Maintain 
all records regarding the student’s eli-
gibility for and receipt of title IV, HEA 
program funds. 

(Authority: 20 U.S.C. 1094) 

[65 FR 65674, Nov. 1, 2000]

§§ 668.6–668.7 [Reserved]

§ 668.8 Eligible program. 
(a) General. An eligible program is an 

educational program that— 
(1) Is provided by a participating in-

stitution; and 
(2) Satisfies the other relevant re-

quirements contained in this section. 
(b) Definitions. For purposes of this 

section— 
(1) The Secretary considers the 

‘‘equivalent of an associate degree’’ to 
be— 

(i) An associate degree; or 
(ii) The successful completion of at 

least a two-year program that is ac-
ceptable for full credit toward a bach-
elor’s degree and qualifies a student for 
admission into the third year of a 
bachelor’s degree program; 

(2) A week is a consecutive seven-day 
period; and 

(3)(i) If an institution provides an 
educational program using a semester, 
trimester, or quarter system, or in 
clock hours, the Secretary considers 
that the institution provides one week 
of instructional time in that program 
during any week the institution pro-
vides— 

(A) At least one day of regularly 
scheduled instruction or examinations; 
or 

(B) After the last scheduled day of 
classes for a term, at least one day of 
study for final examinations. 

(ii) If an institution provides an edu-
cational program using credit hours 
but not a semester, trimester, or quar-
ter system, the Secretary considers 
that the institution provides one week 
of instructional time in that program 
during any week the institution pro-
vides— 

(A) At least 12 hours of regularly 
scheduled instruction or examinations; 
or 

(B) After the last scheduled day of 
classes for a payment period, at least 
12 hours of study for final examina-
tions. 

(4) Instructional time does not in-
clude any vacation periods, homework, 
or periods of orientation or counseling. 

(c) Institution of higher education. An 
eligible program provided by an insti-
tution of higher education must— 

(1) Lead to an associate, bachelor’s, 
professional, or graduate degree; 

(2) Be at least a two-academic-year 
program that is acceptable for full 
credit toward a bachelor’s degree; or 

(3) Be at least a one-academic-year 
training program that leads to a cer-
tificate, degree, or other recognized 
educational credential and that pre-
pares a student for gainful employment 
in a recognized occupation. 

(d) Proprietary institution of higher 
education and postsecondary vocational 
institution. An eligible program pro-
vided by a proprietary institution of 
higher education or postsecondary vo-
cational institution— 

(1)(i) Must require a minimum of 15 
weeks of instruction, beginning on the 
first day of classes and ending on the 
last day of classes or examinations; 

(ii) Must be at least 600 clock hours, 
16 semester or trimester hours, or 24 
quarter hours; 

(iii) Must provide undergraduate 
training that prepares a student for 
gainful employment in a recognized oc-
cupation; and 

(iv) May admit as regular students 
persons who have not completed the 
equivalent of an associate degree; 

(2) Must— 
(i) Require a minimum of 10 weeks of 

instruction, beginning on the first day 
of classes and ending on the last day of 
classes or examinations; 

(ii) Be at least 300 clock hours, 8 se-
mester or trimester hours, or 12 quar-
ter hours; 

(iii) Provide training that prepares a 
student for gainful employment in a 
recognized occupation; and 

(iv)(A) Be a graduate or professional 
program; or 

(B) Admit as regular students only 
persons who have completed the equiv-
alent of an associate degree; or 

(3) For purposes of the FFEL and Di-
rect Loan programs only, must— 

(i) Require a minimum of 10 weeks of 
instruction, beginning on the first day 
of classes and ending on the last day of 
classes or examinations; 
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(ii) Be at least 300 clock hours but 
less than 600 clock hours; 

(iii) Provide undergraduate training 
that prepares a student for gainful em-
ployment in a recognized occupation; 

(iv) Admit as regular students some 
persons who have not completed the 
equivalent of an associate degree; and 

(v) Satisfy the requirements of para-
graph (e) of this section. 

(e) Qualitative factors. (1) An edu-
cational program that satisfies the re-
quirements of paragraphs (d)(3)(i) 
through (iv) of this section qualifies as 
an eligible program only if— 

(i) The program has a substantiated 
completion rate of at least 70 percent, 
as calculated under paragraph (f) of 
this section; 

(ii) The program has a substantiated 
placement rate of at least 70 percent, 
as calculated under paragraph (g) of 
this section; 

(iii) The number of clock hours pro-
vided in the program does not exceed 
by more than 50 percent the minimum 
number of clock hours required for 
training in the recognized occupation 
for which the program prepares stu-
dents, as established by the State in 
which the program is offered, if the 
State has established such a require-
ment, or as established by any Federal 
agency; and 

(iv) The program has been in exist-
ence for at least one year. The Sec-
retary considers an educational pro-
gram to have been in existence for at 
least one year only if an institution 
has been legally authorized to provide, 
and has continuously provided, the pro-
gram during the 12 months (except for 
normal vacation periods and, at the 
discretion of the Secretary, periods 
when the institution closes due to a 
natural disaster that directly affects 
the institution or the institution’s stu-
dents) preceding the date on which the 
institution applied for eligibility for 
that program. 

(2) An institution shall substantiate 
the calculation of its completion and 
placement rates by having the certified 
public accountant who prepares its 
audit report required under § 668.23 re-
port on the institution’s calculation 
based on performing an attestation en-
gagement in accordance with the 
Statements on Standards for Attesta-

tion Engagements of the American In-
stitute of Certified Public Accountants 
(AICPA). 

(f) Calculation of completion rate. An 
institution shall calculate its comple-
tion rate for an educational program 
for any award year as follows: 

(1) Determine the number of regular 
students who were enrolled in the pro-
gram during the award year. 

(2) Subtract from the number of stu-
dents determined under paragraph (f)(1) 
of this section, the number of regular 
students who, during that award year, 
withdrew from, dropped out of, or were 
expelled from the program and were 
entitled to and actually received, in a 
timely manner a refund of 100 percent 
of their tuition and fees. 

(3) Subtract from the total obtained 
under paragraph (f)(2) of this section 
the number of students who were en-
rolled in the program at the end of that 
award year. 

(4) Determine the number of regular 
students who, during that award year, 
received within 150 percent of the pub-
lished length of the educational pro-
gram the degree, certificate, or other 
recognized educational credential 
awarded for successfully completing 
the program. 

(5) Divide the number determined 
under paragraph (f)(4) of this section by 
the total obtained under paragraph 
(f)(3) of this section. 

(g) Calculation of placement rate. (1) 
An institution shall calculate its place-
ment rate for an educational program 
for any award year as follows: 

(i) Determine the number of students 
who, during the award year, received 
the degree, certificate, or other recog-
nized educational credential awarded 
for successfully completing the pro-
gram. 

(ii) Of the total obtained under para-
graph (g)(1)(i) of this section, deter-
mine the number of students who, 
within 180 days of the day they re-
ceived their degree, certificate, or 
other recognized educational creden-
tial, obtained gainful employment in 
the recognized occupation for which 
they were trained or in a related com-
parable recognized occupation and, on 
the date of this calculation, are em-
ployed, or have been employed, for at 
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least 13 weeks following receipt of the 
credential from the institution. 

(iii) Divide the number of students 
determined under paragraph (g)(1)(ii) of 
this section by the total obtained 
under paragraph (g)(1)(i) of this sec-
tion. 

(2) An institution shall document 
that each student described in para-
graph (g)(1)(ii) of this section obtained 
gainful employment in the recognized 
occupation for which he or she was 
trained or in a related comparable rec-
ognized occupation. Examples of satis-
factory documentation of a student’s 
gainful employment include, but are 
not limited to— 

(i) A written statement from the stu-
dent’s employer; 

(ii) Signed copies of State or Federal 
income tax forms; and 

(iii) Written evidence of payments of 
Social Security taxes. 

(h) Eligibility for Federal Pell Grant 
and FSEOG programs. In addition to 
satisfying other relevant provisions of 
this section— 

(1) An educational program qualifies 
as an eligible program for purposes of 
the Federal Pell Grant Program only if 
the educational program is an under-
graduate program or a 
postbaccalaureate teacher certificate 
or licensing program as described in 34 
CFR 690.6(c); and 

(2) An educational program qualifies 
as an eligible program for purposes of 
the FSEOG Program only if the edu-
cational program is an undergraduate 
program. 

(j) English as a second language (ESL). 
(1) In addition to satisfying the rel-
evant provisions of this section, an 
educational program that consists sole-
ly of instruction in ESL qualifies as an 
eligible program if— 

(i) The institution admits to the pro-
gram only students who the institution 
determines need the ESL instruction 
to use already existing knowledge, 
training, or skills; and 

(ii) The program leads to a degree, 
certificate, or other recognized edu-
cational credential. 

(2) An institution shall document its 
determination that ESL instruction is 
necessary to enable each student en-
rolled in its ESL program to use al-
ready existing knowledge, training, or 

skills with regard to the students that 
it admits to its ESL program under 
paragraph (j)(1)(i) of this section. 

(3) An ESL program that qualifies as 
an eligible program under this para-
graph is eligible for purposes of the 
Federal Pell Grant Program only. 

(k) Undergraduate educational program 
in credit hours. If an institution offers 
an undergraduate educational program 
in credit hours, the institution must 
use the formula contained in paragraph 
(l) of this section to determine whether 
that program satisfies the require-
ments contained in paragraph (c)(3) or 
(d) of this section, and the number of 
credit hours in that educational pro-
gram for purposes of the Title IV, HEA 
programs, unless— 

(1) The program is at least two aca-
demic years in length and provides an 
associate degree, a bachelor’s degree, a 
professional degree, or an equivalent 
degree as determined by the Secretary; 
or 

(2) Each course within the program is 
acceptable for full credit toward that 
institution’s associate degree, bach-
elor’s degree, professional degree, or 
equivalent degree as determined by the 
Secretary, provided that the institu-
tion’s degree requires at least two aca-
demic years of study. 

(l) Formula. For purposes of deter-
mining whether a program described in 
paragraph (k) of this section satisfies 
the requirements contained in para-
graph (c)(3) or (d) of this section, and 
the number of credit hours in that edu-
cational program with regard to the 
Title IV, HEA programs— 

(1) A semester hour must include at 
least 30 clock hours of instruction; 

(2) A trimester hour must include at 
least 30 clock hours of instruction; and 

(3) A quarter hour must include at 
least 20 hours of instruction. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 1845–0537) 

(Authority: 20 U.S.C. 1070a, 1070b, 1070c–
1070c–2, 1085, 1087aa–1087hh, 1088, 1091, and 
1141; 42

[59 FR 22421, Apr. 29, 1994, as amended at 59 
FR 34964, July 7, 1994; 59 FR 61179, Nov. 29, 
1994; 60 FR 42408, Aug. 15, 1995; 63 FR 40623, 
July 29, 1998; 64 FR 58291, Oct. 28, 1999; 64 FR 
59037, Nov. 1, 1999; 65 FR 65675, Nov. 1, 2000]
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