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(iii) The instructor-student relation-
ship. 

(d) The transition ground training for 
flight instructors must include the ap-
proved methods, procedures, and limi-
tations for performing the required 
normal, abnormal, and emergency pro-
cedures applicable to the airplane to 
which the flight instructor is in transi-
tion. 

(e) The initial and transition flight 
training for flight instructors (air-
plane), flight engineer instructors (air-
plane), and flight navigator instructors 
(airplane) must include the following: 

(1) The safety measures for emer-
gency situations that are likely to de-
velop during instruction. 

(2) The potential results of improper, 
untimely, or non-execution of safety 
measures during instruction. 

(3) For pilot flight instructor (air-
plane)— 

(i) In-flight training and practice in 
conducting flight instruction from the 
left and right pilot seats in the re-
quired normal, abnormal, and emer-
gency procedures to ensure competence 
as an instructor; and 

(ii) The safety measures to be taken 
from either pilot seat for emergency 
situations that are likely to develop 
during instruction. 

(4) For flight engineer instructors 
(airplane) and flight navigator instruc-
tors (airplane), in-flight training to en-
sure competence to perform assigned 
duties. 

(f) The requirements of paragraph (e) 
of this section may be accomplished in 
full or in part in flight, in a flight sim-
ulator, or in a flight training device, as 
appropriate. 

(g) The initial and transition flight 
training for flight instructors (simu-
lator) must include the following: 

(1) Training and practice in the re-
quired normal, abnormal, and emer-
gency procedures to ensure competence 
to conduct the flight instruction re-
quired by this part. This training and 
practice must be accomplished in full 
or in part in a flight simulator or in a 
flight training device. 

(2) Training in the operation of flight 
simulators or flight training devices, 
or both, to ensure competence to con-

duct the flight instruction required by 
this part. 

[Doc. No. 28471, 61 FR 30743, June 17, 1996; 62 
FR 3739, Jan. 24, 1997] 

§ 121.415 Crewmember and dispatcher 
training requirements. 

(a) Each training program must pro-
vide the following ground training as 
appropriate to the particular assign-
ment of the crewmember or dispatcher: 

(1) Basic indoctrination ground train-
ing for newly hired crewmembers or 
dispatchers including 40 programmed 
hours of instruction, unless reduced 
under § 121.405 or as specified in 
§ 121.401(d), in at least the following— 

(i) Duties and responsibilities of 
crewmembers or dispatchers, as appli-
cable; 

(ii) Appropriate provisions of the 
Federal Aviation Regulations; 

(iii) Contents of the certificate hold-
er’s operating certificate and oper-
ations specifications (not required for 
flight attendants); and 

(iv) Appropriate portions of the cer-
tificate holder’s operating manual. 

(2) The initial and transition ground 
training specified in §§ 121.419 through 
121.422, as applicable. 

(3) For crewmembers, emergency 
training as specified in §§ 121.417 and 
121.805. 

(4) After February 15, 2008, training 
for crewmembers and dispatchers in 
their roles and responsibilities in the 
certificate holder’s passenger recovery 
plan, if applicable. 

(b) Each training program must pro-
vide the flight training specified in 
§§ 121.424 through 121.426, as applicable. 

(c) Each training program must pro-
vide recurrent ground and flight train-
ing as provided in § 121.427. 

(d) Each training program must pro-
vide the differences training specified 
in § 121.418 if the Administrator finds 
that, due to differences between air-
planes of the same type operated by 
the certificate holder, additional train-
ing is necessary to insure that each 
crewmember and dispatcher is ade-
quately trained to perform his assigned 
duties. 

(e) Upgrade training as specified in 
§§ 121.419 and 121.424 for a particular 
type airplane may be included in the 
training program for crewmembers who 
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have qualified and served as second in 
command pilot or flight engineer on 
that airplane. 

(f) Particular subjects, maneuvers, 
procedures, or parts thereof specified in 
§§ 121.419 through 121.425 for transition 
or upgrade training, as applicable, may 
be omitted, or the programmed hours 
of ground instruction or inflight train-
ing may be reduced, as provided in 
§ 121.405. 

(g) In addition to initial, transition, 
upgrade, recurrent and differences 
training, each training program must 
also provide ground and flight training, 
instruction, and practice as necessary 
to insure that each crewmember and 
dispatcher— 

(1) Remains adequately trained and 
currently proficient with respect to 
each airplane, crewmember position, 
and type of operation in which he 
serves; and 

(2) Qualifies in new equipment, facili-
ties, procedures, and techniques, in-
cluding modifications to airplanes. 

[Doc. No. 9509, 35 FR 90, Jan. 3, 1970, as 
amended by Amdt. 121–130, 41 FR 47229, Oct. 
28, 1976; Amdt. 121–281, 66 FR 19043, Apr. 12, 
2001; Amdt. 121–329, 72 FR 1881, Jan. 16, 2007] 

§ 121.417 Crewmember emergency 
training. 

(a) Each training program must pro-
vide the emergency training set forth 
in this section with respect to each air-
plane type, model, and configuration, 
each required crewmember, and each 
kind of operation conducted, insofar as 
appropriate for each crewmember and 
the certificate holder. 

(b) Emergency training must provide 
the following: 

(1) Instruction in emergency assign-
ments and procedures, including co-
ordination among crewmembers. 

(2) Individual instruction in the loca-
tion, function, and operation of emer-
gency equipment including— 

(i) Equipment used in ditching and 
evacuation; 

(ii) [Reserved] 
(iii) Portable fire extinguishers, with 

emphasis on type of extinguisher to be 
used on different classes of fires; and 

(iv) Emergency exits in the emer-
gency mode with the evacuation slide/ 
raft pack attached (if applicable), with 

training emphasis on the operation of 
the exits under adverse conditions. 

(3) Instruction in the handling of 
emergency situations including— 

(i) Rapid decompression; 
(ii) Fire in flight or on the surface, 

and smoke control procedures with em-
phasis on electrical equipment and re-
lated circuit breakers found in cabin 
areas including all galleys, service cen-
ters, lifts, lavatories and movie 
screens; 

(iii) Ditching and other evacuation, 
including the evacuation of persons 
and their attendants, if any, who may 
need the assistance of another person 
to move expeditiously to an exit in the 
event of an emergency. 

(iv) [Reserved] 
(v) Hijacking and other unusual situ-

ations. 
(4) Review and discussion of previous 

aircraft accidents and incidents per-
taining to actual emergency situa-
tions. 

(c) Each crewmember must accom-
plish the following emergency training 
during the specified training periods, 
using those items of installed emer-
gency equipment for each type of air-
plane in which he or she is to serve (Al-
ternate recurrent training required by 
§ 121.433(c) of this part may be accom-
plished by approved pictorial presen-
tation or demonstration): 

(1) One-time emergency drill require-
ments to be accomplished during ini-
tial training. Each crewmember must 
perform— 

(i) At least one approved protective 
breathing equipment (PBE) drill in 
which the crewmember combats an ac-
tual or simulated fire using at least 
one type of installed hand fire extin-
guisher or approved fire extinguisher 
that is appropriate for the type of ac-
tual fire or simulated fire to be fought 
while using the type of installed PBE 
required by § 121.337 or approved PBE 
simulation device as defined by para-
graph (d) of this section for combatting 
fires aboard airplanes; 

(ii) At least one approved firefighting 
drill in which the crewmember com-
bats an actual fire using at least one 
type of installed hand fire extinguisher 
or approved fire extinguisher that is 
appropriate for the type of fire to be 

VerDate Aug<31>2005 09:03 Feb 07, 2008 Jkt 214044 PO 00000 Frm 00836 Fmt 8010 Sfmt 8010 Y:\SGML\214044.XXX 214044ys
hi

ve
rs

 o
n 

P
R

O
D

1P
C

62
 w

ith
 C

F
R


