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jeopardy; nor does it preclude the ca-
sino, hotel, or cruise line, or its agents, 
from offering operational land pack-
ages for a fee. 

§ 212.7 Direct sales. 

(a) Certificated and foreign air car-
riers may sell or offer for sale, and op-
erate, as principal, Public Charter 
flights under part 380 of this chapter 
directly to the public. 

(b) Each certificated or foreign air 
carrier operating a charter trip under 
this section shall comply with all the 
requirements of part 380 of this chap-
ter, except that: 

(1) Those provisions of part 380 relat-
ing to the existence of a contract be-
tween a charter operator and a direct 
air carrier do not apply; 

(2) A depository agreement shall 
comply with § 380.34a (d) and (f); 

(3) A security agreement shall com-
ply with § 380.34 (c) and (d); and 

(i) If no depository agreement is 
used, protect charter participant pay-
ments (including those for ground ac-
commodations and services) and assure 
the certificated or foreign air carrier’s 
contractual and regulatory responsibil-
ities to charter participants in an un-
limited amount (except that the liabil-
ity of the securer with respect to any 
charter participant may be limited to 
the charter price paid by or on behalf 
of such participant); 

(ii) If used in combination with a de-
pository agreement, protect charter 
participant payments (including those 
for ground accommodations and serv-
ices) and assure the certificated or for-
eign air carrier’s contractual and regu-
latory responsibilities to charter par-
ticipants in the amount of at least 
$10,000 times the number of flights, ex-
cept that the amount need not be more 
than $200,000. The liability of the se-
curer with respect to any charter par-
ticipant may be limited to the charter 
price paid by or on behalf of such par-
ticipant. 

(c) The Department reserves the 
right to limit or prohibit the operation 
of direct sales Public Charters by a for-
eign air carrier upon a finding that 
such action is necessary in the public 
interest. 

§ 212.8 Protection of customers’ pay-
ments. 

(a) Except as provided in paragraph 
(c) of this section, no certificated air 
carrier or foreign air carrier shall per-
form any charter trip (other than a 
cargo charter trip) originating in the 
United States or any Overseas Military 
Personnel Charter trip, as defined in 
part 372 of this chapter, nor shall such 
carrier accept any advance payment in 
connection with any such charter trip, 
unless there is on file with the Depart-
ment a copy of a currently effective 
agreement made between said carrier 
and a designated bank, by the terms of 
which all sums payable in advance to 
the carrier by charterers, in connection 
with any such trip to be performed by 
said carrier, shall be deposited with 
and maintained by the bank, as escrow 
holder, the agreement to be subject to 
the following conditions: 

(1) The charterer (or its agent) shall 
pay the carrier either by check or 
money order made payable to the de-
pository bank. Such check or money 
order and any cash received by the car-
rier from a charterer (or its agent) 
shall be deposited in, or mailed to, the 
bank no later than the close of the 
business day following the receipt of 
the check or money order or the cash, 
along with a statement showing the 
name and address of the charterer (or 
its agent); provided, however, that 
where the charter transportation to be 
performed by a carrier is sold through 
a travel agent, the agent may be au-
thorized by the carrier to deduct its 
commission and remit the balance of 
the advance payment to the carrier ei-
ther by check or money order made 
payable to the designated bank. 

(2) The bank shall pay over to the 
carrier escrowed funds with respect to 
a specific charter only after the carrier 
has certified in writing to the bank 
that such charter has been completed; 
provided, however, that the bank may 
be required by the terms of the agree-
ment to pay over to the carrier a speci-
fied portion of such escrowed funds, as 
payment for the performance of the 
outbound segment of a round-trip char-
ter upon the carrier’s written certifi-
cation that such segment has been so 
completed. 
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