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§ 243.7 Information collection require-
ments. 

(a) For covered flight segments, each 
covered airline shall: 

(1) Collect, or cause to be collected, 
the full name for each passenger who is 
a U.S. citizen. U.S.-citizen passengers 
for whom this information is not ob-
tained shall not be boarded; 

(2) Solicit, or cause to be solicited, a 
name and telephone number of a con-
tact from each passenger who is a U.S. 
citizen; and 

(3) Maintain a record of the informa-
tion collected pursuant to this section. 

(b) The covered airline operating the 
flight segment shall be responsible for 
ensuring compliance with paragraph 
(a) of this section. 

§ 243.9 Procedures for collecting and 
maintaining the information. 

Covered airlines may use any method 
or procedure to collect, store and 
transmit the required information, 
subject to the following conditions: 

(a) Information on individual pas-
sengers shall be collected before each 
passenger boards the aircraft on a cov-
ered flight segment. 

(b) The information shall be kept 
until all passengers have disembarked 
from the covered flight segment. 

(c) The contact information collected 
pursuant to section 243.7(a)(2) of this 
part shall be kept confidential and re-
leased only to the U.S. Department of 
State, the National Transportation 
Safety Board (upon NTSB’s request), 
and the U.S. Department of Transpor-
tation pursuant to oversight of this 
part. This paragraph does not preempt 
other governments or governmental 
agencies that have an independent, 
legal right to obtain this information. 

(d) The contact information collected 
pursuant to section 243.7(a)(2) of this 
part shall only be used by covered air-
lines for notification of family mem-
bers or listed contacts following an 
aviation disaster. The information 
shall not be used for commercial or 
marketing purposes. 

§ 243.11 Transmission of information 
after an aviation disaster. 

(a) Each covered airline shall inform 
the Managing Director of Overseas Cit-
izen Services, Bureau of Consular Af-

fairs, U.S. Department of State imme-
diately upon learning of an aviation 
disaster involving a covered flight seg-
ment operated by that carrier. The 
Managing Director may be reached 24 
hours a day through the Department of 
State Operations Center at (202) 647– 
1512. 

(b) Each covered airline shall trans-
mit a complete and accurate compila-
tion of the information collected pur-
suant to § 243.7 of this part to the U.S. 
Department of State as quickly as pos-
sible, but not later than 3 hours, after 
the carrier learns of an aviation dis-
aster involving a covered flight seg-
ment operated by that carrier. 

(c) Upon request, a covered airline 
shall transmit a complete and accurate 
compilation of the information col-
lected pursuant to § 243.7 of this part to 
the Director, Family Support Services, 
National Transportation Safety Board. 

§ 243.13 Filing requirements. 

(a) Each covered airline that operates 
one or more covered flight segments 
shall file with the U.S. Department of 
Transportation a brief statement sum-
marizing how it will collect the pas-
senger manifest information required 
by this part and transmit the informa-
tion to the Department of State fol-
lowing an aviation disaster. This de-
scription shall include a contact at the 
covered airline, available at any time 
the covered airline is operating a cov-
ered flight segment, who can be con-
sulted concerning information gath-
ered pursuant to this part. 

(b) Each covered airline shall file any 
contact change as well as a description 
of any significant change in its means 
of collecting or transmitting manifest 
information on or before the date the 
change is made. 

(c) All filings under this section 
should be submitted to OST Docket 98– 
3305, Dockets Facility (SVC–121.30), 
U.S. Department of Transportation, 
Room PL–401, 400 Seventh Street, SW., 
Washington, DC 20590. The statement 
shall be filed by July 1, 1998, or, for 
covered airlines beginning operations 
after July 1, 1998, prior to the date a 
covered airline operates a covered 
flight segment. 
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