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(2) The charter of the Board is set 
forth in subpart 1 of part 1209 of this 
chapter. The Board’s rules of procedure 
are set forth in 14 CFR part 1241. 

(3) The texts of decisions of the Board 
are published by Commerce Clearing 
House, Inc., in Board of Contract Ap-
peals Decisions, and are hereby incor-
porated by reference. All decisions and 
orders are available for inspection and 
for purchase from the Recorder of the 
Board of NASA Headquarters, Wash-
ington, DC. Decisions and orders issued 
after July, 1967, area available for in-
spection and for purchase at NASA In-
formation Centers. 

(b) Contract Adjustment Board. (1) The 
function of the Board is to consider and 
dispose of requests by NASA contrac-
tors for extraordinary contractual ad-
justments pursuant to Public Law 85– 
804 (50 U.S.C. 1431–35) and Executive 
Order 10789 dated November 14, 1958 (23 
FR 8397). 

(2) The charter of the Board is set 
forth at subpart 3 of part 1209 of this 
chapter. The Board’s rules of procedure 
are set forth at 48 CFR part 1850. 

(3) Indexes of and texts of decisions of 
the Board are available for inspection 
and for purchase from the Chairperson 
of the Board, National Aeronautics and 
Space Administration, Washington, DC 
20546, and from the NASA Information 
Centers. 

(c) Inventions and Contributions Board. 
(1) The function of the Board is to con-
sider and recommend to the Adminis-
trator the action to be taken with re-
spect to: 

(i) Petitions for waiver of rights to 
any invention or class of inventions 
made during the performance of NASA 
contracts; and 

(ii) Applications for award for sci-
entific and technical contributions de-
termined to have significant value in 
the conduct of aeronautical and space 
activities, pursuant to the National 
Aeronautics and Space Act of 1958, as 
amended (42 U.S.C. 2457 (f) and (g), 
2458), and the Government Employees 
Incentive Awards Act (5 U.S.C. 2121–23), 
respectively. 

(2) The charter of the Board is set 
forth at subpart 4 of part 1209 of this 
chapter. The Board’s rules of procedure 
are set forth at 14 CFR parts 1240 and 
1245. 

(3) The decisions of the Board on re-
quests for waiver are available for in-
spection at NASA Headquarters, Office 
of Inventions and Contributions Board. 

Subpart 4—General Information 

§ 1201.400 NASA procurement pro-
gram. 

(a) The Office of Procurement, head-
ed by the Assistant Administrator for 
Procurement, serves as a central point 
of control and contact for NASA pro-
curements. Although the procurements 
may be made by the field installations, 
selected contracts and contracts of spe-
cial types are required to be approved 
by the Assistant Administrator for 
Procurement prior to their execution. 
The Office of Procurement is also re-
sponsible for formulation of NASA pro-
curement policies and provides overall 
assistance and guidance to NASA field 
installations to achieve uniformity in 
NASA procurement processes. 

(b) The NASA procurement program 
is carried out principally at the NASA 
field installations listed in subpart 2 of 
this part and in the ‘‘U.S. Government 
Manual.’’ The Headquarters Acquisi-
tion Division is responsible for con-
tracts with foreign governments and 
foreign commercial organizations, the 
procurement of materials and services 
required by Headquarters offices except 
for minor office supplies and services 
procured locally, and the award of 
grants and cooperative agreements for 
Headquarters. The Headquarters Space 
Station Freedom Procurement Office is 
responsible for managing and directing 
the full range of acquisition functions 
in support of the Space Station Free-
dom Program Office. 

(c) All procurements are made in ac-
cordance with the Federal Acquisition 
Regulation (FAR) (48 CFR chapter 1) 
and the NASA Federal Acquisition 
Regulation Supplement (NASA/FAR 
Supplement) (48 CFR chapter 18). Cop-
ies of these publications are available 
from the Superintendent of Docu-
ments, U.S. Government Printing Of-
fice, Washington, DC 20402, on an an-
nual subscription basis. 
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