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(c) Nonresponsibility of bank for truth
or accuracy of statements or certifi-
cations. The bank shall not be respon-
sible for the truth or accuracy of any
information or statement contained in
any Supplier’s Certificate or any other
document certification to be submitted
by it to USAID, notwithstanding any
knowledge or information in the actual
or constructive possession of the bank
to the contrary. The bank shall not be
obligated to look beyond the docu-
ments, including any certifications en-
dorsed thereon, to be submitted by it
or to make any independent investiga-
tion as to the truth or accuracy of any
information or statement contained
therein.

(d) Protection of bank making payment.
Acceptance by the bank of any docu-
ment in the ordinary course of business
in good faith as being a genuine and
valid document and sufficient in the
premises, and the delivery thereof to
USAID, shall constitute full compli-
ance by the bank with any provision of
this part, the letter of commitment re-
quiring delivery of a document of the
sort that the document actually so de-
livered purports to be. The bank shall
be entitled to receive and retain reim-
bursement of the amount of all pay-
ments made by it against documents so
accepted, notwithstanding that such
payments may be made in connection
with a purchase in excess of the price
calculated in accordance with the ap-
plicable provisions of subpart G.

(e) Payment to third persons. The
bank’s right of reimbursement shall
not be affected by the fact that pay-
ment is made to the approved applicant
or at the request of the approved appli-
cant or such beneficiary to a person
other than the supplier under the con-
tract to which such payment relates, if
the bank has complied with all other
requirements of the letter of commit-
ment and has satisfied itself in good
faith that the person to whom it makes
payment has, in turn, made payment
to the supplier.

(f) Bank procedures with regard to cer-
tain suppliers. In the event a bank re-
ceives written advice from USAID con-
cerning special conditions which are
applicable to transactions of particular
suppliers, such bank will use reason-
able care to maintain procedures de-

signed to ensure that accommodations
thereafter furnished by it with respect
to such suppliers by means of the
issuance, confirmation, advising or
transfer of letters of credit, or the
making of payments not under letters
of credit shall reflect such special con-
ditions. While banks are expected to
comply with the foregoing obligation, a
bank which has used reasonable care to
establish and maintain such procedures
will not be responsible for any inad-
vertent furnishing of any such accom-
modation not containing applicable
special conditions or the making of
payment thereunder. For the purpose
of ascertaining whether the supplier is
a person or organization subject to an
USAID advice concerning special con-
ditions applicable to its transactions
under this paragraph, a bank, in mak-
ing payment under a letter of credit or
otherwise, may consider as supplier the
person or organization issuing the in-
voice.

(g) Provision of implementing docu-
ments. A bank shall not be responsible
for compliance with any provision of
an implementing document other than
a letter of commitment.

§ 201.74 Additional documents for
USAID.

In addition to the documents re-
quired for reimbursement, a bank shall
retain in its files for a period of at
least 3 years and shall make available
to USAID promptly upon request a
copy of any of the following documents
which may pertain to an USAID-fi-
nanced transaction:

(a) Each letter of credit issued, con-
firmed, or advised by it, together with
any extension or modification thereof;

(b) Payment instructions received
from the approved applicant;

(c) Each application and agreement
relating to such letter of credit or in-
structions for payment, together with
any extension or modification thereof;

(d) A detailed advice of the interest,
commissions, expenses, or other items
charged by it in connection with each
such letter of credit or payment in-
structions.

§ 201.75 Termination or modification.
If USAID directs that the delivery of

commodities be terminated, orders
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