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the cooperating country shall be in-
sured against marine risks and that
such insurance shall be placed in the
United States with a company or com-
panies authorized to do marine insur-
ance business in a State of the United
States.

(f) Timely submission of documents. All
documents required under § 201.52 to be
submitted by a supplier in order to re-
ceive payment or reimbursement shall
be submitted to USAID under direct
letters of commitment or to a des-
ignated bank under bank letters of
credit on or before the terminal date
specified in the letter of commitment
or letter of credit, respectively.

(g) U.S. Treasury Department regula-
tions. Procurement transactions shall
comply with the requirements of the
U.S. Treasury Department Foreign As-
sets, Sanctions, Transactions and
Funds Control Regulations published
in 31 CFR parts 500 through 599, as from
time to time amended.

(h) Commodities shipped out of a free
port or bonded warehouse. No com-
modity shipped out of a free port or
bonded warehouse is eligible for USAID
financing if it was shipped to the free
port or bonded warehouse without com-
pliance with the requirements set forth
in paragraph (d)(1) of this section, or if
it was shipped from the free port or
bonded warehouse without compliance
with the requirements set forth in
paragraphs (d) (1) and (2) of this sec-
tion.

(i) Purchase price. The purchase price
for the commodity shall satisfy the re-
quirements of subpart G.

(j) Purchases from eligible suppliers.
Commodities procured with funds made
available under this part 201 shall be
purchased from eligible suppliers. The
rules on the nationality of suppliers of
commodities are in section 228.14 of
this chapter.

(k) Determination of commodity eligi-
bility. The commodity shall be ap-
proved in writing by USAID for each
purchase transaction as eligible for
USAID financing. Such approval shall
be indicated on the Application for Ap-
proval of Commodity Eligibility (Form

AID 11) submitted to USAID by the
supplier.

[55 FR 34232, Aug. 22, 1990, as amended at 58
FR 48797, Sept. 20, 1993; 62 FR 38027, July 16,
1997]

§ 201.12 Eligibility of incidental serv-
ices.

Incidental services may be financed
under the same implementing docu-
ment which makes funds available for
the procurement of equipment only if:

(a) Such services are specified in the
purchase contract relating to the
equipment;

(b) The price satisfies the require-
ments of § 201.68;

(c) The portion of the total purchase
contract price attributable to such
services does not exceed 25 percent; and

(d) The supplier of such services,
prior to approval of the USAID Com-
modity Approval Application, has nei-
ther been suspended or debarred by
USAID under part 208 of this chapter,
nor has been placed on the ‘‘Lists of
Parties Excluded from Federal Pro-
curement or Nonprocurement Pro-
grams,’’ published by the U.S. General
Services Administration.

(e) The supplier of such services
meets the requirements of § 228.25 of
this chapter.

[55 FR 34232, Aug. 22, 1990, as amended at 62
FR 38027, July 16, 1997]

§ 201.13 Eligibility of delivery services.
(a) General. Delivery of USAID-fi-

nanced commodities may be financed
under the implementing document pro-
vided the delivery services meet the re-
quirements of this section and the ap-
plicable provisions in part 228, subpart
C of this chapter.

(b) Transportation costs. USAID will
not finance transportation costs:

(1) For shipment beyond the point of
entry in the cooperating country ex-
cept when intermodal transportation
service covering the carriage of cargo
from point of origin to destination is
used, and the point of destination, as
stated in the carrier’s through bill of
lading, is established in the carrier’s
tariff; or

(2) On a transportation medium
owned, operated or under the control of
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any country not included in Geo-
graphic Code 935; or

(3) Under any ocean or air charter
covering full or part cargo (whether for
a single voyage, consecutive voyages,
or a time period) which has not re-
ceived prior approval by USAID/W, Of-
fice of Procurement, Transportation
Division); or

(4) Which are attributable to broker-
age commissions which exceed the lim-
itations specified in § 201.65(h) or to ad-
dress commissions, dead freight, de-
murrage or detention.

(c) Inspection services. USAID will fi-
nance inspection of USAID-financed
commodities when inspection is re-
quired by USAID, or in those cases
where inspection is required by the im-
porter and such inspection is specified
in the purchase contract, performed by
independent inspectors and is either
customary in export transactions for
the commodity involved or is necessary
to determine conformity of the com-
modities to the contract. Section 228.24
of this chapter covers the nationality
requirements for suppliers of inspec-
tion services.

(d) Marine insurance. (1) Unless other-
wise authorized, USAID will finance
premiums for marine insurance includ-
ing war risk on USAID-financed com-
modities only if:

(i) The insurance is placed in a coun-
try included in the authorized Geo-
graphic Code: Provided, that if the au-
thorized Geographic Code is any other
than USAID Geographic Code 000, the
cooperating country itself shall be rec-
ognized as an eligible source; and

(ii) Such insurance is placed either in
accordance with the terms of the com-
modity purchase contract or on the
written instructions of the importer;
and

(iii) Insurance coverage relates only
to the period during which the com-
modities are in transit to the cooper-
ating country, except that it may in-
clude coverage under a warehouse-to-
warehouse clause; and

(iv) The premiums do not exceed the
limitations contained in § 201.68; and

(v) The insurance provides that loss
payment proceeds shall be paid in U.S.
dollars or other freely convertible cur-
rency.

(2) Within the meaning of § 201.11(e),
as well as this paragraph, insurance is
placed in a country only if payment of
the insurance premium is made to, and
the insurance policy is issued by, an in-
surance company office located in that
country.

(e) Suspension and debarment. In order
to be eligible for USAID financing, the
costs of any delivery services must be
paid to carriers, insurers, or suppliers
of inspection services who, prior to ap-
proval of the USAID Commodity Ap-
proval Application, have neither been
suspended nor debarred under USAID
Regulation 8, 22 CFR part 208, nor in-
cluded on the ‘‘Lists of Parties Ex-
cluded from Federal Procurement or
Nonprocurement Programs’’ published
by the U.S. General Services Adminis-
tration.

[55 FR 34232, Aug. 22, 1990, as amended at 62
FR 38027, July 16, 1997]

§ 201.14 Eligibility of bid and perform-
ance bonds and guaranties.

The cost of any bid bond or guaranty
posted by a successful bidder or of any
performance bond or guaranty posted
by a supplier is eligible for financing
under the implementing document,
provided that the bond or guaranty
conforms to the requirements of the in-
vitation for bids or the contract, as ap-
plicable, and to the extent that the
principal amount of the bond or guar-
anty does not exceed the amount cus-
tomary in international trade for the
type of transaction and commodity in-
volved. Bonds or guaranties may be
payable in U.S. dollars, or a freely con-
vertible currency or local currency,
and shall be posted in favor of the pur-
chaser. Nationality requirements for
sureties, insurance companies or banks
who issue bonds or guaranties under
USAID-financed transactions are set
forth in § 228.38(b) of this chapter.

[55 FR 34232, Aug. 22, 1990, as amended at 62
FR 38027, July 16, 1997]

§ 201.15 U.S. flag vessel shipping re-
quirements.

(a) General requirements. Unless
USAID determines that privately
owned U.S. flag commercial ocean ves-
sels are not available at fair and rea-
sonable rates for such vessels:
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