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§ 982.313 Security deposit: Amounts 
owed by tenant. 

(a) The owner may collect a security 
deposit from the tenant. 

(b) The PHA may prohibit security 
deposits in excess of private market 
practice, or in excess of amounts 
charged by the owner to unassisted 
tenants. 

(c) When the tenant moves out of the 
dwelling unit, the owner, subject to 
State or local law, may use the secu-
rity deposit, including any interest on 
the deposit, in accordance with the 
lease, as reimbursement for any unpaid 
rent payable by the tenant, damages to 
the unit or for other amounts the ten-
ant owes under the lease. 

(d) The owner must give the tenant a 
written list of all items charged 
against the security deposit, and the 
amount of each item. After deducting 
the amount, if any, used to reimburse 
the owner, the owner must refund 
promptly the full amount of the unused 
balance to the tenant. 

(e) If the security deposit is not suffi-
cient to cover amounts the tenant owes 
under the lease, the owner may seek to 
collect the balance from the tenant.

§ 982.314 Move with continued tenant-
based assistance. 

(a) Applicability. This section states 
when a participant family may move to 
a new unit with continued tenant-
based assistance: 

(b) When family may move. A family 
may move to a new unit if: 

(1) The assisted lease for the old unit 
has terminated. This includes a termi-
nation because: 

(i) The PHA has terminated the HAP 
contract for the owner’s breach; or 

(ii) The lease has terminated by mu-
tual agreement of the owner and the 
tenant. 

(2) The owner has given the tenant a 
notice to vacate, or has commenced an 
action to evict the tenant, or has ob-
tained a court judgment or other proc-
ess allowing the owner to evict the ten-
ant. 

(3) The tenant has given notice of 
lease termination (if the tenant has a 
right to terminate the lease on notice 
to the owner, for owner breach or oth-
erwise). 

(c) How many moves. (1) A participant 
family may move one or more times 
with continued assistance under the 
program, either inside the PHA juris-
diction, or under the portability proce-
dures. (See § 982.353) 

(2) The PHA may establish: 
(i) Policies that prohibit any move by 

the family during the initial lease 
term; and 

(ii) Policies that prohibit more than 
one move by the family during any one 
year period. 

(3) The PHA policies may apply to 
moves within the PHA jurisdiction by 
a participant family, and to moves by a 
participant family outside the PHA ju-
risdiction under portability procedures. 

(d) Notice that family wants to move. (1) 
If the family terminates the lease on 
notice to the owner, the family must 
give the PHA a copy of the notice at 
the same time. 

(2) If the family wants to move to a 
new unit, the family must notify the 
PHA and the owner before moving from 
the old unit. If the family wants to 
move to a new unit that is located out-
side the initial PHA jurisdiction, the 
notice to the initial PHA must specify 
the area where the family wants to 
move. See portability procedures in 
subpart H of this part. 

(e) When PHA may deny permission to 
move. (1) The PHA may deny permis-
sion to move if the PHA does not have 
sufficient funding for continued assist-
ance. 

(2) At any time, the PHA may deny 
permission to move in accordance with 
§ 982.552 (grounds for denial or termi-
nation of assistance). 

[60 FR 34695, July 3, 1995, as amended at 64 
FR 56913, Oct. 21, 1999]

§ 982.315 Family break-up. 

(a) The PHA has discretion to deter-
mine which members of an assisted 
family continue to receive assistance 
in the program if the family breaks up. 
The PHA administrative plan must 
state PHA policies on how to decide 
who remains in the program if the fam-
ily breaks up. 

(b) The factors to be considered in 
making this decision under the PHA 
policy may include:
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