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Office of the Secretary, HUD § 58.45

Subpart E—Environmental Review 
Process: Environmental As-
sessments (EA’s)

§ 58.40 Preparing the environmental 
assessment. 

The responsible entity may prepare 
the EA using the HUD recommended 
format. In preparing an EA for a par-
ticular project, the responsible entity 
must: 

(a) Determine existing conditions and 
describe the character, features and re-
sources of the project area and its sur-
roundings; identify the trends that are 
likely to continue in the absence of the 
project. 

(b) Identify all potential environ-
mental impacts, whether beneficial or 
adverse, and the conditions that would 
change as a result of the project. 

(c) Identify, analyze and evaluate all 
impacts to determine the significance 
of their effects on the human environ-
ment and whether the project will re-
quire further compliance under related 
laws and authorities cited in § 58.5 and 
§ 58.6. 

(d) Examine and recommend feasible 
ways in which the project or external 
factors relating to the project could be 
modified in order to eliminate or mini-
mize adverse environmental impacts. 

(e) Examine alternatives to the 
project itself, if appropriate, including 
the alternative of no action. 

(f) Complete all environmental re-
view requirements necessary for the 
project’s compliance with applicable 
authorities cited in §§ 58.5 and 58.6. 

(g) Based on steps set forth in para-
graph (a) through (f) of this section, 
make one of the following findings: 

(1) A Finding of No Significant Im-
pact (FONSI), in which the responsible 
entity determines that the project is 
not an action that will result in a sig-
nificant impact on the quality of the 
human environment. The responsible 
entity may then proceed to § 58.43. 

(2) A finding of significant impact, in 
which the project is deemed to be an 
action which may significantly affect 
the quality of the human environment. 
The responsible entity must then pro-
ceed with its environmental review 
under subpart F or G of this part.

§ 58.43 Dissemination and/or publica-
tion of the findings of no significant 
impact. 

(a) If the responsible entity makes a 
finding of no significant impact, it 
must prepare a FONSI notice, using 
the current HUD-recommended format 
or an equivalent format. As a min-
imum, the responsible entity must 
send the FONSI notice to individuals 
and groups known to be interested in 
the activities, to the local news media, 
to the appropriate tribal, local, State 
and Federal agencies; to the Regional 
Offices of the Environmental Protec-
tion Agency having jurisdiction and to 
the HUD Field Office (or the State 
where applicable). The responsible en-
tity may also publish the FONSI notice 
in a newspaper of general circulation in 
the affected community. If the notice 
is not published, it must also be promi-
nently displayed in public buildings, 
such as the local Post Office and within 
the project area or in accordance with 
procedures established as part of the 
citizen participation process. 

(b) The responsible entity may dis-
seminate or publish a FONSI notice at 
the same time it disseminates or pub-
lishes the NOI/RROF required by § 58.70. 
If the notices are released as a com-
bined notice, the combined notice 
shall: 

(1) Clearly indicate that it is in-
tended to meet two separate procedural 
requirements; and 

(2) Advise the public to specify in 
their comments which ‘‘notice’’ their 
comments address. 

(c) The responsible entity must con-
sider the comments and make modi-
fications, if appropriate, in response to 
the comments, before it completes its 
environmental certification and before 
the recipient submits its RROF. If 
funds will be used in Presidentially de-
clared disaster areas, modifications re-
sulting from public comment, if appro-
priate, must be made before proceeding 
with the expenditure of funds.

§ 58.45 Public comment periods. 
Required notices must afford the 

public the following minimum com-
ment periods, counted in accordance 
with § 58.21:
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