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determine whether the applicant is in 
compliance with the Department’s 
AFHM requirements and the appli-
cant’s approved AFHM plan. Where al-
legations under this part may also con-
stitute a violation of the provisions of 
Executive Order 11063 or title VIII, the 
review will also determine compliance 
with the requirements thereof. The ap-
plicant shall be given at least five (5) 
days notice of the time set for any 
compliance review and the place or 
places for such review. The compliance 
review will cover the following areas: 

(1) Applicant’s sales and rental prac-
tices, including practices in soliciting 
buyers and tenants, determining eligi-
bility, selecting and rejecting buyers 
and renters, and in concluding sales 
and rental transactions. 

(2) Programs to attract minority and 
majority buyers and renters regardless 
of sex, including: 

(i) Use of advertising media, bro-
chures, and pamphlets; 

(ii) Conformance with both the De-
partment’s Fair Housing Poster Regu-
lation (24 CFR part 110) and the Adver-
tising Guidelines for Fair Housing (37 
FR 6700) and any revisions thereto. 

(3) Data relating to: 
(i) The size and location of units; 
(ii) Services provided; 
(iii) Sales and/or rental price ranges; 
(iv) The race and sex of buyers and/or 

renters; 
(v) Race and sex of staff engaged in 

sale or rental of dwellings. 
(4) Other matters relating to the 

marketing or sales of dwellings under 
HUD affirmative marketing require-
ments, the AFMH Plan and this part. 

[44 FR 47013, Aug. 9, 1979, as amended at 64 
FR 44096, Aug. 12, 1999]

§ 108.45 Compliance report. 
Following a compliance review, a re-

port shall be prepared promptly and 
the Assistant Secretary for FH&EO 
shall make a finding of compliance or 
noncompliance. If it is found that the 
applicant is in compliance, all parties 
concerned shall be notified of the find-
ings. Whenever a finding of noncompli-
ance is made pursuant to this part, the 
report shall list specifically the viola-
tions found. The applicant shall be sent 
a copy of the report by certified mail, 
return receipt requested, together with 

a notice that, if the matter cannot be 
resolved within ten days of receipt of 
the Notice, the matter will be referred 
to the Assistant Secretary for FH&EO 
to make a determination as to whether 
actions will be initiated for the imposi-
tion of sanctions. 

[44 FR 47013, Aug. 9, 1979, as amended at 64 
FR 44097, Aug. 12, 1999]

§ 108.50 Sanctions. 

Applicants failing to comply with the 
requirements of these regulations, the 
AFHM regulations, or an AFHM plan 
will make themselves liable to sanc-
tions authorized by law, regulations, 
agreements, rules, or policies gov-
erning the program pursuant to which 
the application was made, including, 
but not limited to, denial of further 
participation in Departmental pro-
grams and referral to the Department 
of Justice for suit by the United States 
for injunctive or other appropriate re-
lief.
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Subpart A—Purpose and 
Definitions

§ 110.1 Purpose. 

The regulations set forth in this part 
contain the procedures established by 
the Secretary of Housing and Urban 
Development with respect to the dis-
play of a fair housing poster by persons 
subject to sections 804 through 806 of 
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