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also result in the imposition of sanc-
tions by this Department. 

(b) Such sanctions as are specified by 
E.O. 11063, the contract through which 
Federal assistance is provided, and 
such sanctions as are specified by the 
rules or regulations of the Department 
governing the program under which 
Federal assistance to the project is 
provided, shall be applied in accord-
ance with the relevant regulations. Ac-
tions which may be taken include: can-
cellation or termination, in whole or in 
part of the contract or agreement; re-
fusal to approve a lender or withdrawal 
of approval; a determination of ineligi-
bility, suspension or debarment from 
any further assistance or contracts 
provided, however, that sanctions of 
debarment, suspension and ineligibility 
are subject to the Department’s regula-
tions under part 24 of this title; and 
provided further, that no sanction 
under section 302 (a), (b) and (c) of E.O. 
11063 shall be applied by the Assistant 
Secretary for FH&EO without the con-
currence of the Secretary. 

(c) The Department shall use its good 
offices in order to promote the aban-
donment of discriminatory practices 
with regard to residential property and 
related facilities provided with assist-
ance prior to the effective date of E.O. 
11063 and take appropriate actions per-
mitted by law including the institution 
of appropriate litigation to provide 
such equal housing opportunities. 

(d) In any case involving the failure 
of a lender to comply with the require-
ments of the Executive order or this 
part, the Assistant Secretary for 
FH&EO shall notify the Federal finan-
cial regulatory agency having jurisdic-
tion over the lender of the findings in 
the case.

§ 107.65 Referral to the Attorney Gen-
eral. 

If the results of a complaint inves-
tigation or a compliance review dem-
onstrate that any person, or specified 
class of persons, has violated E.O. 11063 
or this part, and efforts to resolve the 
matter(s) by informal means have 
failed, the Assistant Secretary for 
FH&EO in appropriate cases shall rec-
ommend that the General Counsel refer 
the case to the Attorney General of the 
United States for appropriate civil or 

criminal action under section 303 of 
E.O. 11063.
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§ 108.1 Purpose and application. 
(a) The primary purpose of this regu-

lation is to establish procedures for de-
termining whether or not an appli-
cant’s actions are in compliance with 
its approved Affirmative Fair Housing 
Marketing (AFHM) plan, AFHM Regu-
lation (24 CFR 200.600), and AFHM re-
quirements in Departmental programs. 

(b) These regulations apply to all ap-
plicants for participation in subsidized 
and unsubsidized housing programs ad-
ministered by the Department of Hous-
ing and Urban Development and to all 
other persons subject to Affirmative 
Fair Housing Marketing requirements 
in Department programs. 

(c) The term applicant includes: 
(1) All persons whose applications are 

approved for development or rehabili-
tation of: Subdivisions; multifamily 
projects; manufactured home parks of 
five or more lots, units or spaces; or 
dwelling units, when the applicant’s 
participation in FHA housing programs 
has exceeded, or would thereby exceed, 
development of five or more such 
dwelling units during the year pre-
ceding the application, except that 
there shall not be included in a deter-
mination of the number of dwelling 
units developed or rehabilitated by an 
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