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(i) For purposes of this subsection, 
commercial interest is one that furthers 
a commercial, trade, or profit interest 
as those terms are commonly under-
stood. Under this subsection, a ‘‘com-
mercial interest’’ shall not be an inter-
est served by a request for records sup-
porting the news dissemination func-
tion of the requester. All requesters 
who seek a fee waiver under section (h) 
of these regulations must disclose any 
and all commercial interests that 
would be furthered by the requested 
disclosure. NED shall use this informa-
tion, information in its possession, rea-
sonable inferences drawn from the re-
quester’s identity, and the cir-
cumstances surrounding the request to 
determine whether the requester has 
any commercial interest that would be 
furthered by the disclosure. If informa-
tion that NED obtains from a source 
other than the requester or reasonable 
inferences or other circumstances are 
used in making a determination under 
this paragraph (h)(5), NED shall inform 
the requester of the information, infer-
ences or circumstances that were used 
in its initial determination. The re-
quester may, prior to filing an appeal 
of the initial determination with the 
President of NED or his designee under 
paragraph (a)(2) of this section, provide 
further information to rebut such rea-
sonable inferences, or to clarify the 
circumstances of the request to the 
person responsible for the initial deter-
mination. Such action by the requester 
must occur within 20 days of the initial 
determination by NED. Within 10 days 
of receipt of such further information, 
clarification, or rebuttal, NED shall re-
spond to the additional information, 
reverse or affirm its original position 
and state the reasons for the reversal 
or affirmation. Receipt of an affirma-
tion by the requester shall constitute 
an initial denial of a request for pur-
poses of the appeal process described in 
paragraphs (a) and (b) of this section. 

(ii) NED shall consider the mag-
nitude of the requester’s commercial 
interest. In making a determination 
under this factor, NED shall consider 
the role that the disclosed information 
plays with respect to the requester’s 
commercial interests and the extent to 
which the disclosed information serves 

the range of commercial interests of 
the requester. 

(iii) NED shall weigh the magnitude 
of the identified commercial interest of 
the requester against the public inter-
est in disclosure in order to determine 
whether the disclosure is primarily in 
the commercial interest of the re-
quester. If the magnitude of the public 
interest in disclosure is greater than 
the magnitude of the requester’s com-
mercial interest, NED shall grant a full 
or partial fee waiver. 

(6) In determining whether to grant a 
full or partial fee waiver, NED shall, to 
the extent possible, identify the por-
tion of the information sought by the 
requester that satisfies the standard 
governing fee waivers set forth in 
FOIA, as amended, 5 U.S.C. 
552(a)(4)(A)(iii), and in paragraphs 
(h)(1) through (6) of this section, and 
grant a fee waiver with respect to 
those documents. Fees for reproduction 
of documents that do not satisfy these 
standards shall be assessed as provided 
in paragraphs (c) through (g) of this 
section. 

(i) Except as provided in paragraph 
(h)(5)(i) of this section, a requester may 
appeal a determination of the fees to be 
charged or waived under these regula-
tions as he or she would appeal an ini-
tial determination of documents to be 
disclosed under paragraphs (a) and (b) 
of this section. 

[51 FR 40162, Nov. 5, 1986, as amended at 52 
FR 37766, Oct. 9, 1987. Redesignated and 
amended at 64 FR 54540, Oct. 7, 1999]

§ 66.6 Exemptions. 

NED reserves the right to withhold 
records and information that are ex-
empt from disclosure under FOIA. See 5 
U.S.C. 552(b).

§ 66.7 Limitation of exemptions. 

FOIA does not authorize withholding 
of information or limit the availability 
of NED records to the public except as 
specifically stated in this part. Nor is 
authority granted to withhold informa-
tion from Congress.

§ 66.8 Reports. 

On or before March 1 of each calendar 
year, NED shall submit a reporting 
covering the preceding calendar year to 
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