Date Issued:

Date Opened Page 1 of 2
Solicitation Number 11-Apr-07 22-May-07
ABSTRACT OF OFFERS - CONSTRUCTION | CERTIFY that | have opened, read, and recorded on this abstract alt offers received in
W912P4-07-B-0006 response to this solicitation.
Issuing Cffice " L Date Signed
Department Of The Army . . . = 2 y/g "7
US Army Engineer District, Buffalo i OFFERS 4 °
1776 Niagara Street
Buffalo, NY 14207-3199 NG. 1 NO. 2 NO. 3
Project Title GOVERNMENT ESTIMATE OFFEROR OFFERQOR OFFEROR
Maumee River, Maintenance Dredging, B+B Dredging Co The King Company inc MCM Marine Inc
Toledo, Lucas County, Chie A HIRED TABUR 451 Dinwiddie St 13520 Barry St 1065 E Portage Ave
Portsmouth, VA 23704 Holland, Ml 49424 Sault Sainte Marie, Ml
B. REASONABLE CONTRACT [BID SECURITY (type & amountj BID SECURITY {type & amount) |BID SECURITY (type & amount
20% 20% 20%
NUMBER OF ADDENDA ISSUED: C. REASONABLE CONTRACT | ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED| ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED | ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED
One {1) Yes Yes Yes Yes
ltem Est. Unit Estimated Unit Estimated Unit Estimated Unit Estimated
NoO. vescnpuon ot Uttered item Quanuty unit Frice Amount rrice Amount rrce Amount Frice Amount
Scheduls A Tump
0001 Payment/Performance Bonds 1 Sum $10,800.00 $9,500.00 $15,000.00 $8,000.00
Q002 Schedule A Lump
Mob & Demab 1 Sum $157,000.00 $250,000.00 $150,000.00 $325,000.00
0003 Scheduie A Cubic
Maumee River 100,000 Yard $3.35 $335,000.60 $5.00 $500,000.00 $6.50 $650,000.60 $7.80 $780,000.00
0004 ochedule A Lump
TOTAL Sum $502,800.00 $799,500.00 $815,000.00 $1,113,000.00
GUUS Scheduls & Opion & Lubic
Additional Dredging - 15000 Yard $3.35 $50,250.00 $5.00 $75,000.00 $5.00 $75,000.00 $5.00 $75,000.00
008 Schedule A Option B Tump
Silent Inspector 1 Sum $34,000.00 $2,600.00 $0.00 $10,000.00
Q007 Schedule A Lump
TOTAL Sum $587,050.00 $877,000.00 $890,000.00 $1,198,000.00
Q008 Schedule B Lump
Payment/Pertormance Bonds 1 Sum No Bid NG Bid No Bid No Bid
000¢ Schedule B Lump
Mo & Lemeb 1 sum No Bid ND BId NO BId No B
o010 Scheduie B Cubic
Maumes River 100,000 Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
00T Scheguie B Lump
TOTAL sSum Mo Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0012 Schedule B Option A Cubic
Adaitional Uredging THU0U Yarg NO Bia NO BId MNO Bid No B
udt1s Scheaule B option B Lump
Silent Ingpecior 1 sum NO Bid MNo Bid NO IO NO bid
0014 Schedule B Lump
TOTAL Sum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

I certify that I have checked the bidders listed against the "Lists of Parties Excluded From Federal Procurement of Nonprocurement
Programs", the "List of Partics Indebted to the United States”, the EPA "List of Violating Facilities”, the HHUD "List of Debarred,

Suspended and Ineligible Contractors and Grantees”, and all changes, amendments and supilements thereto. A/@{/




OFFERS

NO. 4 NO. 5 NO. 6 NO. 7 NO. 8
OFFEROR OFFEROR OFFEROR OFFEROR OFFEROR

L uedtke Engineering Co
10 Fourth St, PO Box 111
Frankfort, Ml 49635

BID SECURITY (type & amount)
20%

BID SECURITY (type & amount)

BiD SECURITY (type & amount)

BID SECURITY (type & amount)

BID SECURITY (type & amount}

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED
Yes

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED-

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED

Unit Estimated
Price Amout

Unit Estimated
Price Amout

Unit Estimated
Price Amout

Unit Estimated
Price Amout

Unit Estimated
Price Amout

$4.,400.00

$563,000.00

$4.60 $460,000.00

$517,400.00

$4.60 $69,000.00

$5,000.00

$591,400.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




