Date Issued: Date Opened Page 1 of 1
Solicitation Number 18-Apr-06 18-May-06
ABSTRACT OF OFFERS - CONSTRUCTION I CERTIFY that | have opened, read, and recorded on this abstract all offers received in
W912P4-06-B-0008 response to this solicitation.
Issuing Office p i Date Signed
Department Of The Army / . ~ \\\“ \\‘\m\\&w Qq
US Army Engineer District, Buffalo OFFERS \\
1776 Niagara Street
Buffalo, NY 14207-3199 NO. 1 NO. 2 NO. 3
Project Title GOVERNMENT ESTIMATE OFFEROR OFFEROR OFFEROR
Lorain Harbor & Black River, Maintenance Dredging, Bayshore Contractor's Luedtke Engineering Co MCM Marine
Lorain, Lorain County, Ohio A HIRED LABOR 678 Front Ave NW 10 Fourth St, PO Box 111 1031 E Portage Ave
5rand Rapids MI 49504-5325 Frankfort Ml 49635 Sault Sainte Marie M 49783
B. REASONABLE CONTRACT [BID SECURITY (type & amount} BID SECURITY {type & amount) [BID SECURITY (type & amount
(without profit) Bid bond - 20% of Bid Bid bond - 20% of bid Bid bon - 20 % of bid
NUMBER OF ADDENDA ISSUED: C. REASONABLE CONTRACT | ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED] ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED [ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED
Two(2) (including profit)
ltem Est. Unit Estimated Unit Estimated Unit Estimated Unit Estimated
NO. Lescription ot Uttered item Quantity unit Hrice Amount rrice Amount rrice Amount rrice Amount
Schedule A Lump
0001 Payment/Performance Bonds 1 Sum $7,500.00 $3,900.00 $3,400.00 $18,500.00
0002 Schedule A Lump
Mob & Demob 1 Sum $75,000.00 $52,000.00 $85,000.00 $70,000.00
0003 Schedule A Cubic
Lorain Outer Harbor 5,000 Yard $20,000.00 $73,800.00 $22,500.00 $38,500.00
0004 Schedule A Cubtc
Lorain Black River 45,000 Yard $252,000.00 $280,800.00 $312,750.00 $333,000.00
0181013 ocnedule A Lump
TOTAL Sum $354,500.00 $410,600.00 $423,650.00 $460,000.00
0006 Schedule A Option Cubic
Lorain Black River Option 15,000 Yard $85,500.00 $93,600.00 $97,500.00 $111,000.00
0007 Schedule A Lump
TOTAL Sum $440,000.00 $504,200.00 $521,150.00 $571,000.00
0008 Schedule B Lump
Payment/Performance Bonds 1 Sum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0009 Schedule B Lump
Vob & Uemob 1 sum NO Bid NO Bid NO Bid No Bid
0010 Schedule B Cubic
Lorain Outer Harbor 5,000 Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0011 Schedule B Cubic
Lorain Black River 45,000 Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0012 Schedule B Lump
TOTAL Sum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
out3 Schedule B Uption Lupic
Lorain Black River Option 15,000 Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
0014 Schedule B Lump
TOTAL Sum No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Leertify that I have checked the bidders listed against the "Lists of Partics Excluded From Federal Procurement of Nonprocurement
Programs”, the "List of Parties Indebted to the United States”, the EPA "List of Vic ing Facilities", the HUD "List of Debarred,
Suspended and Ineligible Contractors and Grantees”, and all changes, amendments and supplements thereto.
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