

I CERTIFY that I have opened, read, and recorded on this abstract all offers received in response to this solicitation.

*And L Wheeler* OFFERS

Date Signed: 4/24/06

NO. 1

OFFEROR  
Luedtke Engineering Co  
10 Fourth St PO Box 111  
Frankfort MI 49635-0111

NO. 2

OFFEROR  
MCM Marine  
1031 E Portage Ave  
Sault Sainte Marie MI 49783

NO. 3

OFFEROR

Item No.	Description of Offered Item	Est. Quantity	Unit	Estimated Amount	Yes		Estimated Amount	Unit Price	Estimated Amount	Unit Price	Estimated Amount
					BID SECURITY (type & amount)	ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED					
<b>GOVERNMENT ESTIMATE</b> <b>A. HIRED LABOR</b> <b>B. REASONABLE CONTRACT (without profit)</b> <b>C. REASONABLE CONTRACT (including profit)</b>											
<b>NUMBER OF ADDENDA ISSUED:</b>											
One (1)											
0001	Schedule A Payment/Performance Bonds	1	Lump Sum	\$14,400.00			\$5,000.00				\$26,000.00
0002	Schedule A Mob & Demob	1	Lump Sum	\$170,000.00			\$68,500.00				\$98,000.00
0003	Schedule A Dredging Station 571-765	70,000	Cubic Yard	\$420,000.00			\$451,500.00				\$638,400.00
0004	Schedule A Dredging Station 456-571	15,000	Cubic Yard	\$58,500.00			\$82,500.00				\$115,050.00
0005	Schedule A Dredging Station 130-165	10,000	Cubic Yard	\$48,000.00			\$65,000.00				\$76,700.00
0006	Schedule A Option A	20,000	Cubic Yard	\$120,000.00			\$120,000.00				\$182,400.00
0007	Schedule A Option B	10,000	Cubic Yard	\$39,000.00			\$50,000.00				\$76,700.00
0008	Schedule A Option C	5,000	Cubic Yard	\$24,000.00			\$30,000.00				\$38,350.00
0009	Schedule A TOTAL		Lump Sum	\$893,900.00			\$872,500.00				\$1,251,600.00
0010	Schedule B Payment/Performance Bonds	1	Lump Sum	No Bid			No Bid				No Bid
0011	Schedule B Mob & Demob	1	Lump Sum	No Bid			No Bid				No Bid
0012	Schedule B Dredging Station 571-765	70,000	Cubic Yard	No Bid			No Bid				No Bid
0013	Schedule B Dredging Station 456-571	15,000	Cubic Yard	No Bid			No Bid				No Bid
0014	Schedule B Dredging Station 130-165	10,000	Cubic Yard	No Bid			No Bid				No Bid

I certify that I have checked the bidders listed against the "Lists of Parties Excluded From Federal Procurement of Nonprocurement Programs", the "List of Parties Indebted to the United States", the EPA "List of Violating Facilities", the HUD "List of Debarred, Suspended and Ineligible Contractors and Grantees", and all changes, amendments and supplements thereto.

*And L Wheeler*  
Linda L. Wheeler  
Contract Specialist

I CERTIFY that I have opened, read, and recorded on this abstract all offers received in response to this solicitation.

*Linda L. Wheeler*  
OFFERS  
Date Signed: 4/24/06

NO. 1 OFFEROR  
Luedtke Engineering Co  
10 Fourth St PO Box 111  
Frankfort MI 49635-0111  
OFFEROR  
MCM Marine  
1031 E Portage Ave  
Sault Sainte Marie MI 49783  
NO. 2 OFFEROR  
NO. 3 OFFEROR

BID SECURITY (type & amount)  
Bid bond - 20% of Bid  
BID SECURITY (type & amount)  
Bid bond - 20% of bid  
BID SECURITY (type & amount)  
Bid bon - 20 % of bid

ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED  
Yes  
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED  
Yes  
ADDENDA ACKNOWLEDGED

Unit Price	Estimated Amount	Unit Price	Estimated Amount	Unit Price	Estimated Amount
	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid
	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid

GOVERNMENT ESTIMATE  
A. HIRED LABOR  
B. REASONABLE CONTRACT (without profit)  
C. REASONABLE CONTRACT (including profit)

Unit Price	Estimated Amount	Unit Price	Estimated Amount
	No Bid		No Bid
	No Bid		No Bid
	No Bid		No Bid
	No Bid		No Bid

Unit	Estimated Amount	Unit	Estimated Amount
Cubic Yard	No Bid	Cubic Yard	No Bid
Cubic Yard	No Bid	Cubic Yard	No Bid
Cubic Yard	No Bid	Cubic Yard	No Bid
Lump Sum	No Bid	Lump Sum	No Bid

Est. Quantity	Description of Offered Item	Unit	Estimated Amount
20,000	Schedule B Option A	Cubic Yard	No Bid
10,000	Schedule B Option B	Cubic Yard	No Bid
5,000	Schedule B Option C	Cubic Yard	No Bid
	Schedule B TOTAL	Lump Sum	No Bid

NUMBER OF ADDENDA ISSUED:  
One (1)

Project Title  
Buffalo River & Black Rock Channel,  
Maintenance Dredging  
Buffalo, Erie County, NY

Issuing Office  
Department Of The Army  
US Army Engineer District, Buffalo  
1776 Niagara Street  
Buffalo, NY 14207-3199

Solicitation Number  
W912P4-06-B-0007

ABSTRACT OF OFFERS - CONSTRUCTION

I certify that I have checked the bidders listed against the "Lists of Parties Excluded From Federal Procurement of Nonprocurement Programs", the "List of Parties Indebted to the United States", the EPA "List of Violating Facilities", the HUD "List of Debarred, Suspended and Ineligible Contractors and Grantees", and all changes, amendments and supplements thereto.

*Linda L. Wheeler*  
Linda L. Wheeler  
Contract Specialist