\ \
Program No. C617-S Term February 1, 2003 To January 31, 2004
Title: ENGINEERING PRINTS
CHARRETTE MARYLAND BLUEPRINT | MBC PRECISION IMAGING |QUALITY REPRO CENTERS| CURRENT CONTRACTOR
BASIS OF SPRINGFIELD, VA FAIRFAX, VA FAIRFAX, VA ELMWOOD PARK, NJ NATL PRTG & COPYING
ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AWARD UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
l. COMPLETE PRODUCT:
A. COPY REDUCTIONS OR ENLARGEMENTS:
Original Vellum copies reduced from 24 x 36" down to
11 x17", 11 x 18", or 12 x 18"...................per sheel 3 0.75 2.25 1.25 3.75 1.50 4.50 0.50 1.50 0.55 1.65
(2) |Criginal Vellum copies enlarged from 11 x 17",
11 x 18", 0r 12 x 18" t0 24 x 36"................per sheet 2,721 1.50 4,081.50 1.25 3,401.25 1.50 4,081.50 1.50 4,081.50 1.65 4,217.55
B. REPRODUCTION COPIES:
(1) |Diazo Process on Conventional Blueprint stock:
(a) 11 x 17" .................o...oceece.co............per sheet| 18,523 0.18 3,334.14 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.12 2,222.76 0.11 2,037.53
(b) |11 x18".. ..per sheet| 3,360 0.20 672.00 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.12 403.20 0.14 470.40
{c) |12 x 18".. ..per sheet 3,496 0.22 769.12 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.12 419.52 0.15 524.40
(d) 24 x36"..................iiiiiiiiiiiiii o ......per sSheet 7,172 0.48 3,442.56 No Bid 0.00 No Bid 0.00 0.36 2,5681.92 0.36 2,5681.92
(2) |Photocopying on 20lb White Bond Paper:
(a) 8-1/2x 11" .....................c...................per sheet 4,380 0.04 175.20 0.04 175.20 0.04 175.20 0.04 175.20 0.025 109.50
(b) (11 x14" .................................persheet 3 0.25 0.75 0.04 0.12 0.04 0.12 0.10 0.30 0.50 1.50
{c) 11 x 17" ...............ceeeeeiii.......per sheet 50,667 0.18 9,120.06 0.05 2,5633.35 0.05 2,633.35 0.15 7,600.05 0.08 4,053.36
(d) |11 x18". ..............coocooiiiiii ... perT sheet 3 0.30 0.90 0.065 0.20 0.065 0.20 0.15 0.45 0.22 0.66
(e) |24 x36"...................ooieiiii ... peT sheet 3,807 0.48 1,827.36 0.28 1,065.96 0.27 1,027.89 0.54 2,055.78 0.98 3,730.86
. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:
(a) Products w/thickness under 3/4" -- Two or four wire
stitches................c..c.coccoiiiio oo ........per book 904 0.10 90.40 1.00 904.00 1.00 904.00 0.05 45.20 0.15 135.60
(b) Products w/thickness over 3/4" -- Two or three
metallic screwposts (including cost of screwposts)
...........per book 26 1.50 39.00 1.50 39.00 1.50 39.00 1.00 26.00 3.00 78.00
CONTRACTOR SUBTOTALS $23,655.24 $8,122.83 $8,765.76 $19,613.38 $17,942.93
ACCELERATED SCHEDULE 10.00% $2,355.52 $812.28 $876.58 $1,961.34 $1,794.29
. PERCENTAGE INCREASE 15.00% $353.33 20.00% $162.46 20.00% $175.32 25.00% $490.33 20.00% $358.86
CONTR’S TOTALS + PERCENTAGE INCR $23,908.57 $8,285.29 $8,941.08 $20,103.71 $18,301.79
DISCOUNT 0.00% $0.00 0.00% $0.00 0.00% $0.00 2.00% $402.07 2.00% $366.04
DISCOUNTED TOTALS $23,908.57 $8,285.29 $8,941.08 $19,701.64 $17,9356.75
AWARDED
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