
 TITLE: "SHORT-RUN, FAST SCHEDULE DUPLICATING"  /  Program 3802-S
TERM: October 1, 2007 to SEPTEMBER 30, 2008 (W/OPTIONS)

Basis ABC Reprographics John Phillips Printing Power Imaging Inc Colt Print Services, Inc.
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 050 Code 00079 State 050 Code 46337 State 000 Code 11111 State 050 Code 21690

Award x UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
I. COMPLETE PRODUCT: (Except for Items II thru IV)  

Black Image Only:
(a) 216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11") Cover and/or Text…        per printed side 1261200 x 0.0165 $20,809.80 0.025 $31,530.00 0.02 $25,224.00 0.025 $31,530.00
(b) 432 x 279  (17 x 11")…                                                    per printed side 54750 x 0.0225 $1,231.88 0.05 $2,737.50 0.04 $2,190.00 0.06 $3,285.00
(c) 305 x 457 m (12 x 18")…                                                 per printed side 7860 x 0.06 $471.60 0.05 $393.00 0.05 $393.00 0.19 $1,493.40

Color Copying:  
(d) Color Copying  216 x 279 mm  (8-1/2 x 11") per leaf…  one side only 87492 x 0.16 $13,998.72 0.25 $21,873.00 0.15 $13,123.80 0.29 $25,372.68
(e) Color Copying  216 x 279 mm  (8-1/2 x 11") per leaf…  face and back 68400 x 0.32 $21,888.00 0.50 $34,200.00 0.30 $20,520.00 0.60 $41,040.00
(f) Color Copying 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11") per leaf...        one side only 16800 x 0.20 $3,360.00 0.50 $8,400.00 0.30 $5,040.00 0.59 $9,912.00
(g) Color Copying 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11") per leaf…         face and back 7125 x 0.40 $2,850.00 1.00 $7,125.00 0.60 $4,275.00 1.20 $8,550.00
(h) Color Copying of Oversized Cover  305 x 457 mm (12 x 18")…  

                                                                          per leaf...    one side only 9840 x 0.20 $1,968.00 1.00 $9,840.00 0.30 $2,952.00 0.79 $7,773.60
(i) Color Copying of Oversized Cover 305 x 457 mm (12 x 18")…  

                                                                         per leaf…   face and back 8310 x 0.40 $3,324.00 2.00 $16,620.00 0.60 $4,986.00 1.60 $13,296.00
(j) Die Cut Tab Dividers (includes mylar reinforcement...,)  

1. Leaves duplicated/copied face only 960 x 0.75 $720.00 0.25 $240.00 0.30 $288.00 0.27 $259.20
2. Leaves duplicated/copied face and back 300 x 0.80 $240.00 0.27 $81.00 0.35 $105.00 0.37 $111.00

(k) Die Cut Tab Dividers (without mylar reinforcement…,)  
1. Leaves duplicated/copied face only 3300 x 0.25 $825.00 0.05 $165.00 0.10 $330.00 0.23 $759.00
2. Leaves duplicated/copied face and back 750 x 0.30 $225.00 0.10 $75.00 0.15 $112.50 0.33 $247.50

Other Items  
(l) Color Transparency, including material…                           per each 150 x 0.70 $105.00 0.44 $66.00 0.90 $135.00 0.75 $112.50
(m) Black & White Transparency, including material…           per each 75 x 0.45 $33.75 0.20 $15.00 0.50 $37.50 0.42 $31.50
(n) Foam Core Mounting (minimum 3/16" thick….per .09 sm (square foot) 1000 x 0.80 $800.00 3.71 $3,710.00 1.50 $1,500.00 4.00 $4,000.00
(o) Oversized color copy products………………..per .09 sm (square foot) 500 x 0.50 $250.00 5.50 $2,750.00 4.00 $2,000.00 6.50 $3,250.00
(p) Oversized B & W copying products………….per .09 sm (square foot) 300 x 0.12 $36.00 0.38 $114.00 0.30 $90.00 5.00 $1,500.00

II. LITIGATION/COPYING COMPLETE PRODUCT:  
(a) Trim size 216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11")  

1. Glass placement…copied face only…                          per each leaf 2265 x 0.15 $339.75 0.07 $158.55 0.10 $226.50 0.15 $339.75
2. Glass placement…copied face and back…                  per each leaf 7200 x 0.25 $1,800.00 0.15 $1,080.00 0.20 $1,440.00 0.30 $2,160.00

(b) Trim size 216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11") up to 279 x 432 mm (11 x 17")  
1. Glass placement…copied face only…                          per each leaf 840 x 0.20 $168.00 0.14 $117.60 0.10 $84.00 0.25 $210.00
2. Glass placement…copied face and back…                  per each leaf 1257 x 0.30 $377.10 0.14 $175.98 0.20 $251.40 0.50 $628.50

III. PAPER:  
Per 100 Leaves  

(a) White Offset Book, 75 g/m² (50-lb.), Bond/Xerographic, (20-lb) 6200 x 2.25 $13,950.00 No Charge 1.00 $6,200.00 No Charge
(b) White Offset Book, 90 g/m² (60-lb.) 100 x 1.70 $170.00 0.85 $85.00 1.50 $150.00 1.08 $108.00
(c) White Offset Book, 90 g/m² (60-lb.), pre-drilled and reinforced 45 x 1.98 $89.10 0.85 $38.25 4.00 $180.00 4.73 $212.85
(d) White Offset Book, 105 g/m² (70-lb.), pre-drilled and reinforced 45 x 2.28 $102.60 0.85 $38.25 4.00 $180.00 6.73 $302.85
(e) Color Writing, 75 g/m² (20-lb.) 285 x 1.92 $547.20 1.05 $299.25 1.50 $427.50 1.52 $433.20
(f) White Matte Coated Offset Book, 105 g/m² (70-lb.) 45 x 3.47 $156.15 0.85 $38.25 1.60 $72.00 2.60 $117.00
(g) White Matte Coated Offset Book, 120 g/m² (80-lb.) 30 x 3.96 $118.80 0.85 $25.50 1.80 $54.00 3.70 $111.00
(h) White Litho (Gloss) Coated Book, 105 g/m² (70-lb.) 90 x 3.52 $316.80 2.00 $180.00 2.20 $198.00 2.70 $243.00
(i) White Litho (Gloss) Coated Book, 120 g/m² (80-lb.) 75 x 4.13 $309.75 2.00 $150.00 2.20 $165.00 3.81 $285.75
(j) White or Colored Index, 200 g/m² (110-lb.) 300 x 4.66 $1,398.00 1.44 $432.00 2.00 $600.00 5.12 $1,536.00
(k) White or Colored Vellu-Finish Cover, 175 g/m² (65-lb.) 255 x 4.16 $1,060.80 5.00 $1,275.00 4.00 $1,020.00 11.72 $2,988.60
(l) White Matte Coated Cover, 215 g/m² (80-lb.) 60 x 7.17 $430.20 3.00 $180.00 3.50 $210.00 7.78 $466.80
(m) White Litho (Gloss) Coated Cover, 215 g/m² (80-lb.) 135 x 7.05 $951.75 6.00 $810.00 5.00 $675.00 7.97 $1,075.95
(n) Clear mylar or vinyl, .10 mil thickness 225 x 20.62 $4,639.50 25.00 $5,625.00 30.00 $6,750.00 18.00 $4,050.00

IV. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:
(a) Kraft or Rubber Band…                                                 each package 1500 x 0.05 $75.00 0.009 $13.50 0.10 $150.00 0.25 $375.00
(b) Wrapping or Shrink-film packaging…                         each package 6000 x 0.10 $600.00 0.15 $900.00 0.30 $1,800.00 0.40 $2,400.00
(c) Acco binding (includes materials)…                           per book 60 x 0.35 $21.00 0.10 $6.00 1.00 $60.00 0.50 $30.00
(d) Stitching with one or two stitches…                           per book 13545 x 0.02 $270.90 0.01 $135.45 0.03 $406.35 0.08 $1,083.60
(e) Saddle Stitch Binding…                                                per book 6000 x 0.10 $600.00 0.05 $300.00 0.19 $1,140.00 0.75 $4,500.00
(f) Perfect Binding…                                                           per book 960 x 0.75 $720.00 0.89 $854.40 1.00 $960.00 2.00 $1,920.00
(g) Comb Binding…                                                             per book 9000 x 0.50 $4,500.00 0.10 $900.00 0.80 $7,200.00 1.25 $11,250.00
(h) Spiral Wire Binding…                                                   per book 2820 x 0.75 $2,115.00 0.50 $1,410.00 1.20 $3,384.00 1.50 $4,230.00
(i) Drilling (except tab dividers)…                                   per 100 leaves 375 x 1.00 $375.00 0.75 $281.25 1.00 $375.00 0.50 $187.50
(j) Drilling (in addition to IV. (i) above………………...per 100 leaves 30 x 1.00 $30.00 0.75 $22.50 1.00 $30.00 0.50 $15.00
(k) Folding…                                                                        per 100 sheets 300 x 1.50 $450.00 0.75 $225.00 2.00 $600.00 0.40 $120.00
(l) Velo Binding…………………………………………..per book 750 x 0.75 $562.50 1.50 $1,125.00 1.00 $750.00 3.00 $2,250.00
(m) Tape Binding…                                                             per book 750 x 1.00 $750.00 1.50 $1,125.00 1.00 $750.00 0.75 $562.50
(n) Padding…                                                                      per pad 1200 x 0.15 $180.00 0.50 $600.00 0.30 $360.00 0.25 $300.00
(o)     1 Laminating…                                                    per .09 sm (square foot) 1050 x 0.75 $787.50 1.25 $1,312.50 1.00 $1,050.00 1.50 $1,575.00

2 Matte laminating…………………………….per .09 sm (square foot) 850 x 0.75 $637.50 0.65 $552.50 1.00 $850.00 1.50 $1,275.00
(p) Collating & inserting furnished items…                   per 100 leaves 120 x 5.00 $600.00 No Charge 5.00 $600.00 0.50 $60.00
(q) Collating and inserting furnished leaves, text, covers,spines,and  

 tab dividers into binders………………………………..per 100 leaves 150 x 5.00 $750.00 12.00 $1,800.00 5.00 $750.00 0.50 $75.00
(r) Vinyl pockets, includes inserting furnished items…    per pocket 450 x 0.75 $337.50 0.15 $67.50 0.50 $225.00 0.75 $337.50
(s) Slip Sheet…                                                                         per leaf 930 x 0.05 $46.50 0.012 $11.16 0.05 $46.50 0.05 $46.50
(t) Prepare for mailing (includes affixing label)…           per 100 pieces 225 x 0.25 $56.25 15.00 $3,375.00 10.00 $2,250.00 20.00 $4,500.00
(u) Cutting to smallet trim size…                                         per 100 leaves 60 x 1.00 $60.00 0.50 $30.00 2.00 $120.00 0.50 $30.00
(v) Binders (includes cost of required vinyl, metal looseleaf elements,  

binder boards, and sheet lifters  
1. 25 mm (1") capacity...                                                       per each            1620 x 2.95 $4,779.00 2.00 $3,240.00 1.80 $2,916.00 4.85 $7,857.00
2. 38 mm (1-1/2") capacity…                                               per each 1875 x 5.26 $9,862.50 3.00 $5,625.00 2.30 $4,312.50 5.69 $10,668.75
3. 51 mm (2") capacity…                                                      per each 1800 x 6.91 $12,438.00 3.50 $6,300.00 3.10 $5,580.00 6.74 $12,132.00
4. 76 mm (3") capactiy…                                                      per each 1200 x 8.23 $9,876.00 4.50 $5,400.00 4.50 $5,400.00 8.00 $9,600.00

(w) Perforating and Scoring……………………per perforation / score 3000 x 0.01 $30.00 No Charge 0.10 $300.00 0.05 $150.00
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 TITLE: "SHORT-RUN, FAST SCHEDULE DUPLICATING"  /  Program 3802-S
TERM: October 1, 2007 to SEPTEMBER 30, 2008 (W/OPTIONS)

Basis ABC Reprographics John Phillips Printing Power Imaging Inc Colt Print Services, Inc.
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 050 Code 00079 State 050 Code 46337 State 000 Code 11111 State 050 Code 21690

Award x UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
V. CD /DVD SERVICES:  

(1) CD Duplication
(a) 0-99 copies………………………………………………per each 1000 x 2.45 $2,450.00 4.00 $4,000.00 2.50 $2,500.00 2.90 $2,900.00
(b) 100-499 copies…………………………………………..per each 600 x 2.35 $1,410.00 1.75 $1,050.00 2.00 $1,200.00 2.70 $1,620.00
(c) 500-999 copies…………………………………………..per each 700 x 2.05 $1,435.00 1.25 $875.00 1.50 $1,050.00 2.30 $1,610.00
(d) 1,000 + copies…………………………………………...per each 1100 x 1.80 $1,980.00 1.00 $1,100.00 1.00 $1,100.00 1.40 $1,540.00

(2) DVD Duplication  
(a) 0-99 copies………………………………………………per each 700 x 2.55 $1,785.00 6.20 $4,340.00 3.50 $2,450.00 4.50 $3,150.00
(b) 100-499 copies…………………………………………..per each 400 x 2.45 $980.00 4.50 $1,800.00 3.00 $1,200.00 3.50 $1,400.00
(c) 500-999 copies…………………………………………..per each 600 x 2.20 $1,320.00 2.50 $1,500.00 2.50 $1,500.00 3.40 $2,040.00
(d) 1,000 + copies…………………………………………...per each 1100 x 1.95 $2,145.00 2.12 $2,332.00 2.00 $2,200.00 2.30 $2,530.00

(3) CD / DVD Labeling  
(a) 0-99 copies………………………………………………per each 1700 x No Charge 0.95 $1,615.00 0.70 $1,190.00 0.30 $510.00
(b) 100-499 copies…………………………………………..per each 1000 x No Charge 0.75 $750.00 0.50 $500.00 0.30 $300.00
(c) 500-999 copies…………………………………………..per each 1300 x No Charge 0.65 $845.00 0.40 $520.00 0.30 $390.00
(d) 1,000 + copies…………………………………………...per each 2200 x No Charge 0.55 $1,210.00 0.30 $660.00 0.10 $220.00
(e) Clear Clam Shell…………………………………………per each 600 x 0.25 $150.00 0.33 $198.00 0.50 $300.00 0.60 $360.00
(f) Slim Line Jewel Case……………………………………per each 2400 x 0.21 $504.00 0.27 $648.00 0.40 $960.00 0.60 $1,440.00
(g) DVD Case……………………………………………….per each 2800 x 0.31 $868.00 0.40 $1,120.00 0.50 $1,400.00 0.70 $1,960.00
(h) Tyvek Window Sleeve…………………………………per each 400 x 0.15 $60.00 0.21 $84.00 0.20 $80.00 0.40 $160.00

VI. SHIPPING CHARGES:Shipments over 54 kg (120lbs)  
(a) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone  1  COLORADO 6 x 65.32 $391.92 70.00 $420.00 108.00 $648.00 35.00 $210.00
(b) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 2  NEW MEXICO 2 x 66.95 $133.90 60.00 $120.00 108.00 $216.00 43.00 $86.00
(c) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 3   UTAH 1.5 x 66.95 $100.43 50.00 $75.00 118.00 $177.00 45.00 $67.50
(d) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 4  WYOMING 1.5 x 68.58 $102.87 51.00 $76.50 126.00 $189.00 50.00 $75.00
(e) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 5  MONTANA 1.5 x 66.95 $100.43 55.00 $82.50 157.00 $235.50 60.00 $90.00
(f) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 6  MARYLAND, 1.5 x 227.50 $341.25 60.00 $90.00 240.00 $360.00 79.00 $118.50

VIRGINIA,AND THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
(g) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 7 UNITED STATES  

east of the Missippi excluding those areas in Zone 6 1.5 253.49 $380.24 65.00 $97.50 240.00 $360.00 89.00 $133.50
(h) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 8 The Continental  

United States West of the Mississippi  excluding those areas in  
Zones 1 through 5. 1.5 x 203.22 $304.83 69.00 $103.50 240.00 $360.00 100.00 $150.00

 
 

CONTRACTOR TOTAL $168,515.25 $210,786.89 $165,906.05 $268,383.48
Less Discount NET NET NET 1.000% $2,683.83

DISCOUNTED TOTAL $168,515.25 $210,786.89 $165,906.05 $265,699.65
AWARDED
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 TITLE: "SHORT-RUN, FAST SCHEDULE DUPLICATING"  /  Program 3802-S
TERM: October 1, 2007 to SEPTEMBER 30, 2008 (W/OPTIONS)

Basis FedEx Kinko's Office Depot BSD National Hirschfeld LLC Pyramid Print Graphics
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 050 Code 48830 State 111 Code 00000 State 050 Code 62518 State 050 Code 72421

Award x UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
I. COMPLETE PRODUCT: (Except for Items II thru IV)  

Black Image Only:
(a) 216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11") Cover and/or Text…        per printed side 1261200 x 0.024 $30,268.80 0.022 $27,746.40 0.015 $18,918.00 0.175 $220,710.00
(b) 432 x 279  (17 x 11")…                                                    per printed side 54750 x 0.048 $2,628.00 0.044 $2,409.00 0.025 $1,368.75 0.7 $38,325.00
(c) 305 x 457 m (12 x 18")…                                                 per printed side 7860 x 0.096 $754.56 0.68 $5,344.80 0.20 $1,572.00 0.10 $786.00

Color Copying:  
(d) Color Copying  216 x 279 mm  (8-1/2 x 11") per leaf…  one side only 87492 x 0.30 $26,247.60 0.37 $32,372.04 0.20 $17,498.40 0.35 $30,622.20
(e) Color Copying  216 x 279 mm  (8-1/2 x 11") per leaf…  face and back 68400 x 0.60 $41,040.00 0.37 $25,308.00 0.40 $27,360.00 0.70 $47,880.00
(f) Color Copying 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11") per leaf...        one side only 16800 x 0.60 $10,080.00 0.74 $12,432.00 0.40 $6,720.00 0.60 $10,080.00
(g) Color Copying 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11") per leaf…         face and back 7125 x 1.20 $8,550.00 0.74 $5,272.50 0.80 $5,700.00 1.00 $7,125.00
(h) Color Copying of Oversized Cover  305 x 457 mm (12 x 18")…  

                                                                          per leaf...    one side only 9840 x 1.80 $17,712.00 8.98 $88,363.20 0.80 $7,872.00 0.60 $5,904.00
(i) Color Copying of Oversized Cover 305 x 457 mm (12 x 18")…  

                                                                         per leaf…   face and back 8310 x 3.60 $29,916.00 17.96 $149,247.60 1.50 $12,465.00 1.00 $8,310.00
(j) Die Cut Tab Dividers (includes mylar reinforcement...,)  

1. Leaves duplicated/copied face only 960 x 0.30 $288.00 0.563 $540.48 0.16 $153.60 0.25 $240.00
2. Leaves duplicated/copied face and back 300 x 0.45 $135.00 1.14 $342.00 0.19 $57.00 0.50 $150.00

(k) Die Cut Tab Dividers (without mylar reinforcement…,)  
1. Leaves duplicated/copied face only 3300 x 0.15 $495.00 0.563 $1,857.90 0.08 $264.00 0.20 $660.00
2. Leaves duplicated/copied face and back 750 x 0.30 $225.00 1.126 $844.50 0.11 $82.50 0.40 $300.00

Other Items  
(l) Color Transparency, including material…                           per each 150 x 1.50 $225.00 0.68 $102.00 1.25 $187.50 0.80 $120.00
(m) Black & White Transparency, including material…           per each 75 x 0.75 $56.25 0.32 $24.00 0.75 $56.25 0.80 $60.00
(n) Foam Core Mounting (minimum 3/16" thick….per .09 sm (square foot) 1000 3.71 $3,710.00 2.63 $2,630.00 5.50 $5,500.00 No Bid
(o) Oversized color copy products………………..per .09 sm (square foot) 500 5.50 $2,750.00 5.99 $2,995.00 0.80 $400.00 No Bid
(p) Oversized B & W copying products………….per .09 sm (square foot) 300 0.38 $114.00 0.34 $102.00 0.40 $120.00 No Bid

II. LITIGATION/COPYING COMPLETE PRODUCT:  
(a) Trim size 216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11")  

1. Glass placement…copied face only…                          per each leaf 2265 x 0.23 $520.95 0.19 $430.35 0.10 $226.50 0.8 $1,812.00
2. Glass placement…copied face and back…                  per each leaf 7200 x 0.46 $3,312.00 0.38 $2,736.00 0.18 $1,296.00 0.16 $1,152.00

(b) Trim size 216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11") up to 279 x 432 mm (11 x 17")  
1. Glass placement…copied face only…                          per each leaf 840 x 0.46 $386.40 0.19 $159.60 0.18 $151.20 0.15 $126.00
2. Glass placement…copied face and back…                  per each leaf 1257 x 0.92 $1,156.44 0.38 $477.66 0.25 $314.25 0.30 $377.10

III. PAPER:  
Per 100 Leaves  

(a) White Offset Book, 75 g/m² (50-lb.), Bond/Xerographic, (20-lb) 6200 x No Charge 0.01 $62.00 0.75 $4,650.00 0.90 $5,580.00
(b) White Offset Book, 90 g/m² (60-lb.) 100 x 2.50 $250.00 0.038 $3.80 0.95 $95.00 0.90 $90.00
(c) White Offset Book, 90 g/m² (60-lb.), pre-drilled and reinforced 45 x 10.00 $450.00 1.43 $64.35 2.93 $131.85 2.50 $112.50
(d) White Offset Book, 105 g/m² (70-lb.), pre-drilled and reinforced 45 x 10.00 $450.00 1.43 $64.35 4.03 $181.35 2.50 $112.50
(e) Color Writing, 75 g/m² (20-lb.) 285 x 2.50 $712.50 0.01 $2.85 1.39 $396.15 1.50 $427.50
(f) White Matte Coated Offset Book, 105 g/m² (70-lb.) 45 x 17.60 $792.00 0.075 $3.38 2.31 $103.95 1.50 $67.50
(g) White Matte Coated Offset Book, 120 g/m² (80-lb.) 30 x 17.60 $528.00 0.075 $2.25 2.64 $79.20 1.75 $52.50
(h) White Litho (Gloss) Coated Book, 105 g/m² (70-lb.) 90 x 17.60 $1,584.00 0.075 $6.75 2.25 $202.50 2.50 $225.00
(i) White Litho (Gloss) Coated Book, 120 g/m² (80-lb.) 75 x 17.60 $1,320.00 0.075 $5.63 2.56 $192.00 2.50 $187.50
(j) White or Colored Index, 200 g/m² (110-lb.) 300 x 5.60 $1,680.00 0.038 $11.40 3.67 $1,101.00 1.50 $450.00
(k) White or Colored Vellu-Finish Cover, 175 g/m² (65-lb.) 255 x 9.60 $2,448.00 0.038 $9.69 3.65 $930.75 4.50 $1,147.50
(l) White Matte Coated Cover, 215 g/m² (80-lb.) 60 x 17.60 $1,056.00 0.075 $4.50 4.98 $298.80 4.00 $240.00
(m) White Litho (Gloss) Coated Cover, 215 g/m² (80-lb.) 135 x 17.60 $2,376.00 0.075 $10.13 4.98 $672.30 5.00 $675.00
(n) Clear mylar or vinyl, .10 mil thickness 225 x 10.00 $2,250.00 0.38 $85.50 10.00 $2,250.00 40.00 $9,000.00

IV. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:
(a) Kraft or Rubber Band…                                                 each package 1500 x 0.25 $375.00 0.04 $60.00 0.10 $150.00 0.5 $750.00
(b) Wrapping or Shrink-film packaging…                         each package 6000 x 0.45 $2,700.00 0.56 $3,360.00 0.20 $1,200.00 0.25 $1,500.00
(c) Acco binding (includes materials)…                           per book 60 x 0.75 $45.00 0.04 $2.40 0.18 $10.80 0.50 $30.00
(d) Stitching with one or two stitches…                           per book 13545 x 0.02 $270.90 0.018 $243.81 0.07 $948.15 0.025 $338.63
(e) Saddle Stitch Binding…                                                per book 6000 x 0.23 $1,380.00 0.272 $1,632.00 0.20 $1,200.00 0.20 $1,200.00
(f) Perfect Binding…                                                           per book 960 x 2.28 $2,188.80 3.50 $3,360.00 1.00 $960.00 1.50 $1,440.00
(g) Comb Binding…                                                             per book 9000 x 1.20 $10,800.00 1.42 $12,780.00 0.60 $5,400.00 0.85 $7,650.00
(h) Spiral Wire Binding…                                                   per book 2820 x 1.20 $3,384.00 1.99 $5,611.80 0.80 $2,256.00 0.95 $2,679.00
(i) Drilling (except tab dividers)…                                   per 100 leaves 375 x 0.70 $262.50 1.124 $421.50 0.20 $75.00 0.75 $281.25
(j) Drilling (in addition to IV. (i) above………………...per 100 leaves 30 x 0.70 $21.00 2.06 $61.80 0.20 $6.00 0.75 $22.50
(k) Folding…                                                                        per 100 sheets 300 x 2.70 $810.00 0.04 $12.00 0.10 $30.00 1.50 $450.00
(l) Velo Binding…………………………………………..per book 750 1.20 $900.00 1.42 $1,065.00 1.50 $1,125.00 0.85 $637.50
(m) Tape Binding…                                                             per book 750 x 1.20 $900.00 1.42 $1,065.00 0.65 $487.50 0.85 $637.50
(n) Padding…                                                                      per pad 1200 x 0.45 $540.00 0.30 $360.00 0.45 $540.00 0.25 $300.00
(o)     1 Laminating…                                                    per .09 sm (square foot) 1050 x 0.75 $787.50 1.34 $1,407.00 0.25 $262.50 1.50 $1,575.00

2 Matte laminating…………………………….per .09 sm (square foot) 850 0.75 $637.50 1.34 $1,139.00 0.30 $255.00 1.50 $1,275.00
(p) Collating & inserting furnished items…                   per 100 leaves 120 x 45.00 $5,400.00 0.04 $4.80 12.00 $1,440.00 0.50 $60.00
(q) Collating and inserting furnished leaves, text, covers,spines,and  

 tab dividers into binders………………………………..per 100 leaves 150 x 45.00 $6,750.00 0.04 $6.00 20.00 $3,000.00 5.00 $750.00
(r) Vinyl pockets, includes inserting furnished items…    per pocket 450 x 1.00 $450.00 0.19 $85.50 0.52 $234.00 1.00 $450.00
(s) Slip Sheet…                                                                         per leaf 930 x 0.049 $45.57 0.01 $9.30 0.02 $18.60 0.05 $46.50
(t) Prepare for mailing (includes affixing label)…           per 100 pieces 225 x 12.00 $2,700.00 0.04 $9.00 12.00 $2,700.00 5.00 $1,125.00
(u) Cutting to smallet trim size…                                         per 100 leaves 60 x 1.34 $80.40 0.224 $13.44 1.50 $90.00 0.60 $36.00
(v) Binders (includes cost of required vinyl, metal looseleaf elements,  

binder boards, and sheet lifters  
1. 25 mm (1") capacity...                                                       per each            1620 x 2.24 $3,628.80 1.64 $2,656.80 2.75 $4,455.00 3.00 $4,860.00
2. 38 mm (1-1/2") capacity…                                               per each 1875 x 3.14 $5,887.50 2.69 $5,043.75 3.13 $5,868.75 3.50 $6,562.50
3. 51 mm (2") capacity…                                                      per each 1800 x 4.04 $7,272.00 3.29 $5,922.00 3.72 $6,696.00 5.00 $9,000.00
4. 76 mm (3") capactiy…                                                      per each 1200 x 4.94 $5,928.00 4.34 $5,208.00 5.82 $6,984.00 6.00 $7,200.00

(w) Perforating and Scoring……………………per perforation / score 3000 x 0.03 $90.00 90.00 $270,000.00 0.25 $750.00 0.15 $450.00
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 TITLE: "SHORT-RUN, FAST SCHEDULE DUPLICATING"  /  Program 3802-S
TERM: October 1, 2007 to SEPTEMBER 30, 2008 (W/OPTIONS)

Basis FedEx Kinko's Office Depot BSD National Hirschfeld LLC Pyramid Print Graphics
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 050 Code 48830 State 111 Code 00000 State 050 Code 62518 State 050 Code 72421

Award x UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
V. CD /DVD SERVICES:  

(1) CD Duplication
(a) 0-99 copies………………………………………………per each 1000 x 3.50 $3,500.00 1.94 $1,940.00 7.42 $7,420.00 No Bid
(b) 100-499 copies…………………………………………..per each 600 x 2.99 $1,794.00 1.94 $1,164.00 3.12 $1,872.00 No Bid
(c) 500-999 copies…………………………………………..per each 700 x 1.99 $1,393.00 1.94 $1,358.00 1.32 $924.00 No Bid
(d) 1,000 + copies…………………………………………...per each 1100 x 1.29 $1,419.00 1.94 $2,134.00 0.63 $693.00 No Bid

(2) DVD Duplication  
(a) 0-99 copies………………………………………………per each 700 x 7.99 $5,593.00 2.34 $1,638.00 8.12 $5,684.00 No Bid
(b) 100-499 copies…………………………………………..per each 400 x 5.49 $2,196.00 2.34 $936.00 3.74 $1,496.00 No Bid
(c) 500-999 copies…………………………………………..per each 600 x 3.49 $2,094.00 2.34 $1,404.00 1.72 $1,032.00 No Bid
(d) 1,000 + copies…………………………………………...per each 1100 x 2.49 $2,739.00 2.34 $2,574.00 0.84 $924.00 No Bid

(3) CD / DVD Labeling  
(a) 0-99 copies………………………………………………per each 1700 x 0.95 $1,615.00 2.34 $3,978.00 0.75 $1,275.00 No Bid
(b) 100-499 copies…………………………………………..per each 1000 x 0.49 $490.00 2.34 $2,340.00 0.75 $750.00 No Bid
(c) 500-999 copies…………………………………………..per each 1300 x 0.39 $507.00 2.34 $3,042.00 0.75 $975.00 No Bid
(d) 1,000 + copies…………………………………………...per each 2200 x 0.39 $858.00 2.34 $5,148.00 0.75 $1,650.00 No Bid
(e) Clear Clam Shell…………………………………………per each 600 x 0.45 $270.00 0.05 $30.00 0.44 $264.00 No Bid
(f) Slim Line Jewel Case……………………………………per each 2400 x 0.45 $1,080.00 0.05 $120.00 0.50 $1,200.00 No Bid
(g) DVD Case……………………………………………….per each 2800 x 0.45 $1,260.00 0.05 $140.00 0.50 $1,400.00 No Bid
(h) Tyvek Window Sleeve…………………………………per each 400 x 0.45 $180.00 0.05 $20.00 0.19 $76.00 No Bid

VI. SHIPPING CHARGES:Shipments over 54 kg (120lbs)  
(a) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone  1  COLORADO 6 x 100.00 $600.00 89.00 $534.00 78.00 $468.00 32.00 $192.00
(b) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 2  NEW MEXICO 2 x 110.00 $220.00 120.00 $240.00 78.00 $156.00 45.00 $90.00
(c) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 3   UTAH 1.5 135.00 $202.50 90.00 $135.00 84.00 $126.00 43.00 $64.50
(d) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 4  WYOMING 1.5 135.00 $202.50 120.00 $180.00 90.00 $135.00 45.00 $67.50
(e) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 5  MONTANA 1.5 135.00 $202.50 180.00 $270.00 93.00 $139.50 45.00 $67.50
(f) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 6  MARYLAND, 1.5 x 250.00 $375.00 300.00 $450.00 132.00 $198.00 45.00 $67.50

VIRGINIA,AND THE DISTRICT OF COLUMBIA
(g) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 7 UNITED STATES  

east of the Missippi excluding those areas in Zone 6 1.5 250.00 $375.00 300.00 $450.00 198.00 $297.00 45.00 $67.50
(h) Cost per 45 kg (cwt) Delivered /Shipped to Zone 8 The Continental  

United States West of the Mississippi  excluding those areas in  
Zones 1 through 5. 1.5 x 250.00 $375.00 180.00 $270.00 210.00 $315.00 85.00 $127.50

 
 

CONTRACTOR TOTAL $290,242.47 $714,108.50 $165,960.10 $443,963.18
Less Discount NET NET NET NET

DISCOUNTED TOTAL $290,242.47 $714,108.50 $165,960.10 $443,963.18
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