

Item No.	DESCRIPTION	Basis of Award	O'NEIL PRINTERS INC State 250 UNIT RATE	Code 65645 COST	THE TOWNE PRINTER State 250 UNIT RATE	Code 87320 COST
I.	COMPLETE PRODUCT (Except Items II. & III.):					
	Running Per 100 Copies					
	Black Image Only:					
(a)	216 x 279 mm (8½ x 11") Cover and/or Text.....Per page	360 x	18.00	6,480.00	5.00	1,800.00
(b)	432 x 279 mm (17 x 11") foldins.....per printed side	40 x	34.00	1,360.00	6.00	240.00
	Color Copying:					
(c)	Color copying 216 x 279 mm (8½ x 11").....per leaf copied one side only	10 x	No Bid		70.00	700.00
(d)	Color copying 216 x 279 mm (8½ x 11").....per leaf copied face and back	2 x	No Bid		109.00	218.00
(e)	Color copying a 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11")per leaf copied one side only	10 x	No Bid		120.00	1,200.00
(f)	Color copying a 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11")per leaf copied face and back	2 x	No Bid		189.00	378.00
II.	PAPER: Per 100 leaves					
(a)	White Offset Book, 75 g/m ² (50 lb.), Bond, or Writing, 75 g/m ² (20 lb.)	70 x	21.00	1,470.00	0.80	56.00
(b)	Colored Writing, 75 g/m ² (20 lb.)	20 x	24.00	480.00	1.20	24.00
(c)	White or Colored Index, 200 g/m ² (110 lb.)	190 x	38.00	7,220.00	3.50	665.00
(d)	White or Colored Vellum-Finish Cover, 175 g/m ² (65 lb.)	15 x	34.00	510.00	2.50	37.50
III.	ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:					
(a)	Stitching with one or two stitches.....per book	100 x	0.42	42.00	0.02	2.00
(b)	Folding.....per 100 sheets	20 x	4.00	80.00	1.85	37.00
(c)	Drilling.....per 100 leaves	20 x	8.00	160.00	1.65	33.00
(d)	Trimming.....per 100 leaves 216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11")	12 x	6.00	72.00	0.45	5.40
(e)	Shrink film wrap...per package/wrap	200 x	2.00	400.00	0.10	20.00

CONTRACTOR TOTALS	\$18,274.00	1% 10 Days	NET	\$5,415.90
DISCOUNT IF any				
DISCOUNTED TOTALS	\$18,274.00			\$5,415.90

AWARDED