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Basis Valliant Enterprises Albuquerque Reprographics Mesa Reprographics
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 300 Code 64161 State 300 Code 03285 State 300 Code 58016

Award UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
I. COMPLETE PRODUCT:  

(a) Blackline/Bluelines…………......per .09 sm (sq. ft.) 125,000 x No Bid 0.12 15,000.00 0.08 10,000.00
(b) Sepias..………………………......per .09 sm (sq. ft.) 12,610 x No Bid N/A 0.09 1,134.90
(c) Larger than 279 x 432 mm (11 x 17")  electrostatic  

copies  
1. Copier Xerographic paper……..per .09 sm (sq. ft.) 6,200 x 0.50 3,100.00 0.10 620.00 0.12 744.00
2. Tracing paper.…………..……...per  .09 sm (sq. ft.) 500 x No Bid 0.50 250.00 0.13 65.00
3. Plastic sheeting………….……..per .09 sm (sq. ft.) 450 x No Bid 0.80 360.00 1.09 490.50

(d) B/W Coyping/Duplicating copies 216 x 279 mm  
 (8-1/2 x 11")………………….…per printed side 240,000 x 0.02 4,800.00 0.05 12,000.00 0.049 11,760.00

(e) Black/White Copying.duplicating copies 279 x 432  
mm (11 x 17")……………..……..per printed side 9,260 x 0.05 463.00 0.10 926.00 0.069 638.94

(f) Diazo plastic sheeting………....per .09 mm (sq. ft.) 975 x No Bid N/A 0.29 282.75
(g) Color copying  216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11") ……..  

………………..……..per leaf copied one side only 1,650 x 0.45 742.50 0.79 1,303.50 0.59 973.50
(h) Color copying  216 x 279 mm (8-1/2 x 11")………  

……………………..per leaf copied face and back 1,020 x 0.86 877.20 1.40 1,428.00 0.69 703.80
(i) Color copying 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11")………….  

…………………..…..per leaf copied one side only 500 x 0.55 275.00 0.99 495.00 0.69 345.00
(j) Color copying 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11")………….  

……………………...per leaf copied face and back 240 x 1.01 242.40 1.80 432.00 0.87 208.80
(k) Color copying over 432 x 279 mm (17 x 11")……..  

…………………..…..per leaf copied one side only 120 x 10.00 1,200.00 7.50 900.00 0.69 82.80
(l) CAD Plotting……………….…per .09 sm (sq. ft.) 64 x No Bid 2.00 128.00 0.33 21.12

(m) Color Transparencies………....per  .09 sm (sq. ft.) 40 x No Bid 7.50 300.00 0.69 27.60
(n) Aerial Photo Reproductions…per .09 sm (sq.ft.) 25 x No Bid 8.50 212.50 0.33 8.25
(o) Large format Color Inkjet Plotting from electronic  

files up to 600 dpi and printed on gloss finish  
presentation bond (includes the cost of the paper)  
……………………………..…….per .09 sm (sq. ft.) 110 x 10.00 1,100.00 6.50 715.00 3.49 383.90

(p) Die Cut Tab Dividers (includes mylar reinforcment,  
composition, die-cutting, paper, collating and  
inserting):  

1. Leaves duplicated/copied face only………………. 75 x 1.09 81.75 0.75 56.25 0.60 45.00
2. Leaves duplicated/copied face and back………… 40 x 1.11 44.40 1.50 60.00 0.66 26.40

(q) Die Cut Tab Dividers (without mylar reinforcment,  
composition, die-cutting, paper, collating and  
inserting):  

1. Leaves duplicated/copied face only………………. 100 x 0.28 28.00 0.35 35.00 0.50 50.00
2. Leaves duplicated/copied face and back………… 35 x 0.30 10.50 0.70 24.50 0.56 19.60

II. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS:  
(a) Collate into sets……………..……per 100 leaves 500 x 2.30 1,150.00 15.00 7,500.00 NoCharge
(b) Side stitching (one to three stitches)…...per book 210 x 0.11 23.10 N/A NoCharge
(c) Folding…………..…………………..per 100 forms 400 x 1.15 460.00 1.50 600.00 NoCharge
(d) Drilling (per run)…………………...per 100 leaves 98 x 1.15 112.70 1.00 98.00 NoCharge
(e) Acco Binding (including cost of fasteners with  

compressors)………………………...……per book 75 x No Bid 1.75 131.25 3.99 299.25
(f) Comb Binding……………………...……per book 750 x 0.99 742.50 1.75 1,312.50 3.49 2,617.50
(g) Spiral Wire Binding……………...………per book 500 x 0.99 495.00 2.75 1,375.00 3.99 1,995.00
(h) Tape Binding………………….…………per book 100 x 0.99 99.00 5.00 500.00 1.00 100.00
(i) Padding……………………………………..per pad 280 x 0.52 145.60 1.50 420.00 0.50 140.00
(j) Standard Jewel Box Case (includes insertion of  

CD into case)……………………………..per each 50 x 5.00 250.00 0.50 25.00 0.49 24.50
(k) CD blanks……………………………...…per each 50 x 5.00 250.00 1.00 50.00 0.50 25.00
(l) Wrapping  (shrink film or kraft paper…per wrap 105 x 0.25 26.25 N/A NoCharge

(m) Laminating……………….…….per .09 sm (sq. ft.) 85 x 1.25 106.25 2.25 191.25 1.69 143.65
(n) Collating & inserting furnished items..per 100 lvs. 60 x 21.00 1,260.00 15.00 900.00 2.00 120.00
(o) Slip Sheet………………...………………..per leaf 300 x 0.03 9.00 0.05 15.00 0.02 6.00
(p) Cutting to a smaller trim size……...per 100 leaves 75 x 3.00 225.00 15.00 1,125.00 NoCharge
(q) Mounting on foam core board (includes cost  

of foam core board)………...…..per .09 sm ( sq. ft.) 25 x 4.17 104.25 3.75 93.75 4.25 106.25
(r) PMT (85 line screen halftone photoprints, (include-  

ing any intermediate steps necessary--i.e. film/  
paper etc.)…………………….…per page-size unit 45 x No Bid N/A 0.89 40.05

(s) Trim/Page-size Film……….……per page-size unit 75 x No Bid N/A NoCharge
(t) Monochrome Scanning…….……………per scan 25 x 5.00 125.00 2.25 56.25 0.50 12.50
(u) Color Scanning……………………………per scan 25 x 5.00 125.00 15.00 375.00 12.00 300.00
(v) Download files from Government furnished  

electronic files (includes cost of disc or cartridge)  
1. CD ROM disc…...……………………….per disc 100 x 10.00 1,000.00 10.00 1,000.00 1.00 100.00
2. Zip or Jazz drive………….………….per cartridge 25 x 10.00 250.00 15.00 375.00 1.00 25.00

III. PAPER:  Per 100 leaves  
(a) White Offset Book, 75 g/m² (50 lb.), White Bond  

75 g/m² (20 lb.), White Writing, 75 g/m², (20 lb.),  
or White Plain Copier , Xerographic, 75-90 g/m²  
(20-24 lb.)…………………………………………… 900 x 2.35 2,115.00 5.00 4,500.00 NoCharge

(b) White Bond, Smooth Finish, 90 g/m² (24 lb.)……. 110 x 7.00 770.00 5.50 605.00 NoCharge
(c) Colored Writing, 75 g/m² (20 lb.)………………… 100 x 2.00 200.00 6.00 600.00 NoCharge
(d) White Index, 200 g/m², (110 lb.)………………….. 120 x 15.00 1,800.00 15.00 1,800.00 NoCharge
(e) Colored Cover, 175-215 g/m² (65-80 lb.)……..….. 80 x 4.00 320.00 15.00 1,200.00 NoCharge
(f) Clear mylar or vinyl, .10 mil thickness…………….. 60 x 8.00 480.00 50.00 3,000.00 NoCharge

IV. PACKING AND SEALING FOR DISTRIBUTION:  
Preparing for mailing:  

(a) Single copy in kraft envelope (up to 200 leaves)…  
………………………………………..each envelope 750 x 0.10 75.00 2.00 1,500.00 NoCharge

(b) Multiple copies in kraft envelope (up to 200 leaves)  
…………………………………………each envelope 100 x 0.10 10.00 3.00 300.00 NoCharge

(c) Single or multiple copies (over 200 leaves), up to  
5  kg., (12 lbs.), in cushioned shipping bags, or  
wrapped in shipping bundles (max. gross weight  

 PAGE 1 of 2



 TITLE:  "Reproduction Drawings"  / PROGRAM:  2800-S
TERM: March 1, 2005 TO February 28, 2006 (w/Options) 

 

gross weight 6 kg. ( lbs.))………………………..  
……………………………....…each bag or bundle 50 x 1.02 51.00 5.00 250.00 NoCharge

(d) Quantities over 5 kg. (12 lbs.),  up to 11 kg. (24 lbs.)  
wrapped in shipping bundles,  or packed in  
shipping containers, at contractor's option (max.  
gross weight 12 kg. (27 lbs.))……………………….  
……………………...each bundle or container 20 x 1.78 35.60 5.00 100.00 NoCharge

(e) Quantities over 11 kg. (24 lbs.),  up to 16 kg. (36 lb.)  
packed in shipping containers,  (maximum gross  
 weight 18.144 kg. (40 lbs.))………………………….  
…………………………….………...each container 10 x 2.32 23.20 5.00 50.00 NoCharge

(f) Affixing furnished labels………...…per 100 labels 8 x 2.00 16.00 15.00 120.00 NoCharge
(g) Creating & Affixing labels from furnished electronic  

media/disc…………………………….per 100 labels 10 x 45.00 450.00 25.00 250.00 NoCharge

CONTRACTOR TOTALS $26,269.20 $65,663.75 $34,066.56
DISCOUNT if any 1.000% 262.69 NET 1.000% 340.67

DISCOUNTED TOTALS $26,006.51 $65,663.75 $33,725.89

AWARDED
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