
 TITLE:  "HUD Short-run Copying /Printing" (including color copying)  PROGRAM: 1811-SP
TERM: February 1, 2005 TO January 31, 2006 (w/options)

 

Basis Copylink FedEx Kinko's Aurora Copy Center Lehrer's Printing
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 350 Code 23426 State 050 Code 48857 State 050 Code 08583 State 050 Code 51355

Award UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
I. FILMS:  Per Film  

(a) Trim/Page-size unit……………………………………………………… 15 x No Bid 10.00 150.00 4.50 67.50 18.00 270.00
(b) Line…………………………………………..………….per illustration 3 x No Bid 5.00 15.00 4.00 12.00 18.00 54.00
(c) Square-finish halftone……………………….……….per illustration 2 x No Bid 10.00 20.00 4.00 8.00 18.00 36.00

II. PRINTING AND BINDING:  
(a) Forms, printed in black or color other than black, per printed side  

Format 1  
1. Makeready and Setup Charges……………………………………….. 48 x 0.035 1.68 10.00 480.00 No Charge 2.50 120.00
2. Per 100 Copies………………………………………………………….. 312 x 3.50 1,092.00 2.50 780.00 20.00 6,240.00 4.50 1,404.00

(b) Saddle-Stitched Product printed in Black or color other than black  
Format 2  per page unit  

1. Makeready and Setup Charges……………………………………….. 1250 x 0.04 50.00 No Charge No Charge 2.50 3,125.00
2. Per 100 Copies………………………………………………………….. 3125 x 4.00 12,500.000 5.00 15,625.00 35.00 109,375.00 9.00 28,125.00

(c) Side-Stitched Product printed in Black or color other than Black  
Format 2  per page unit  

1. Makeready and Setup Charges……………………………………….. 2500 x 0.04 100.00 No Charge No Charge 2.50 6,250.00
2. Per 100 Copies………………………………………………………….. 6250 x 4.00 25,000.00 2.00 12,500.00 35.00 218,750.00 4.50 28,125.00

(d) Loose-leaf Product printed in Black or color other than Black  
Format 2  per page unit  

1. Makeready and Setup Charges……………………………………….. 6000 x 0.40 2,400.00 No Charge No Charge 2.50 15,000.00
2. Per 100 Copies………………………………………………………….. 15000 x 4.00 60,000.00 1.50 22,500.00 25.00 375,000.00 3.75 56,250.00

(e) Tab divider printed in black ink Format 2  
1. Makeready and Setup Charges……………………………………….. 20 x 0.10 2.00 1.49 29.80 No Charge 2.50 50.00
2. Per 100 Copies………………………………………………………….. 40 x 10.00 400.00 10.00 400.00 13.00 520.00 10.00 400.00

III. COLOR COPYING (including collating  as ordered) EXCEPT    
ITEM IV. LIGATION WORK, V. PAPER, AND ADDITIONAL  
OPERATIONS:
Running Per 100 Copies  

(a) Color Copying  (per printed side):  
1. 216 x 279 mm  (8½ x 11")……………………………………………….. 125 x 25.000 3,125.00 39.00 4,875.00 55.00 6,875.00 75.00 9,375.00
2. 432 x 279 mm  (17 x 11")………………………………………………… 60 x 49.000 2,940.00 68.00 4,080.00 95.00 5,700.00 150.00 9,000.00

IV. LITIGATION/COPYING COMPLETE PRODUCT (Includes PAPER,  
White Text Stock Only), REMOVING STAPLES (from originals),  
COLLATING, AND STAPLING AS ORDERED):  
Running Per 100 Copies

(a) Trim size 216 x 279 mm (8½ x 11"):  
1. Glass placement copied face only………………..…….per each leaf 300 x 15.00 4,500.00 15.00 4,500.00 6.00 1,800.00 4.50 1,350.00
2. Glass placement copied face and back……………...….per each leaf 225 x 25.00 5,625.00 20.00 4,500.00 10.00 2,250.00 6.00 1,350.00

(b) Trim size over 216 x 279 mm (8½ x 11") up to 279 x 432 mm (11 x 17"):  
1. Glass placement copied face only………………...…….per each leaf 100 x 25.00 2,500.00 20.00 2,000.00 6.00 600.00 7.00 700.00
2. Glass placement copied face and back……………..….per each leaf 75 x 35.00 2,625.00 30.00 2,250.00 12.00 900.00 10.00 750.00

V. PAPER:  Per 100 leaves  
(a) White, Offset Book, 75 g/m²  (50 lb.)…………………………………. 7320 x 3.50 25,620.00 0.86 6,295.20 7.00 51,240.00 0.60 4,392.00
(b) White, Offset Book, 90 g/m²  (60 lb.)………………………………….. 2200 x 3.50 7,700.00 0.99 2,178.00 8.00 17,600.00 0.85 1,870.00
(c) White and Colored Writing, 75 g/m²  (20 lb.)…………………………. 210 x 4.90 1,029.00 1.16 243.60 7.00 1,470.00 0.85 178.50
(d) White and Colored Index, 200 g/m²  (110 lb.)………………………….. 175 x 5.50 962.50 2.36 413.00 9.00 1,575.00 1.17 204.75
(e) White 25% Rag Bond, 75 g/m²  (20 lb.)………………………………… 40 x No Bid 3.71 148.40 10.00 400.00 2.75 110.00
(f) White Gummed Labels (Davac or equal), 67-81 g/m²  (45-55 lb.)……. 20 x No Bid 10.00 200.00 10.00 200.00 No Bid
(g) White Chemical Transfer Bond, CF/CB, 50-55 g/m² (13-15 lb.)…….. 140 x 5.00 700.00 3.23 452.20 12.00 1,680.00 2.00 280.00
(h) Colored Chemical Transfer Bond, CF/CB, 50-55 g/m²  (13-15 lb.)….. 55 x 5.50 302.50 3.92 215.60 15.00 825.00 2.50 137.50
(i) White Chemical Transfer Bond, CFB, 50-65 g/m² (13-17 lb.)……… 80 x 6.00 480.00 3.27 261.60 12.00 960.00 3.10 248.00
(j) Colored Chemical Transfer Bond, CFB, 50-65 g/m²  (13-17 lb.)……. 60 x 6.50 390.00 3.96 237.60 14.00 840.00 3.80 228.00
(k) White and Colored Vellum Finish Cover, 135 g/m²  (50 lb.)………….. 4 x No Bid 2.18 8.72 8.00 32.00 2.60 10.40

VI. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS BOTH FORMATS: (as applicable to  
each format according to specifications):   Changes apply to any 
trim size.

(a) Padding, up to 100 sheets per pad……………..……………..per pad 24 x 0.15 3.60 0.10 2.40 3.00 72.00 0.07 1.68
(b) Comb binding (including materials)……………………per 100 books 12 x 15.00 180.00 100.00 1,200.00 65.00 780.00 185.00 2,220.00
(c) Collating multiple forms into sets (Format 1), includes edge bonding  

   of carbonless sets……………………………………..per 100 leaves 210 x 1.00 210.00 1.00 210.00 7.00 1,470.00 1.50 315.00
(d) Banding individual books/sets…………………………per paper band 125 x No Bid 0.10 12.50 1.75 218.75 0.10 12.50
(e) Acco Fasteners (including materials)………………….per 100 books 12 x No Bid 40.00 480.00 22.00 264.00 100.00 1,200.00
(f) Drilling (except tab dividers)……………………………per 100 leaves 8 x 1.00 8.00 1.00 8.00 4.00 32.00 1.00 8.00

CONTRACTOR TOTALS $160,446.28 $87,271.62 $807,756.25 $173,150.33
DISCOUNT if any 1% 15 Days Net 2%-10 Days 2%-10 Days

DISCOUNTED TOTALS $160,446.28 $87,271.62 $807,756.25 $173,150.33
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 TITLE:  "HUD Short-run Copying /Printing" (including color copying)  PROGRAM: 1811-SP
TERM: February 1, 2005 TO January 31, 2006 (w/options)

 

Basis Colt Reproduction Post Net R C Printing PYRAMID PRINT
Item No. DESCRIPTION of State 050 Code 21690 State 050 Code 70201 State 430 Code 73004 State 050 Code 72421

Award UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST UNIT RATE COST
I. FILMS:  Per Film  

(a) Trim/Page-size unit……………………………………………………… 15 x N/A 0.25 3.75 5.50 82.50 4.25 63.75
(b) Line…………………………………………..………….per illustration 3 x N/A 0.05 0.15 5.00 15.00 6.00 18.00
(c) Square-finish halftone……………………….……….per illustration 2 x N/A 0.30 0.60 5.75 11.50 6.00 12.00

II. PRINTING AND BINDING:  
(a) Forms, printed in black or color other than black, per printed side  

Format 1  
1. Makeready and Setup Charges……………………………………….. 48 x No Charge No Charge 1.50 72.00 No Charge
2. Per 100 Copies………………………………………………………….. 312 x 2.00 624.00 1.50 468.00 1.50 468.00 1.35 421.20

(b) Saddle-Stitched Product printed in Black or color other than black  
Format 2  per page unit  

1. Makeready and Setup Charges……………………………………….. 1250 x No Charge No Charge 1.50 1,875.00 No Charge
2. Per 100 Copies………………………………………………………….. 3125 x 3.00 9,375.00 3.00 9,375.00 3.50 10,937.50 5.00 15,625.00

(c) Side-Stitched Product printed in Black or color other than Black  
Format 2  per page unit  

1. Makeready and Setup Charges……………………………………….. 2500 x No Charge No Charge 1.50 3,750.00 No Charge
2. Per 100 Copies………………………………………………………….. 6250 x 2.50 15,625.00 2.50 15,625.00 2.50 15,625.00 2.50 15,625.00

(d) Loose-leaf Product printed in Black or color other than Black  
Format 2  per page unit  

1. Makeready and Setup Charges……………………………………….. 6000 x No Charge No Charge 1.50 9,000.00 No Charge
2. Per 100 Copies………………………………………………………….. 15000 x 2.00 30,000.00 1.35 20,250.00 2.00 30,000.00 1.35 20,250.00

(e) Tab divider printed in black ink Format 2  
1. Makeready and Setup Charges……………………………………….. 20 x 1.00 20.00 No Charge 3.50 70.00 4.00 80.00
2. Per 100 Copies………………………………………………………….. 40 x 15.00 600.00 9.50 380.00 8.75 350.00 8.75 350.00

III. COLOR COPYING (including collating  as ordered) EXCEPT    
ITEM IV. LIGATION WORK, V. PAPER, AND ADDITIONAL  
OPERATIONS:
Running Per 100 Copies  

(a) Color Copying  (per printed side):  
1. 216 x 279 mm  (8½ x 11")……………………………………………….. 125 x 39.00 4,875.00 39.00 4,875.00 58.75 7,343.75 59.00 7,375.00
2. 432 x 279 mm  (17 x 11")………………………………………………… 60 x 69.00 4,140.00 69.00 4,140.00 115.00 6,900.00 125.00 7,500.00

IV. LITIGATION/COPYING COMPLETE PRODUCT (Includes PAPER,  
White Text Stock Only), REMOVING STAPLES (from originals),  
COLLATING, AND STAPLING AS ORDERED):  
Running Per 100 Copies

(a) Trim size 216 x 279 mm (8½ x 11"):  
1. Glass placement copied face only………………..…….per each leaf 300 x 2.00 600.00 9.00 2,700.00 5.00 1,500.00 6.00 1,800.00
2. Glass placemen copied face and back……………...….per each leaf 225 x 4.00 900.00 14.00 3,150.00 10.00 2,250.00 11.00 2,475.00

(b) Trim size over 216 x 279 mm (8½ x 11") up to 279 x 432 mm (11 x 17"):  
1. Glass placement copied face only………………...…….per each leaf 100 x 3.00 300.00 16.00 1,600.00 15.00 1,500.00 10.00 1,000.00
2. Glass placement copied face and back……………..….per each leaf 75 x 6.00 450.00 22.00 1,650.00 25.00 1,875.00 18.00 1,350.00

V. PAPER:  Per 100 leaves  
(a) White, Offset Book, 75 g/m²  (50 lb.)…………………………………. 7320 x 1.00 7,320.00 0.75 5,490.00 0.85 6,222.00 0.80 5,856.00
(b) White, Offset Book, 90 g/m²  (60 lb.)………………………………….. 2200 x 1.60 3,520.00 0.80 1,760.00 0.90 1,980.00 0.82 1,804.00
(c) White and Colored Writing, 75 g/m²  (20 lb.)…………………………. 210 x 1.70 357.00 0.80 168.00 1.40 294.00 1.35 283.50
(d) White and Colored Index, 200 g/m²  (110 lb.)………………………….. 175 x 4.50 787.50 2.60 455.00 3.00 525.00 3.00 525.00
(e) White 25% Rag Bond, 75 g/m²  (20 lb.)………………………………… 40 x 4.40 176.00 3.75 150.00 3.45 138.00 3.50 140.00
(f) White Gummed Labels (Davac or equal), 67-81 g/m²  (45-55 lb.)……. 20 x 8.00 160.00 6.25 125.00 5.75 115.00 5.75 115.00
(g) White Chemical Transfer Bond, CF/CB, 50-55 g/m² (13-15 lb.)…….. 140 x 4.05 567.00 3.50 490.00 3.20 448.00 3.10 434.00
(h) Colored Chemical Transfer Bond, CF/CB, 50-55 g/m²  (13-15 lb.)….. 55 x 4.10 225.50 3.50 192.50 3.20 176.00 3.10 170.50
(i) White Chemical Transfer Bond, CFB, 50-65 g/m² (13-17 lb.)……… 80 x 4.90 392.00 3.75 300.00 3.35 268.00 3.20 256.00
(j) Colored Chemical Transfer Bond, CFB, 50-65 g/m²  (13-17 lb.)……. 60 x 5.00 300.00 3.75 225.00 3.35 201.00 3.20 192.00
(k) White and Colored Vellum Finish Cover, 135 g/m²  (50 lb.)………….. 4 x 3.40 13.60 2.75 11.00 2.45 9.80 2.45 9.80

VI. ADDITIONAL OPERATIONS BOTH FORMATS: (as applicable  
to each Format according to specifications):  Changes apply to  
 any trim size

(a) Padding, up to 100 sheets per pad……………..……………..per pad 24 x 0.25 6.00 0.20 4.80 0.25 6.00 0.12 2.88
(b) Comb binding (including materials)……………………per 100 books 12 x 90.00 1,080.00 85.00 1,020.00 85.00 1,020.00 85.00 1,020.00
(c) Collating multiple forms into sets (Format 1), includes edge bonding  

   of carbonless sets……………………………………..per 100 leaves 210 x 0.50 105.00 1.25 262.50 1.50 315.00 1.20 252.00
(d) Banding individual books/sets…………………………per paper band 125 x 0.10 12.50 0.10 12.50 0.25 31.25 0.18 22.50
(e) Acco Fasteners (including materials)………………….per 100 books 12 x 9.00 108.00 50.00 600.00 10.00 120.00 3.00 36.00
(f) Drilling (except tab dividers)……………………………per 100 leaves 8 x 0.40 3.20 0.75 6.00 1.50 12.00 1.25 10.00

CONTRACTOR TOTALS $82,642.30 $75,489.80 $105,506.30 $85,074.13
DISCOUNT if any 1.000% 826.42 2%-10 Days 5.000% 5,275.32 2%-10 Days

DISCOUNTED TOTALS $81,815.88 $75,489.80 $100,230.99 $85,074.13
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