
1 Legislation to ban MTBE in Indiana on July 23, 2004 was signed by Governor O’Bannon on March 14, 2002. The
State does not require RFG.

Impact of Renewable Fuels Standard/MTBE Provisions of S. 517
Requested by Senators Daschle and Murkowski

Introduction

In response to a letter from Senators Daschle and Murkowski dated April 10, 2002, the Energy
Information Administration (EIA) is providing additional analysis of the impact of the
Renewable Fuels Standard (RFS) and methyl tertiary butyl ether (MTBE) ban provisions of S.
517. As requested, the projected consumer cost of the S. 517 provisions is compared with a
Reference Case that assumes a 2 percent oxygen requirement is maintained and that already-
scheduled MTBE restrictions or bans become effective in 14 States: Arizona, California,
Colorado, Connecticut, Indiana1, Iowa, Illinois, Kansas, Michigan, Minnesota, Nebraska, New
York, South Dakota, and Washington. In order to isolate the impact of the RFS provision, EIA
has provided another “RFS/No MTBE Ban” Case, which assumes no national requirement to ban
MTBE. The consumer impact of the S. 517 provisions is also compared to a scenario that
assumes that all remaining Northeast States with reformulated gasoline (RFG) markets will ban
MTBE in 2004, referred to as the “19-State MTBE Ban” Case. In this Case, MTBE is also
banned in RFG markets in New Hampshire, Massachusetts, Rhode Island, Pennsylvania, and
New Jersey.

The “S. 517” Case reflects a national phase-down of MTBE by 2006, and a 10 year ramp-up in
the amount of renewable fuels included in gasoline, reaching a maximum of 5 billion gallons per
year in 2012, and the elimination of the oxygen requirement on RFG. S. 517 contain a provision
for States to waive the MTBE ban. As stated by Senators Daschle and Murkowski in their April
10 letter, this provision is implemented in the EIA analysis by assuming that MTBE may
continue to be used at 13 percent of current levels for those States that have not banned MTBE.
This results in an effective MTBE reduction of 87 percent.

Senators Daschle and Murkowski requested that this analysis reflect the effects of renewables
banking and trading; however, this was not feasible given the requirement for rapid delivery of
the analysis. The impact of a national credit trading program on local markets is complicated by
its connection to State tax programs and local air quality concerns. As with previous EIA
analyses, this analysis represents RFG as a homogeneous product and does not capture the
different variations of RFG produced at different refineries. Based on EIA’s experience with
electricity industry analysis that incorporated credit trading and banking for sulfur dioxide
emissions, credit trading reduced the impact on consumer prices and banking provided greater
flexibility for the timing of implementation. Generally speaking, a credit trading and banking
program would be expected to facilitate greater market efficiency and probably reduce costs of
compliance, such as transportation and blending costs. Since this analysis does not incorporate
credit trading and banking, the results are likely to represent an upper bound of the costs
associated with S. 517.

Results of MTBE Ban Cases



The RFS provision of S. 517 includes an RFS schedule that requires consumption of 2.3 billion
gallons of renewable fuels by 2004, increasing to 5.0 billion gallons by 2012. After 2012, S. 517
requires renewable fuels to maintain the same percentage of transportation fuels that will be
achieved in 2012. This analysis projects that the Reference Case market demand for ethanol
would be 260 million gallons greater than the amount specified by the RFS schedule in 2004 due
to the implementation of State-level MTBE restrictions in 14 States (Figure 1). The 19-State
MTBE Ban Case indicates, that if other Northeastern States with RFG markets followed suit and
banned MTBE in the same year, an additional 540 million gallons of ethanol would be required

in 2004, assuming the oxygen requirement were maintained. This analysis projects that the RFS
and MTBE provisions of S. 517 Case, assuming an 87 percent reduction in MTBE blending,
would result in ethanol blending that is 390 million gallons per year higher than the 19-State
MTBE Ban Case and 880 million gallons per year higher than the Reference Case in 2006. The
projected level of ethanol blending in the S. 517 Case is 3.62 billion gallons, 720 million gallons
above the specified RFS target for 2006. Ethanol blending would no longer be in excess of the
RFS targets by 2009 due to incremental growth of the specified targets. The use of renewable
fuels is projected to be below the RFS targets after 2009 due to an S. 517 provision that provides

a 1.5 gallon credit for every gallon of cellulose (biomass) ethanol, although the industry would
still be in technical compliance with the provision.



Unlike EIA’s previous analysis of RFS/MTBE provisions, the Reference Case of this analysis
reflects legislation in 14 States that would restrict or ban the use of MTBE by 2004. The
inclusion of these State-level restrictions in Reference Case projections results in average annual
prices for all gasoline that are roughly 2 cents per gallon higher than they would have been
without the restrictions (Figure 2); and RFG prices that are 3.5 to 4 cents per gallon higher
(Figure 3). The price impact of implementing the 14 State-level restrictions is slightly dampened
over time as incremental changes at refineries minimize the impact of the lost MTBE volumes.
If other Northeast States with RFG markets are assumed to ban MTBE, as in the 19-State MTBE
Ban Case, the average annual price of all gasoline is projected to be about a half-cent per gallon
higher than the Reference Case, and the RFG price is 2 cents per gallon higher than the
Reference Case. The S. 517 price projections represent an additional price increase above the
19-State MTBE Ban of about 0.5 cent per gallon for all gasoline and 2 cents per gallon for RFG
in 2006.



Relative to the Reference Case, the projected price increases of the S. 517 case translate into a
higher annual cost to consumers of $2.06 billion on average between 2006 and 2020. When
compared with the 19-State MTBE Ban Case, S. 517 is projected to result in an increase in the
average annual cost to consumers of $980 million.

Results of Renewable Fuel Standard Without an MTBE Ban

The RFS/No MTBE Ban Case reflects the impact of an RFS in the absence of the MTBE phase-
down provisions of S. 517. Because of the State-level MTBE restrictions occurring in 2004, the
renewable fuels consumption prior to 2006 is identical to Reference Case levels and above the
RFS targets. Starting in 2006, projected renewable fuels consumption is essentially determined
by the RFS targets with the adjustment for the cellulose ethanol credit (Figure 4). Adjusting for
the cellulose ethanol credit, renewable fuels consumed for transportation is projected to be 60
million gallons below the specified RFS target for 2006, and 130 million gallons below the 2012
target, although still in technical compliance. The 2006 projections in this Case are about 100
million gallons above the market demand for ethanol projected in the Reference Case. Due to
incremental growth in the RFS schedule, the difference between the RFS amount (adjusted for
the cellulose credit) and the market demand projected in the Reference Case widens to 1.90
billion gallons per year by 2012.



As indicated in the RFS/No MTBE Ban Case, an RFS provision without a Federal MTBE ban is
projected to raise gasoline prices by up to 0.5 cent per gallon for all gasoline, and by up to 1 cent
per gallon for RFG. These price increases imply an annual average cost to consumers between
2006 and 2020 that is $260 million higher than in the Reference Case.






