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which produce and handle organic agri-
cultural products. 

(b) A State organic program must 
meet the requirements for organic pro-
grams specified in the Act. 

(c) A State organic program may 
contain more restrictive requirements 
because of environmental conditions or 
the necessity of specific production or 
handling practices particular to the 
State or region of the United States. 

(d) A State organic program must as-
sume enforcement obligations in the 
State for the requirements of this part 
and any more restrictive requirements 
approved by the Secretary. 

(e) A State organic program and any 
amendments to such program must be 
approved by the Secretary prior to 
being implemented by the State. 

§ 205.621 Submission and determina-
tion of proposed State organic pro-
grams and amendments to ap-
proved State organic programs. 

(a) A State organic program’s gov-
erning State official must submit to 
the Secretary a proposed State organic 
program and any proposed amendments 
to such approved program. 

(1) Such submission must contain 
supporting materials that include stat-
utory authorities, program description, 
documentation of the environmental 
conditions or specific production and 
handling practices particular to the 
State which necessitate more restric-
tive requirements than the require-
ments of this part, and other informa-
tion as may be required by the Sec-
retary. 

(2) Submission of a request for 
amendment of an approved State or-
ganic program must contain sup-
porting materials that include an ex-
planation and documentation of the en-
vironmental conditions or specific pro-
duction and handling practices par-
ticular to the State or region, which 
necessitates the proposed amendment. 
Supporting material also must explain 
how the proposed amendment furthers 
and is consistent with the purposes of 
the Act and the regulations of this 
part. 

(b) Within 6 months of receipt of sub-
mission, the Secretary will: Notify the 
State organic program’s governing 
State official of approval or dis-

approval of the proposed program or 
amendment of an approved program 
and, if disapproved, the reasons for the 
disapproval. 

(c) After receipt of a notice of dis-
approval, the State organic program’s 
governing State official may submit a 
revised State organic program or 
amendment of such a program at any 
time. 

§ 205.622 Review of approved State or-
ganic programs. 

The Secretary will review a State or-
ganic program not less than once dur-
ing each 5-year period following the 
date of the initial program approval. 
The Secretary will notify the State or-
ganic program’s governing State offi-
cial of approval or disapproval of the 
program within 6 months after initi-
ation of the review. 

§§ 205.623–205.639 [Reserved] 

FEES 

§ 205.640 Fees and other charges for 
accreditation. 

Fees and other charges equal as near-
ly as may be to the cost of the accredi-
tation services rendered under the reg-
ulations, including initial accredita-
tion, review of annual reports, and re-
newal of accreditation, shall be as-
sessed and collected from applicants 
for initial accreditation and accredited 
certifying agents submitting annual re-
ports or seeking renewal of accredita-
tion in accordance with the following 
provisions: 

(a) Fees-for-service. (1) Except as oth-
erwise provided in this section, fees- 
for-service shall be based on the time 
required to render the service provided 
calculated to the nearest 15-minute pe-
riod, including the review of applica-
tions and accompanying documents 
and information, evaluator travel, the 
conduct of on-site evaluations, review 
of annual reports and updated docu-
ments and information, and the time 
required to prepare reports and any 
other documents in connection with 
the performance of service. The hourly 
rate shall be the same as that charged 
by the Agricultural Marketing Service, 
through its Quality Systems Certifi-
cation Program, to certification bodies 
requesting conformity assessment to 

VerDate Aug<04>2004 11:48 Jan 18, 2005 Jkt 205014 PO 00000 Frm 00419 Fmt 8010 Sfmt 8010 Y:\SGML\205014T.XXX 205014T


