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under the NOX Budget Trading Pro-
gram. 

(iii) The Administrator will not adju-
dicate any private legal dispute con-
cerning the authorization or any rep-
resentation, action, inaction, or sub-
mission of the NOX authorized account 
representative or any alternate NOX 
authorized account representative for a 
general account, including private 
legal disputes concerning the proceeds 
of NOX allowance transfers. 

(c) Account identification. The Admin-
istrator will assign a unique identi-
fying number to each account estab-
lished under paragraph (a) or (b) of this 
section. 

§ 96.52 NOX Allowance Tracking Sys-
tem responsibilities of NOX author-
ized account representative. 

(a) Following the establishment of a 
NOX Allowance Tracking System ac-
count, all submissions to the Adminis-
trator pertaining to the account, in-
cluding, but not limited to, submis-
sions concerning the deduction or 
transfer of NOX allowances in the ac-
count, shall be made only by the NOX 
authorized account representative for 
the account. 

(b) Authorized account representative 
identification. The Administrator will 
assign a unique identifying number to 
each NOX authorized account rep-
resentative. 

§ 96.53 Recordation of NOX allowance 
allocations. 

(a) The Administrator will record the 
NOX allowances for 2003 in the NOX 
Budget units’ compliance accounts and 
the allocation set-asides, as allocated 
under subpart E of this part. The Ad-
ministrator will also record the NOX al-
lowances allocated under § 96.88(a)(1) 
for each NOX Budget opt-in source in 
its compliance account. 

(b) Each year, after the Adminis-
trator has made all deductions from a 
NOX Budget unit’s compliance account 
and the overdraft account pursuant to 
§ 96.54, the Administrator will record 
NOX allowances, as allocated to the 
unit under subpart E of this part or 
under § 96.88(a)(2), in the compliance 
account for the year after the last year 
for which allowances were previously 
allocated to the compliance account. 

Each year, the Administrator will also 
record NOX allowances, as allocated 
under subpart E of this part, in the al-
location set-aside for the year after the 
last year for which allowances were 
previously allocated to an allocation 
set-aside. 

(c) Serial numbers for allocated NOX al-
lowances. When allocating NOX allow-
ances to and recording them in an ac-
count, the Administrator will assign 
each NOX allowance a unique identi-
fication number that will include dig-
its identifying the year for which the 
NOX allowance is allocated. 

§ 96.54 Compliance. 
(a) NOX allowance transfer deadline. 

The NOX allowances are available to be 
deducted for compliance with a unit’s 
NOX Budget emissions limitation for a 
control period in a given year only if 
the NOX allowances: 

(1) Were allocated for a control pe-
riod in a prior year or the same year; 
and 

(2) Are held in the unit’s compliance 
account, or the overdraft account of 
the source where the unit is located, as 
of the NOX allowance transfer deadline 
for that control period or are trans-
ferred into the compliance account or 
overdraft account by a NOX allowance 
transfer correctly submitted for rec-
ordation under § 96.60 by the NOX allow-
ance transfer deadline for that control 
period. 

(b) Deductions for compliance. (1) Fol-
lowing the recordation, in accordance 
with § 96.61, of NOX allowance transfers 
submitted for recordation in the unit’s 
compliance account or the overdraft 
account of the source where the unit is 
located by the NOX allowance transfer 
deadline for a control period, the Ad-
ministrator will deduct NOX allowances 
available under paragraph (a) of this 
section to cover the unit’s NOX emis-
sions (as determined in accordance 
with subpart H of this part), or to ac-
count for actual utilization under 
§ 96.42(e), for the control period: 

(i) From the compliance account; and 
(ii) Only if no more NOX allowances 

available under paragraph (a) of this 
section remain in the compliance ac-
count, from the overdraft account. In 
deducting allowances for units at the 
source from the overdraft account, the 
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