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that will be specified in the manufac-
turer’s maintenance instructions. 

(f) Requests for authorization of peri-
odic maintenance of emission control 
related components not specifically au-
thorized to be maintained by this sec-
tion, and for anticipated maintenance 
(see § 86.428), must be made prior to the 
beginning of distance accumulation. 
The Administrator will approve the 
performance of such maintenance if 
the manufacturer makes a satisfactory 
showing that the maintenance will be 
performed on vehicles in use and that 
the maintenance is reasonable and nec-
essary. 

(1) The EGR system may be serviced 
a maximum of two times during the 
durability service accumulation if fail-
ure of the EGR system activates an au-
dible and/or visual signal approved by 
the Administrator which alerts the ve-
hicle operator to the need for EGR sys-
tem maintenance, or if the need for 
periodic maintenance of the EGR sys-
tem is overtly signalled to the vehicle 
operator by an appropriate means, e.g., 
an indicator light or significantly re-
duced driveability performance. 

(2) The catalytic converter may be 
serviced only once during the dura-
bility service accumulation if failure of 
the catalytic converter activates an 
audible and/or visual signal approved 
by the Administrator which alerts the 
vehicle operator to the need for cata-
lytic converter maintenance, or if the 
need for periodic maintenance of the 
catalytic converter is overtly signalled 
to the vehicle operator by an appro-
priate means, e.g., an indicator light or 
significantly reduced driveability per-
formance. 

(g) Certain engine components may 
require maintenance which, by its na-
ture, cannot be scheduled for periodic 
intervals, but which the manufacturer 
believes will be necessary. For exam-
ple, piston and cylinder replacement 
caused by piston seizure which results 
in the vehicle being inoperative; or in 
the case of two-stroke engines, 
decarbonization, the need for which is 
signalled to the vehicle operator by 
significantly reduce driveability per-
formance. Such maintenance is des-
ignated anticipated maintenance. An-
ticipated maintenance must be identi-
fied by the manufacturer and approved 

as being appropriate by the Adminis-
trator prior to the start of service ac-
cumulation. The approximate distance 
at which the need for anticipated main-
tenance may arise must be specified in 
the application for certification. 

(h) Complete emission tests (see sub-
part F) are required, unless waived by 
the Administrator, before and after 
any vehicle maintenance which may 
reasonably be expected to affect emis-
sions. 

§ 86.429–78 Maintenance, unscheduled; 
test vehicles. 

(a) Any unscheduled engine, emission 
control system, or fuel system adjust-
ment, repair, removal, disassembly, 
cleaning, or replacement on vehicles 
shall be performed only with the ad-
vance approval of the Administrator. 

(1) In the case of unscheduled mainte-
nance, such approval will be given if 
the Administrator: 

(i) Has made a preliminary deter-
mination that part failure or system 
malfunction, or the repair of such fail-
ure or malfunction, does not render the 
vehicle unrepresentative of vehicles in 
use, and does not require direct access 
to the combustion chamber, except for 
spark plug, fuel injection component, 
or removable prechamber removal or 
replacement; and 

(ii) Has made a determination that 
the need for maintenance or repairs is 
indicated by an overt indication of 
malfunction such as persistent misfire, 
vehicle stall, overheating, fluid leak-
age, loss of oil pressure, or charge indi-
cator warning. 

(2) Emission measurements may not 
be used as a means of determining the 
need for unscheduled maintenance 
under paragraph (a)(1)(i) of this sec-
tion. 

(b) Repairs to vehicle components of 
test vehicles, other than the engine, 
emission control system, or fuel sys-
tem, shall be performed only as a re-
sult of part failure, vehicle system 
malfunction, or with the advance ap-
proval of the Administrator. 

(c) The Administrator shall be given 
the opportunity to verify the extent of 
an overt indication of part failure and/ 
or vehicle malfunction (e.g., misfire, 
stall), or an activation of an audible 
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and/or visual signal, prior to the per-
formance of any maintenance to which 
such overt indication or signal is rel-
evant under the provisions of this sec-
tion. 

(d) Equipment, instruments, or tools 
may not be used to identify malfunc-
tioning, maladjusted, or defective en-
gine components unless the same or 
equivalent equipment, instruments, or 
tools will be available at dealerships 
and other service outlets and 

(1) Are used in conjunction with 
scheduled maintenance on such compo-
nents, and 

(2) Are used subsequent to the identi-
fication of a vehicle or engine malfunc-
tion, as provided in paragraph (a)(1) of 
this section for durability or emission 
data vehicles, or 

(3) Unless specifically authorized by 
the Administrator. 

(e) If the Administrator determines 
that part failure or system malfunc-
tion occurrence and/or repair rendered 
the vehicle unrepresentative of vehi-
cles in use, the vehicle shall not be 
used as a test vehicle. 

(f) Complete emission tests are re-
quired, unless waived by the Adminis-
trator, before and after any vehicle 
maintenance which may reasonably be 
expected to affect emissions. 

§ 86.430–78 Vehicle failure. 
Any test vehicle which incurs major 

mechanical failure necessitating dis-
assembly of the engine shall not be 
used as a test vehicle. This prohibition 
does not apply to failures occurring 
after the completion of all required 
tests at the total test distance. 

[49 FR 48139, Dec. 10, 1984] 

§ 86.431–78 Data submission. 
(a) Data from all tests (including 

voided tests) performed by a manufac-
turer with total projected sales in ex-
cess of 10,000 vehicles shall be included 
in the application. 

(b) The manufacturer shall furnish to 
the Administrator explanation for 
voiding any test. The Administrator 
will determine if voiding the test was 
appropriate based upon the explanation 
given by the manufacturer. If the Ad-
ministrator determines that voiding 
the test was not appropriate, the Ad-
ministrator may require that the data 

from that test be used in the calcula-
tion of the deterioration factor for 
emissions. 

(c) When unscheduled or anticipated 
maintenance is performed, a complete 
record of all pertinent maintenance, 
including the malfunction diagnosis 
made, the corrective action taken, and 
the test data obtained shall be included 
in the application. 

(d) A complete record of all mainte-
nance shall be supplied. 

[42 FR 1126, Jan. 5, 1977, as amended at 49 FR 
48139, Dec. 10, 1984] 

§ 86.432–78 Deterioration factor. 
(a) Deterioration factors shall be de-

veloped for each test vehicle from the 
emission test results. A separate factor 
shall be developed for each pollutant. 
The applicable data to be used in calcu-
lating these factors are: 

(1) The results from all valid tests 
conducted by the manufacturer or Ad-
ministrator at scheduled test intervals. 

(2) The results from tests conducted 
before and after scheduled mainte-
nance unless specifically excluded by 
the Administrator. 

(3) The results from tests conducted 
before and after unscheduled mainte-
nance, if approval of the maintenance 
by the Administrator was conditioned 
on the data being used in the deteriora-
tion factor calculation. 

(b) Emission results which are less 
than 0.10 g/km shall be considered to be 
0.10 g/km for purposes of this section. 

(c) Test results for each pollutant 
shall be plotted as a function of the 
service accumulated at the start of the 
emission test, rounded to the nearest 
kilometre. These results shall be cor-
related to a straight line, fit by the 
method of least squares. 

(d) An exhaust emission deteriora-
tion factor will be calculated by divid-
ing the predicted emissions at the use-
ful life distance by the predicted emis-
sions at the total test distance. Pre-
dicted emissions are obtained from the 
correlation developed in paragraph (c) 
of this section. 

Factor = Predicted total distance emis-
sions/Predicted total test distance 
emissions 

These interpolated and extrapolated 
values shall be carried out to four 
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