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(3) A record of the maintenance per-
formed in accordance with 
§ 61.272(c)(1)(iii) of the operating plan, 
including the following: 

(i) The duration of each time the 
closed vent system and control device 
does not meet the specifications of 
§ 61.271(c) due to maintenance, includ-
ing the following: 

(A) The first time of day and date the 
requirements of 61.271(c) were not met 
at the beginning of maintenance. 

(B) The first time of day and date the 
requirements of § 61.271(c) were met at 
the conclusion of maintenance. 

(C) A continuous record of the liquid 
level in each storage vessel that the 
closed vent system and control device 
receive vapors from during the interval 
between the times specified by 
(c)(3)(i)(A) and (c)(3)(i)(B). Pumping 
records (simultaneous input and out-
put) may be substituted for records of 
the liquid level. 

§ 61.277 Delegation of authority. 
(a) In delegating implementation and 

enforcement authority to a State 
under section 112(d) of the Act, the au-
thorities contained in paragraph (b) of 
this section shall be retained by the 
Administrator and not transferred to a 
State. 

(b) Authorities which will not be del-
egated to States: § 61.273. 

Subparts Z–AA [Reserved] 

Subpart BB—National Emission 
Standard for Benzene Emis-
sions From Benzene Transfer 
Operations 

SOURCE: 55 FR 8341, Mar. 7, 1990, unless oth-
erwise noted. 

§ 61.300 Applicability. 
(a) The affected facility to which this 

subpart applies is the total of all load-
ing racks at which benzene is loaded 
into tank trucks, railcars, or marine 
vessels at each benzene production fa-
cility and each bulk terminal. How-
ever, specifically exempted from this 
regulation are loading racks at which 
only the following are loaded: Benzene- 
laden waste (covered under subpart FF 
of this part), gasoline, crude oil, nat-

ural gas liquids, petroleum distillates 
(e.g., fuel oil, diesel, or kerosene), or 
benzene-laden liquid from coke by- 
product recovery plants. 

(b) Any affected facility under para-
graph (a) of this section which loads 
only liquid containing less than 70 
weight-percent benzene is exempt from 
the requirements of this subpart, ex-
cept for the recordkeeping and report-
ing requirements in § 61.305(i). 

(c) Comply with standards at each load-
ing rack. Any affected facility under 
paragraph (a) of this section shall com-
ply with the standards in § 61.302 or as 
specified in paragraph (f) of this sec-
tion, if applicable, at each loading rack 
that is handling a liquid containing 70 
weight-percent or more benzene. 

(d) Any affected facility under para-
graph (a) of this section whose annual 
benzene loading is less than 1.3 million 
liters of 70 weight-percent or more ben-
zene is exempt from the requirements 
of this subpart, except for the record-
keeping and reporting requirements in 
§ 61.305(i). 

(e) The owner or operator of an af-
fected facility, as defined in § 61.300(a) 
that loads a marine vessel shall be in 
compliance with the provisions of this 
subpart on and after July 23, 1991. If an 
affected facility that loads a marine 
vessel also loads a tank truck or rail-
car, the marine vessel loading racks 
shall be in compliance with the provi-
sions of this subpart on and after July 
23, 1991, while the tank truck loading 
racks and the railcar loading racks 
shall be in compliance as required by 
§ 61.12. 

(f) Alternative means of compliance. (1) 
Option to comply with part 65. Owners or 
operators may choose to comply with 
40 CFR part 65, subpart E, to satisfy 
the requirements of §§ 61.302 through 
61.306 for all tank truck or railcar load-
ing racks that are subject to this sub-
part. Loading racks are referred to as 
transfer racks in 40 CFR part 65, sub-
part E. Other provisions applying to 
owners or operators who choose to 
comply with 40 CFR part 65 are pro-
vided in 40 CFR 65.1. All marine vessel 
loading racks shall comply with the 
provisions in §§ 61.302 through 61.306. 

(2) Part 61, subpart A. Owners or oper-
ators who choose to comply with 40 
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