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(c) Projects not receiving grant assist-
ance for Step 1 facilities planning on or 
before December 29, 1981. Potential Step 
3 or Step 2+3 grant applicants should, 
in accordance with § 35.2030(c), consult 
with EPA and the State early in the fa-
cilities planning process to determine 
the appropriateness of a categorical ex-
clusion, the scope of an EID, or the ap-
propriateness of the early preparation 
of an environmental assessment or an 
EIS. The consultation would be most 
useful during the evaluation of project 
alternatives prior to the selection of a 
preferred alternative to assist in re-
solving any identified environmental 
problems. 

§ 6.505 Categorical exclusions. 

(a) General. At the request of an ex-
isting Step 1 facilities planning grant-
ee or of a potential Step 3 or Step 2+3 
grant applicant, the responsible offi-
cial, as provided for in §§ 6.107(b), 
6.400(f) and 6.504(a), shall determine 
from existing information and docu-
ment whether an action is consistent 
with the categories eligible for exclu-
sion from NEPA review identified in 
§ 6.107(d) or § 6.505(b) and not incon-
sistent with the criteria in § 6.107(e) or 
§ 6.505(c). 

(b) Specialized categories of actions eli-
gible for exclusion. For this subpart, eli-
gible actions consist of any of the cat-
egories in § 6.107(d), or: 

(1) Actions for which the facilities 
planning is consistent with the cat-
egory listed in § 6.107(d)(1) which do not 
affect the degree of treatment or ca-
pacity of the existing facility includ-
ing, but not limited to, infiltration and 
inflow corrections, grant-eligible re-
placement of existing mechanical 
equipment or structures, and the con-
struction of small structures on exist-
ing sites; 

(2) Actions in sewered communities 
of less than 10,000 persons which are for 
minor upgrading and minor expansion 
of existing treatment works. This cat-
egory does not include actions that di-
rectly or indirectly involve the exten-
sion of new collection systems funded 
with Federal or other sources of funds; 

(3) Actions in unsewered commu-
nities of less than 10,000 persons where 
on-site technologies are proposed; or 

(4) Other actions are developed in ac-
cordance with § 6.107(f). 

(c) Specialized Criteria for not granting 
a categorical exclusion. (1) The full envi-
ronmental review procedures of this 
part must be followed if undertaking 
an action consistent with the cat-
egories described in paragraph (b) of 
this section meets any of the criteria 
listed in § 6.107(e) or when: 

(i) The facilities to be provided will 
(A) create a new, or (B) relocate an ex-
isting, discharge to surface or ground 
waters; 

(ii) The facilities will result in sub-
stantial increases in the volume of dis-
charge or the loading of pollutants 
from an existing source or from new fa-
cilities to receiving waters; or 

(iii) The facilities would provide ca-
pacity to serve a population 30% great-
er than the existing population. 

(d) Proceeding with grant awards. (1) 
After a categorical exclusion on a pro-
posed treatment works has been grant-
ed, and notices published in accordance 
with § 6.400(f), grant awards may pro-
ceed without being subject to any fur-
ther environmental review require-
ments under this part, unless the re-
sponsible official later determines that 
the project, or the conditions at the 
time the categorical determination 
was made, have changed significantly 
since the independent EPA review of 
information submitted by the grantee 
in support of the exclusion. 

(2) For all categorical exclusion de-
terminations: 

(i) That are five or more years old on 
projects awaiting Step 2+3 or Step 3 
grant funding, the responsible official 
shall re-evaluate the project, environ-
mental conditions and public views 
and, prior to grant award, either: 

(A) Reaffirm—issue a public notice re-
affirming EPA’s decision to proceed 
with the project without need for any 
further environmental review; 

(B) Supplement—update the informa-
tion in the decision document on the 
categorically excluded project and pre-
pare, issue, and distribute a revised no-
tice in accordance with § 6.107(f); or 

(C) Reassess—revoke the categorical 
exclusion in accordance with § 6.107(c) 
and require a complete environmental 
review to determine the need for an 
EIS in accordance with § 6.506, followed 
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by preparation, issuance and distribu-
tion of an EA/FNSI or EIS/ROD. 

(ii) That are made on projects that 
have been awarded a Step 2+3 grant, 
the responsible official shall, at the 
time of plans and specifications review 
under § 35.2202(b) of this title, assess 
whether the environmental conditions 
or the project’s anticipated impact on 
the environment have changed and, 
prior to plans and specifications ap-
proval, advise the Regional Adminis-
trator if additional environmental re-
view is necessary. 

[50 FR 26317, June 25, 1985, as amended at 51 
FR 32611, Sept. 12, 1986] 

§ 6.506 Environmental review process. 
(a) Review of completed facilities plans. 

The responsible official shall ensure a 
review of the completed facilities plan 
with particular attention to the EID 
and its utilization in the development 
of alternatives and the selection of a 
preferred alternative. An adequate EID 
shall be an integral part of any facili-
ties plan submitted to EPA or to a 
State. The EID shall be of sufficient 
scope to enable the responsible official 
to make determinations on requests for 
partitioning the environmental review 
process in accordance with § 6.507 and 
for preparing environmental assess-
ments in accordance with § 6.506(b). 

(b) Environmental assessment. The en-
vironmental assessment process shall 
cover all potentially significant envi-
ronmental impacts. The responsible of-
ficial shall prepare a preliminary envi-
ronmental assessment on which to base 
a recommendation to finalize and issue 
the environmental assessment/FNSI. 
For those States delegated environ-
mental review responsibilities under 
§ 6.514, the State responsible official 
shall prepare the preliminary environ-
mental assessment in sufficient detail 
to serve as an adequate basis for EPA’s 
independent NEPA review and decision 
to finalize and issue an environmental 
assessment/FNSI or to prepare and 
issue a notice of intent for an EIS/ROD. 
The EPA also may require submission 
of supplementary information before 
the facilities plan is approved if needed 
for its independent review of the 
State’s preliminary assessment for 
compliance with environmental review 
requirements. Substantial requests for 

supplementary information by EPA, 
including the review of the facilities 
plan, shall be made in writing. Each of 
the following subjects outlined below, 
and requirements of subpart C of this 
part, shall be reviewed by the respon-
sible official to identify potentially 
significant environmental concerns 
and their associated potential impacts, 
and the responsible official shall fur-
thermore address these concerns and 
impacts in the environmental assess-
ment: 

(1) Description of the existing environ-
ment. For the delineated facilities plan-
ning area, the existing environmental 
conditions relevant to the analysis of 
alternatives, or to determining the en-
vironmental impacts of the proposed 
action, shall be considered. 

(2) Description of the future environ-
ment without the project. The relevant 
future environmental conditions shall 
be described. The no action alternative 
should be discussed. 

(3) Purpose and need. This should in-
clude a summary discussion and dem-
onstration of the need, or absence of 
need, for wastewater treatment in the 
facilities planning area, with par-
ticular emphasis on existing public 
health or water quality problems and 
their severity and extent. 

(4) Documentation. Citations to infor-
mation used to describe the existing 
environment and to assess future envi-
ronmental impacts should be clearly 
referenced and documented. These 
sources should include, as appropriate 
but not limited to, local, tribal, re-
gional, State, and Federal agencies as 
well as public and private organiza-
tions and institutions with responsi-
bility or interest in the types of condi-
tions listed in § 6.509 and in subpart C of 
this part. 

(5) Analysis of alternatives. This dis-
cussion shall include a comparative 
analysis of feasible alternatives, in-
cluding the no action alternative, 
throughout the study area. The alter-
natives shall be screened with respect 
to capital and operating costs; direct, 
indirect, and cumulative environ-
mental effects; physical, legal, or insti-
tutional constraints; and compliance 
with regulatory requirements. Special 
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