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§ 5.1003 Use of a universal identifier 
for organizations applying for HUD 
grants. 

(a) Every application for a new or re-
newal of a grant, cooperative agree-
ment, capital fund or operating fund 
subsidy, capital advance, or other as-
sistance, including an application or 
plan under a grant program that is 
classified by OMB as including formula 
grant programs, must include a Data 
Universal Numbering System (DUNS) 
number for the applicant. 

(b) (1) Applicants or groups of appli-
cants under a consortium arrangement 
must have a DUNS number for the or-
ganization that is submitting the ap-
plication for federal assistance as the 
lead applicant on behalf of the other 
applicants. If each organization is sub-
mitting a separate application as part 
of a group of applications, then each 
organization must include its DUNS 
number with its application submis-
sion. 

(2) If an organization is submitting 
an application as a sponsor or on behalf 
of other applicants, and the other enti-
ties will be receiving funds directly 
from HUD, then the applicant or spon-
sor must submit an application for 
funding that includes the DUNS num-
ber of each applicant that would re-
ceive funds directly from HUD. 

(3) If an organization is managing 
funds for a group of organizations, a 
DUNS number must be submitted for 
the managing organization, if it is 
drawing down funds directly from 
HUD. 

(4) If an organization is drawing down 
funds directly from HUD and subse-
quently turning the funds over to a 
management organization, then the 
management organization must obtain 
a DUNS number and submit the num-
ber to HUD. 

(c) Individuals who would personally 
receive a grant or other assistance 
from HUD, independent from any busi-
ness or nonprofit organization with 
which they may operate or participate, 
are exempt from this requirement. 

(d) In cases where individuals apply 
for funding, but the funding will be 
awarded to an institution or other en-
tity on the individual’s behalf, the in-
stitution or entity must obtain a 
DUNS number and the individual must 

submit the institution’s DUNS number 
with the application. 

(e) Unless an exemption is granted by 
OMB, HUD will not consider an appli-
cation as complete until a valid DUNS 
number is provided by the applicant. 
For classes of grants and grantees sub-
ject to this part, exceptions to this rule 
must be submitted to OMB for approval 
in accordance with procedures pre-
scribed by the Department.
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Subpart A—General Provisions
§ 6.1 Purpose. 

The purpose of this part is to imple-
ment the provisions of section 109 of 
title I of the Housing and Community 
Development Act of 1974 (Title I) (42 
U.S.C. 5309). Section 109 provides that 
no person in the United States shall, 
on the ground of race, color, national 
origin, religion, or sex, be excluded 
from participation in, be denied the 
benefits of, or be subjected to discrimi-
nation under any program or activity 
funded in whole or in part with Federal 
financial assistance. Section 109 does 
not directly prohibit discrimination on 
the bases of age or disability, and the 
regulations in this part 6 do not apply 
to age or disability discrimination in 
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