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(3) Contents of request. As the owner, 
your request must specify whether you 
are asking the PHA to obtain the sex 
offender registration information con-
cerning the household member for ap-
plicant screening, for lease enforce-
ment, or for eviction and include the 
following information: 

(i) Addresses or other information 
about where members of the household 
are known to have lived. 

(ii) If you intend to use the PHA de-
termination regarding any such sex of-
fender registration information for ap-
plicant screening, your request must 
include your standards in accordance 
with § 5.855(c) for prohibiting admission 
of persons subject to a lifetime sex of-
fender registration requirement. 

(iii) If you intend to use the PHA de-
termination regarding any such sex of-
fender registration information for 
eviction, your request must include 
your standards for evicting persons 
subject to a lifetime registration re-
quirement in accordance with § 5.858. 

(iv) If you intend to use the PHA de-
termination regarding any such sex of-
fender registration information for 
lease enforcement other than eviction, 
your request must include your stand-
ards for lease enforcement because of 
criminal activity by members of a 
household. 

(4) PHA disclosure of records. The PHA 
must not disclose to the owner any sex 
offender registration information ob-
tained by the PHA under this section. 

(5) Fees. If an owner asks a PHA to 
obtain sex offender registration infor-
mation concerning a household mem-
ber in accordance with this section, the 
PHA may charge the owner reasonable 
fees for making the request on behalf 
of the owner and for taking other ac-
tions for the owner. The PHA may re-
quire the owner to reimburse costs in-
curred by the PHA, including reim-
bursement of any fees charged to the 
PHA by a State or local agency for re-
leasing the information, the PHA’s own 
related staff and administrative costs. 
The owner may not pass along to the 
applicant or tenant the costs of a sex 
offender registration records check. 

(c) Records management. (1) The PHA 
must establish and implement a sys-
tem of records management that en-
sures that any sex offender registration 

information record received by the 
PHA from a State or local agency 
under this section is: 

(i) Maintained confidentially; 
(ii) Not misused or improperly dis-

seminated; and 
(iii) Destroyed, once the purpose for 

which the record was requested has 
been accomplished, including expira-
tion of the period for filing a challenge 
to the PHA action without institution 
of a challenge or final disposition of 
any such litigation. 

(2) The records management require-
ments do not apply to information that 
is public information, or is obtained by 
a PHA other than under this section. 

(d) Opportunity to dispute. If a PHA 
obtains sex offender registration infor-
mation from a State or local agency 
under paragraph (a) of this section 
showing that a household member is 
subject to a lifetime sex offender reg-
istration requirement, the PHA must 
notify the household of the proposed 
action to be based on the information 
and must provide the subject of the 
record, and the applicant or tenant, 
with a copy of such information, and 
an opportunity to dispute the accuracy 
and relevance of the information. This 
opportunity must be provided before a 
denial of admission, eviction or lease 
enforcement action on the basis of such 
information.
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§ 5.1001 Applicability. 

This subpart applies to all applicants 
for HUD grants, cooperative agree-
ments, capital fund or operating fund 
subsidy, capital advance, or other as-
sistance under HUD programs, includ-
ing grant programs that are classified 
by OMB as including formula grant 
programs or activities, but excluding 
FHA insurance and loan guarantees 
that are not associated with a grant 
program or grant award.
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