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The plan shall be developed with the 
assistance of interested persons, in-
cluding individuals with handicaps or 
organizations representing individuals 
with handicaps. A copy of the transi-
tion plan shall be made available for 
public inspection. The plan shall, at a 
minimum— 

(i) Identify physical obstacles in the 
recipient’s facilities that limit the ac-
cessibility of its programs or activities 
to individuals with handicaps; 

(ii) Describe in details the methods 
that will be used to make the facilities 
accessible; 

(iii) Specify the schedule for taking 
the steps necessary to achieve compli-
ance with this section and, if the time 
period of the transition plan is longer 
than one year, identify steps that will 
be taken during each year of the tran-
sition period; 

(iv) Indicate the official responsible 
for implementation of the plan; and 

(v) Identify the persons or groups 
with whose assistance the plan was 
prepared. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 2529–0034) 

[53 FR 20233, June 2, 1988; 53 FR 28115, July 
26, 1988, as amended at 54 FR 37645, Sept. 12, 
1989]

§ 8.22 New construction—housing fa-
cilities. 

(a) New multifamily housing projects 
(including public housing and Indian 
housing projects as required by § 8.25) 
shall be designed and constructed to be 
readily accessible to and usable by in-
dividuals with handicaps. 

(b) Subject to paragraph (c) of this 
section, a minimum of five percent of 
the total dwelling units or at least one 
unit in a multifamily housing project, 
whichever is greater, shall be made ac-
cessible for persons with mobility im-
pairments. A unit that is on an acces-
sible route and is adaptable and other-
wise in compliance with the standards 
set forth in § 8.32 is accessible for pur-
poses of this section. An additional two 
percent of the units (but not less than 
one unit) in such a project shall be ac-
cessible for persons with hearing or vi-
sion impairments. 

(c) HUD may prescribe a higher per-
centage or number than that pre-
scribed in paragraph (b) of this section 

for any area upon request therefor by 
any affected recipient or by any State 
or local government or agency thereof 
based upon demonstration to the rea-
sonable satisfaction of HUD of a need 
for a higher percentage or number, 
based on census data or other available 
current data (including a currently ef-
fective Housing Assistance Plan or 
Comprehensive Homeless Assistance 
Plan), or in response to evidence of a 
need for a higher percentage or number 
received in any other manner. In re-
viewing such request or otherwise as-
sessing the existence of such needs, 
HUD shall take into account the ex-
pected needs of eligible persons with 
and without handicaps. 

[53 FR 20233, June 2, 1988, as amended at 56 
FR 920, Jan. 9, 1991]

§ 8.23 Alterations of existing housing 
facilities. 

(a) Substantial alteration. If alter-
ations are undertaken to a project (in-
cluding a public housing project as re-
quired by § 8.25(a)(2)) that has 15 or 
more units and the cost of the alter-
ations is 75 percent or more of the re-
placement cost of the completed facil-
ity, then the provisions of § 8.22 shall 
apply. 

(b) Other alterations. (1) Subject to 
paragraph (b)(2) of this section, alter-
ations to dwelling units in a multi-
family housing project (including pub-
lic housing) shall, to the maximum ex-
tent feasible, be made to be readily ac-
cessible to and usable by individuals 
with handicaps. If alterations of single 
elements or spaces of a dwelling unit, 
when considered together, amount to 
an alteration of a dwelling unit, the en-
tire dwelling unit shall be made acces-
sible. Once five percent of the dwelling 
units in a project are readily accessible 
to and usable by individuals with mo-
bility impairments, then no additional 
elements of dwelling units, or entire 
dwelling units, are required to be ac-
cessible under this paragraph. Alter-
ations to common areas or parts of fa-
cilities that affect accessibility of ex-
isting housing facilities shall, to the 
maximum extent feasible, be made to 
be accessible to and usable by individ-
uals with handicaps. For purposes of 
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