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DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. EF07–3011–000] 

Southeastern Power Administration; 
Notice of Filing 

October 18, 2007. 
Take notice that on September 13, 

2007, the Deputy Secretary, U.S. 
Department of Energy, pursuant to the 
authority vested in the Deputy Secretary 
by the Department of Energy’s 
Delegation Order Nos. 00–001.00C and 
00–037.00, and by sections 302(a) and 
301(b) of the Department of Energy 
Organization Act (Pub. L. 95091), 
submitted for confirmation and 
approval on a final basis, Rate 
Schedules SOCO–1–C, SOCO–2–C, 
SOCO–3–C, SOCO–4–C, ALA–1–L, 
MISS–1–L, Duke-1–C, Duke-2–C, Duke- 
3–C, Duke-4–C, Santee-1–C, Santee-2–C, 
Santee-3–C, Santee-4–C, SCE&G–1–C, 
SCE&G–2–C, SCE&G–3–C, SCE&G–4–C, 
Pump-1–A, Pump-2, Replacement-1, 
and Regulation-1, effective October 1, 
2007 and ending September 30, 2012. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. On or before the 
comment date, it is not necessary to 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 
888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 

FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on November 19, 2007. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E7–21158 Filed 10–25–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. RC08–1–000] 

Southeastern Power Administration; 
Notice of Filing 

October 19, 2007. 
Take notice that on October 15, 2007, 

Southeastern Power Administration 
(Southeastern) filed an appeal of the 
September 25, 2007 decision of the 
North American Electric Reliability 
Corporation (NERC) to include 
Southeastern Power Administration on 
the NERC compliance registry within 
the SERC Reliability Corporation for the 
function of transmission operator and 
resource planner. Southeastern states 
that it has the responsibility to market 
the electric power generated at reservoir 
projects owned and operated by the U.S. 
Army Corps of Engineers in the 
southeast and neither owns or operates 
a generation or transmission system. 
Southeastern asks the Commission to 
reverse the NERC’s decision to register 
Southeastern as a transmission operator 
and resource planner. 

Any person desiring to intervene or to 
protest this filing must file in 
accordance with Rules 211 and 214 of 
the Commission’s Rules of Practice and 
Procedure (18 CFR 385.211, 385.214). 
Protests will be considered by the 
Commission in determining the 
appropriate action to be taken, but will 
not serve to make protestants parties to 
the proceeding. Any person wishing to 
become a party must file a notice of 
intervention or motion to intervene, as 
appropriate. Such notices, motions, or 
protests must be filed on or before the 
comment date. On or before the 
comment date, it is not necessary to 
serve motions to intervene or protests 
on persons other than the Applicant. 

The Commission encourages 
electronic submission of protests and 
interventions in lieu of paper using the 
‘‘eFiling’’ link at http://www.ferc.gov. 
Persons unable to file electronically 
should submit an original and 14 copies 
of the protest or intervention to the 
Federal Energy Regulatory Commission, 

888 First Street, NE., Washington, DC 
20426. 

This filing is accessible on-line at 
http://www.ferc.gov, using the 
‘‘eLibrary’’ link and is available for 
review in the Commission’s Public 
Reference Room in Washington, DC. 
There is an ‘‘eSubscription’’ link on the 
Web site that enables subscribers to 
receive e-mail notification when a 
document is added to a subscribed 
docket(s). For assistance with any FERC 
Online service, please e-mail 
FERCOnlineSupport@ferc.gov, or call 
(866) 208–3676 (toll free). For TTY, call 
(202) 502–8659. 

Comment Date: 5 p.m. Eastern Time 
on November 14, 2007. 

Kimberly D. Bose, 
Secretary. 
[FR Doc. E7–21159 Filed 10–25–07; 8:45 am] 
BILLING CODE 6717–01–P 

DEPARTMENT OF ENERGY 

Federal Energy Regulatory 
Commission 

[Docket No. CP08–5–000] 

Southern Natural Gas Company; 
Magnolia Enterprise Holdings, Inc.; 
Notice of Application 

October 19, 2007. 
Take notice that on October 5, 2007, 

Southern Natural Gas Company 
(Southern), P.O. Box 2563, Birmingham, 
Alabama 35202–2563, filed an 
application in Docket No. CP08–5–000 
pursuant to section 7 of the Natural Gas 
Act (NGA), for approval to abandon and 
lease certain pipeline and appurtenant 
facilities and authorization to construct, 
install and operate a new compressor 
unit on its Cypress Pipeline and related 
appurtenant facilities. Magnolia 
Enterprise Holdings, Inc. (MEHI), Ten 
Peachtree Place, Location 1466, Atlanta, 
Georgia 30309, filed a request in the 
same application pursuant to section 7 
of the NGA, for authorization to acquire 
certain pipeline, measurement and 
compression facilities and to lease those 
facilities back to Southern, all as more 
fully set forth in the application which 
is on file with the Commission and open 
to public inspection. 

It is stated that pursuant to the terms 
of a Purchase and Sale Agreement 
between Southern and AGL Resources, 
Inc., MEHI’s parent company, Southern 
requests authorization to abandon by 
sale to MEHI an undivided interest of 
the following: 

Twin 30 Pipelines extending from 
Southern’s interconnection with Elba Island 
to Port Wentworth, Georgia in Chatham 
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