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(i) Has reserved all unoccupied units 
for occupancy by at least one person 55 
years of age or older until at least 80 
percent of the units are occupied by at 
least one person who is 55 years of age 
or older; and 

(ii) Meets the requirements of 
§§ 100.304, 100.306, and 100.307. 

(f) For purposes of the transition pro-
vision described in § 100.305(e)(5), a 
housing facility or community may not 
evict, refuse to renew leases, or other-
wise penalize families with children 
who reside in the facility or commu-
nity in order to achieve occupancy of 
at least 80 percent of the occupied 
units by at least one person 55 years of 
age or older. 

(g) Where application of the 80 per-
cent rule results in a fraction of a unit, 
that unit shall be considered to be in-
cluded in the units that must be occu-
pied by at least one person 55 years of 
age or older. 

(h) Each housing facility or commu-
nity may determine the age restric-
tion, if any, for units that are not occu-
pied by at least one person 55 years of 
age or older, so long as the housing fa-
cility or community complies with the 
provisions of § 100.306. 

[64 FR 16329, Apr. 2, 1999]

§ 100.306 Intent to operate as housing 
designed for persons who are 55 
years of age or older. 

(a) In order for a housing facility or 
community to qualify as housing de-
signed for persons who are 55 years of 
age or older, it must publish and ad-
here to policies and procedures that 
demonstrate its intent to operate as 
housing for persons 55 years of age or 
older. The following factors, among 
others, are considered relevant in de-
termining whether the housing facility 
or community has complied with this 
requirement: 

(1) The manner in which the housing 
facility or community is described to 
prospective residents; 

(2) Any advertising designed to at-
tract prospective residents; 

(3) Lease provisions; 
(4) Written rules, regulations, cov-

enants, deed or other restrictions; 
(5) The maintenance and consistent 

application of relevant procedures; 

(6) Actual practices of the housing fa-
cility or community; and 

(7) Public posting in common areas of 
statements describing the facility or 
community as housing for persons 55 
years of age or older. 

(b) Phrases such as ‘‘adult living’’, 
‘‘adult community’’, or similar state-
ments in any written advertisement or 
prospectus are not consistent with the 
intent that the housing facility or 
community intends to operate as hous-
ing for persons 55 years of age or older. 

(c) If there is language in deed or 
other community or facility docu-
ments which is inconsistent with the 
intent to provide housing for persons 
who are 55 years of age or older hous-
ing, HUD shall consider documented 
evidence of a good faith attempt to re-
move such language in determining 
whether the housing facility or com-
munity complies with the require-
ments of this section in conjunction 
with other evidence of intent. 

(d) A housing facility or community 
may allow occupancy by families with 
children as long as it meets the re-
quirements of §§ 100.305 and 100.306(a). 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 2529–0046) 

[64 FR 16330, Apr. 2, 1999]

§ 100.307 Verification of occupancy. 
(a) In order for a housing facility or 

community to qualify as housing for 
persons 55 years of age or older, it must 
be able to produce, in response to a 
complaint filed under this title, 
verification of compliance with § 100.305 
through reliable surveys and affidavits. 

(b) A facility or community shall, 
within 180 days of the effective date of 
this rule, develop procedures for rou-
tinely determining the occupancy of 
each unit, including the identification 
of whether at least one occupant of 
each unit is 55 years of age or older. 
Such procedures may be part of a nor-
mal leasing or purchasing arrange-
ment. 

(c) The procedures described in para-
graph (b) of this section must provide 
for regular updates, through surveys or 
other means, of the initial information 
supplied by the occupants of the hous-
ing facility or community. Such up-
dates must take place at least once 
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every two years. A survey may include 
information regarding whether any 
units are occupied by persons described 
in paragraphs (e)(1), (e)(3), and (e)(4) of 
§ 100.305. 

(d) Any of the following documents 
are considered reliable documentation 
of the age of the occupants of the hous-
ing facility or community: 

(1) Driver’s license; 
(2) Birth certificate; 
(3) Passport; 
(4) Immigration card; 
(5) Military identification; 
(6) Any other state, local, national, 

or international official documents 
containing a birth date of comparable 
reliability; or 

(7) A certification in a lease, applica-
tion, affidavit, or other document 
signed by any member of the household 
age 18 or older asserting that at least 
one person in the unit is 55 years of age 
or older. 

(e) A facility or community shall 
consider any one of the forms of 
verification identified above as ade-
quate for verification of age, provided 
that it contains specific information 
about current age or date of birth. 

(f) The housing facility or commu-
nity must establish and maintain ap-
propriate policies to require that occu-
pants comply with the age verification 
procedures required by this section. 

(g) If the occupants of a particular 
dwelling unit refuse to comply with the 
age verification procedures, the hous-
ing facility or community may, if it 
has sufficient evidence, consider the 
unit to be occupied by at least one per-
son 55 years of age or older. Such evi-
dence may include: 

(1) Government records or docu-
ments, such as a local household cen-
sus; 

(2) Prior forms or applications; or 
(3) A statement from an individual 

who has personal knowledge of the age 
of the occupants. The individual’s 
statement must set forth the basis for 
such knowledge and be signed under 
the penalty of perjury. 

(h) Surveys and verification proce-
dures which comply with the require-
ments of this section shall be admis-
sible in administrative and judicial 
proceedings for the purpose of verifying 
occupancy. 

(i) A summary of occupancy surveys 
shall be available for inspection upon 
reasonable notice and request by any 
person. 

(Approved by the Office of Management and 
Budget under control number 2529–0046) 

[64 FR 16330, Apr. 2, 1999]

§ 100.308 Good faith defense against 
civil money damages. 

(a) A person shall not be held person-
ally liable for monetary damages for 
discriminating on the basis of familial 
status, if the person acted with the 
good faith belief that the housing facil-
ity or community qualified for a hous-
ing for older persons exemption under 
this subpart. 

(b)(1) A person claiming the good 
faith belief defense must have actual 
knowledge that the housing facility or 
community has, through an authorized 
representative, asserted in writing that 
it qualifies for a housing for older per-
sons exemption. 

(2) Before the date on which the dis-
crimination is claimed to have oc-
curred, a community or facility, 
through its authorized representatives, 
must certify, in writing and under oath 
or affirmation, to the person subse-
quently claiming the defense that it 
complies with the requirements for 
such an exemption as housing for per-
sons 55 years of age or older in order 
for such person to claim the defense. 

(3) For purposes of this section, an 
authorized representative of a housing 
facility or community means the indi-
vidual, committee, management com-
pany, owner, or other entity having the 
responsibility for adherence to the re-
quirements established by this subpart. 

(4) For purposes of this section, a per-
son means a natural person. 

(5) A person shall not be entitled to 
the good faith defense if the person has 
actual knowledge that the housing fa-
cility or community does not, or will 
not, qualify as housing for persons 55 
years of age or older. Such a person 
will be ineligible for the good faith de-
fense regardless of whether the person 
received the written assurance de-
scribed in paragraph (b) of this section. 

[64 FR 16330, Apr. 2, 1999]
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