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(b) A lender must take action reason-
ably likely to remedy the cause and ef-
fect of the likely violation and must: 

(1) Identify the policies or practices 
that are the likely cause of the viola-
tion, such as inadequate or improper 
lending policies, failure to implement 
established policies, employee conduct, 
or other causes; and 

(2) Assess the extent and scope of any 
likely violation, by determining which 
areas of operation are likely to be af-
fected by those policies and practices, 
such as stages of the loan application 
process, types of loans, or the par-
ticular branch where the likely viola-
tion has occurred. Generally, the scope 
of the self-test governs the scope of the 
appropriate corrective action. 

(c) Appropriate corrective action 
may include both prospective and re-
medial relief, except that to establish a 
privilege under this subpart: 

(1) A lender is not required to provide 
remedial relief to a tester in a self-test; 

(2) A lender is only required to pro-
vide remedial relief to an applicant 
identified by the self-test as one whose 
rights were more likely than not vio-
lated; 

(3) A lender is not required to provide 
remedial relief to a particular appli-
cant if the statute of limitations appli-
cable to the violation expired before 
the lender obtained the results of the 
self-test or the applicant is otherwise 
ineligible for such relief. 

(d) Depending on the facts involved, 
appropriate corrective action may in-
clude, but is not limited to, one or 
more of the following: 

(1) If the self-test identifies individ-
uals whose applications were inappro-
priately processed, offering to extend 
credit if the applications were improp-
erly denied; compensating such persons 
for any damages, both out-of-pocket 
and compensatory; 

(2) Correcting any institutional poli-
cies or procedures that may have con-
tributed to the likely violation, and 
adopting new policies as appropriate; 

(3) Identifying, and then training 
and/or disciplining the employees in-
volved; 

(4) Developing outreach programs, 
marketing strategies, or loan products 
to serve more effectively the segments 
of the lender’s market that may have 

been affected by the likely violation; 
and 

(5) Improving audit and oversight 
systems to avoid a recurrence of the 
likely violations. 

(e) Determination of appropriate cor-
rective action is fact-based. Not every 
corrective measure listed in paragraph 
(d) of this section need be taken for 
each likely violation. 

(f) Taking appropriate corrective ac-
tion is not an admission by a lender 
that a violation occurred. 

[62 FR 66432, Dec. 18, 1997]

§ 100.144 Scope of privilege. 
The report or results of a self-test 

may not be obtained or used by an ag-
grieved person, complainant, depart-
ment or agency in any: 

(a) Proceeding or civil action in 
which a violation of the Fair Housing 
Act is alleged; or 

(b) Examination or investigation re-
lating to compliance with the Fair 
Housing Act. 

[62 FR 66432, Dec. 18, 1997]

§ 100.145 Loss of privilege. 
(a) The self-test report or results are 

not privileged under this subpart if the 
lender or person with lawful access to 
the report or results: 

(1) Voluntarily discloses any part of 
the report or results or any other infor-
mation privileged under this subpart to 
any aggrieved person, complainant, de-
partment, agency, or to the public; or 

(2) Discloses the report or results or 
any other information privileged under 
this subpart as a defense to charges a 
lender violated the Fair Housing Act; 
or 

(3) Fails or is unable to produce self-
test records or information needed to 
determine whether the privilege ap-
plies. 

(b) Disclosures or other actions un-
dertaken to carry out appropriate cor-
rective action do not cause the lender 
to lose the privilege. 

[62 FR 66432, Dec. 18, 1997]

§ 100.146 Limited use of privileged in-
formation. 

Notwithstanding § 100.145, the self-
test report or results may be obtained 
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