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Consumer Product Safety Commission § 1401.2 

(e) Alternatives. (1) The Commission 
considered various labeling require-
ments and limitations on the mar-
keting of lawn darts that would be in-
tended to discourage the marketing of 
the product to children and the use of 
the product by children. The Commis-
sion concluded, however, that these 
types of requirements would not pre-
clude substantial use of the product by 
children and would not reduce ade-
quately the risk of injury addressed by 
this rule. 

(2) The Commission also considered 
the possibility of performance require-
ments for lawn darts to determine 
which lawn darts present an unreason-
able risk of injury of skull penetration 
to children, but such requirements 
were determined not to be feasible. 

(f) Conclusion. The Commission finds: 
(1) That this rule, including its effec-

tive date, is reasonably necessary to 
eliminate or adequately reduce the un-
reasonable risk of skull puncture 
wounds to children associated with 
lawn darts and will also eliminate or 
reduce the other injuries, including 
puncture wounds, that have been asso-
ciated with this product. 

(2) That issuance of the rule is in the 
public interest. 

(3) That no feasible consumer product 
safety standard would adequately pro-
tect the public from the unreasonable 
risk associated with lawn darts. 

(4) That the benefits expected from 
this rule bear a reasonable relationship 
to its costs. 

(5) That the rule imposes the least 
burdensome requirement which pre-
vents or adequately reduces the risk of 
injury for which the rule is being pro-
mulgated. 

§ 1306.5 Effective date. 

This rule is effective December 19, 
1988 and applies to all lawn darts in the 
chain of distribution on or after that 
date. 
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§ 1401.1 Scope. 
This part 1401 establishes require-

ments under section 27(e) of the Con-
sumer Product Safety Act (15 U.S.C. 
2076(e)) for marketers and importers of 
self-pressurized consumer products 
that contain chlorofluorocarbons as 
propellants to provide notification of 
certain performance and technical data 
to prospective purchasers of such prod-
ucts at the time of original purchase 
and to the first purchaser of such prod-
ucts for purposes other than resale. 
The notification shall consist of a label 
on the product stating that it contains 
a chlorofluorocarbon that may harm 
the public health and environment by 
reducing the ozone in the upper atmos-
phere. Also, manufacturers and import-
ers must provide the commission with 
reports identifying which of the self- 
pressurized consumer products sold by 
them contain chlorofluorocarbon pro-
pellants. 

§ 1401.2 Purpose. 
Chlorofluorocarbons are used as pro-

pellants in self-pressurized containers 
of a variety of products subject to the 
Commission’s jurisdiction. Scientific 
research has indicated that chloro-
fluorocarbons may pose a risk of deple-
tion of ozone in the stratosphere. The 
stratospheric ozone shield is of great 
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