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the existence of encumbrances to the 
land. 

(n) Title examination means an exam-
ination and evaluation by a qualified 
title examiner of the completeness and 
accuracy of title documents affecting a 
particular tract of Indian land with 
certification of the findings by the 
Manager of the Land Titles and 
Records Office. 

(o) Title status report means a report 
issued after a title examination which 
shows the proper legal description of a 
tract of Indian land; current owner-
ship, including any applicable condi-
tions, exceptions, restrictions or en-
cumbrances on record; and whether the 
land is in unrestricted, restricted, 
trust, or other status as indicated by 
the records in a Land Titles and 
Records Office. 

§ 150.3 Maintenance of land records 
and title documents. 

The Land Titles and Records Offices 
within the Bureau are hereby des-
ignated as the offices of record for land 
records and title documents and are 
hereby charged with the Federal re-
sponsibility to record, provide custody, 
and maintain records that affect titles 
to Indian land, to examine titles, and 
to provide title status reports. 

§ 150.4 Locations and service areas for 
land titles and records offices. 

Shown below are present Land Titles 
and Records Offices and the jurisdic-
tional area served by each office. 

(a) Aberdeen, S. Dakota Office pro-
vides title service for Indian land lo-
cated under the jurisdiction of the Ab-
erdeen and Minneapolis Area Offices, 
except for Indian land on the White 
Earth, Isabella, and Oneida Indian Res-
ervations. 

(b) Albuquerque, New Mexico Office 
provides title services for Indian land 
located under the jurisdiction of the 
Albuquerque, Navajo, and Phoenix 
Area Offices. 

(c) Anadarko, Oklahoma Office pro-
vides title services for Indian land lo-
cated under the jurisdiction of the 
Anadarko Area Office and under the 
Miami Agency of the Muskogee Area 
Office. 

(d) Billings, Montana Office provides 
title services for Indian land located 

under the jurisdiction of the Billings 
Area Office. 

(e) Portland, Oregon Office provides 
title services for Indian land located 
under the jurisdiction of the Portland 
and Sacramento Area Offices. 

§ 150.5 Other Bureau offices with title 
service responsibility. 

(a) Muskogee Area Office is the office 
of record and performs limited title 
functions for all Indian land of the Five 
Civilized Tribes. The regulations in 
this part apply to the Muskogee Area 
Office to the extent that they relate to 
the title services performed by that of-
fice. 

(b) The Juneau Area Office has title 
service responsibility for the Juneau 
Area. This authority has been largely 
delegated to the agencies. The regula-
tions in this part apply to the Juneau 
Area Office to the extent practicable. 

(c) The Cherokee Agency has title 
service responsibility for the Eastern 
Cherokee Reservation. The regulations 
in this part apply to the Cherokee 
Agency to the extent practicable. 

(d) The Bureau Central Office, Wash-
ington, DC, provides title services for 
all other Indian land not shown above 
in § 150.4 or in this section, including 
the land of the Absentee Wyandottes. 
The regulations in this part apply to 
the Central Office. 

§ 150.6 Recordation of title documents. 

All title documents shall be sub-
mitted to the appropriate Land Titles 
and Records Office for recording imme-
diately after final approval, issuance, 
or acceptance. Bureau officials dele-
gated authority by the Secretary to ap-
prove title documents or accept title 
are responsible for prompt compliance 
with the recording requirement. Docu-
ments submitted for recording shall be 
completed in accordance with pre-
scribed Bureau regulations or instruc-
tions. 

(a) Title documents other than probate 
records. The original, a signed dupli-
cate, or a certified copy of such docu-
ments shall be submitted for recording. 
Following the recording process, the 
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Land Titles and Records Office will re-
turn those title documents that are re-
quired to be returned to the origi-
nating office with appropriate record-
ing information. 

(b) Probate records. In accordance 
with 43 CFR part 4, subpart D, Admin-
istrative Law Judges shall forward the 
original record of Indian probate deci-
sions and copies of petitions for rehear-
ing, reopening, and other appeals to 
the Land Titles and Records Office 
which provides service to the origi-
nating Agency. If trust land or Indian 
heirs involved in the probate are lo-
cated within the jurisdictional area of 
another Land Titles and Records Of-
fice, the Administrative Law Judge 
shall also send a duplicate copy to that 
office. Probate records submitted by an 
Administrative Law Judge for record-
ing will be retained by the Land Titles 
and Records Office. 

§ 150.7 Curative action to correct title 
defects. 

Land Titles and Records Office shall 
initiate such action as described below 
to cure defects in the record discovered 
during the recording of title documents 
or examination of titles. 

(a) If an error is traced to a defective 
title document other than probate 
records, the Land Titles and Records 
Office shall notify the originating of-
fice of the defect. 

(b) If errors are discovered in probate 
records, the Land Titles and Records 
Office may initiate corrective action as 
follows: 

(1) An administrative modification 
shall be issued to modify probate 
records to include any Indian land 
omitted from the inventory if such 
property is located in the same state 
and takes the same line of descent as 
that shown in the original probate de-
cision. Authority is delegated to the 
Commissioner by 43 CFR 4.272 to make 
such modifications except on those In-
dian reservations covered by special In-
heritance Acts (43 CFR 4.300). Copies of 
administrative modifications shall be 
distributed to the appropriate Adminis-
trative Law Judge, Agencies with juris-
diction over the Indian land, and to all 
persons who share in the estate. 

(2) Land Titles and Records Offices 
shall notify the Superintendent when 

modifications are required by Adminis-
trative Law Judges for other types of 
probate errors. Corrective action is 
then initiated in accordance with 43 
CFR part 4, subpart D. 

(3) Land Titles and Records Offices 
shall issue administrative corrections 
to correct probate errors which are 
clerical in nature and which do not af-
fect vested property rights or involve 
questions of due process. Copies of ad-
ministrative corrections are distrib-
uted to the appropriate Administrative 
Law Judge and Agency. 

§ 150.8 Title status reports. 
Land Titles and Records Offices may 

conduct a title examination of a tract 
of Indian land provide a title status re-
port upon request to those persons au-
thorized by law to receive such infor-
mation. Requests for title status re-
ports shall be submitted by or through 
the Bureau office that has administra-
tive jurisdiction over the Indian land. 
All requests must clearly identify the 
tract of Indian land. 

§ 150.9 Land status maps. 
The Land Titles and Records Offices 

shall prepare and maintain maps of all 
reservations and similar entities with-
in their jurisdictions to assist Bureau 
personnel in the execution of their title 
service responsibilities. Base maps 
shall be prepared from plats of official 
survey made by the General Land Of-
fice and the Bureau of Land Manage-
ment. These base maps, showing promi-
nent physical features and section, 
township and range lines, shall be used 
to prepare land status maps. The land 
status maps shall reflect the individual 
tracts, tract numbers, and current sta-
tus of the tract. Other special maps, 
such as plats and townsite maps, may 
also be prepared and maintained to 
meet the needs of individual Land Ti-
tles and Records Offices, Agencies, and 
Indian tribes. 

§ 150.10 Certification of land records 
and title documents. 

Under the provisions of the Act of 
July 26, 1892 (27 Stat. 273; 25 U.S.C. 6), 
an official seal was created for the use 
of the Commissioner of Indian Affairs 
in authenticating and certifying copies 
of Bureau records. Managers of Land 
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