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you may no longer be eligible for tribal 
shares allocated from the law enforce-
ment budget. 

§ 12.14 Where can I find specific poli-
cies and standards for law enforce-
ment functions in Indian country? 

BIA will ensure that all Indian coun-
try law enforcement programs are pro-
vided a copy of the most current policy 
manuals and handbooks. Every Indian 
country law enforcement program cov-
ered by the regulations in this part 
must maintain an effective and effi-
cient law enforcement program meet-
ing minimal qualitative standards and 
procedures specified in chapter 68 Bu-
reau of Indian Affairs Manual (BIAM) 
and the Law Enforcement Handbook. 

Subpart C—Authority and 
Jurisdiction 

§ 12.21 What authority is given to In-
dian country law enforcement offi-
cers to perform their duties? 

BIA law enforcement officers are 
commissioned under the authority es-
tablished in 25 U.S.C. 2803. BIA may 
issue law enforcement commissions to 
other Federal, State, local and tribal 
full-time certified law enforcement of-
ficers to obtain active assistance in en-
forcing applicable Federal criminal 
statutes, including Federal hunting 
and fishing regulations, in Indian coun-
try. 

(a) BIA will issue commissions to 
other Federal, State, local and tribal 
full-time certified law enforcement of-
ficers only after the head of the local 
government or Federal agency com-
pletes an agreement with the Commis-
sioner of Indian Affairs asking that 
BIA issue delegated commissions. The 
agreement must include language that 
allows the BIA to evaluate the effec-
tiveness of these special law enforce-
ment commissions and to investigate 
any allegations of misuse of authority. 

(b) Tribal law enforcement officers 
operating under a BIA contract or com-
pact are not automatically commis-
sioned as Federal officers; however, 
they may be commissioned on a case- 
by-case basis. 

§ 12.22 Can Bureau of Indian Affairs 
law enforcement officers enforce 
tribal laws? 

BIA officers will enforce tribal laws 
only with the permission of the tribe. 
Local programs are encouraged to 
make arrangements and agreements 
with local jurisdictions to facilitate 
law enforcement objectives. 

§ 12.23 What are the jurisdictional lim-
its in Indian country? 

The Department of the Interior and 
the Department of Justice must main-
tain and periodically review and update 
a memorandum of understanding de-
scribing the relationship between the 
Federal Bureau of Investigation and 
the Bureau of Indian Affairs in the in-
vestigation and prosecution of major 
crimes in Indian country. Any law en-
forcement programs performing duties 
under the authority of 25 U.S.C. 2803 
must follow the guidelines in the 
memorandum of understanding and 
any local United States Attorney’s 
guidelines for the investigation and 
prosecution of Federal crimes. 

Subpart D—Qualifications and 
Training Requirements 

§ 12.31 Are there any minimum em-
ployment standards for Indian 
country law enforcement per-
sonnel? 

The Director must develop, maintain, 
and periodically review the qualifica-
tion standards, including medical qual-
ification standards, for all BIA law en-
forcement, detention, and conservation 
enforcement occupational series. The 
standards will be no less stringent than 
the minimum standards established by 
the U.S. Office of Personnel Manage-
ment (OPM) for these occupational se-
ries, and may exceed the OPM stand-
ards. BIA standards are available for 
review at any BIA personnel office. All 
tribal programs are encouraged to de-
velop standards at least as stringent as 
those established for BIA officers. 

§ 12.32 Do minimum employment 
standards include a background in-
vestigation? 

Law enforcement authority is only 
entrusted to personnel possessing ade-
quate education and/or experience, 
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